DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA REGISTER VOL. 55 - NO. 45 NOVEMBER 7 2008

ENROLLED ORIGINAL

AN ACT Codification

District of
Columbia

D.C. ACT 17-536 Official Code
2001 Edition

IN THE COUNCIL OF THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA .
2009 Winter

OCTOBER 20, 2008 Supp.

West Group
Publisher

To amend, on a temporary basis, the Firearms Control Regulations Act of 1975 to revise the
definition of machine gun, to provide for the registration of pistols for use in self-
defense within the home, to provide that a person holding a valid registration for a
firearm shall not be required to obtain a license to carry the firearm within the
registrant’s home or place of business, while being used for lawful recreational purposes,
or while being transported for a lawful purpose in accordance with a District or federal
statute, to authorize the Chief of the Metropolitan Police Department to require a
ballistics identification procedure for registered pistols, to establish a registration limit of
one pistol per registrant per 30 days, to prohibit large capacity ammunition feeding
devices, to clarify the firearms storage policy, and to establish penalties for the reckless
storage of a firearm accessible by a minor; to amend An Act To control the possession,
sale, transfer and use of pistols and other dangerous weapons in the District of
Columbia, to provide penalties, to prescribe rules of evidence, and for other purposes to
revise the definition of machine gun and to clarify that rifles and shotguns may
not be carried within the District unless otherwise provided by law; and to provide a
savings clause with regard to the revised definition of machine gun.

BE IT ENACTED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA, That this
act may be cited as the “Firearms Control Temporary Amendment Act of 2008".

Sec. 2. The Firearms Control Regulations Act of 1975, effective September 24, 1976
(D.C. Law 1-85; D.C. Official Code § 7-2501.01 et seq.), is amended as follows:
(a) Section 101(10) (D.C. Official Code § 7-2501.01(10)) is amended to read as ?‘_’,‘;5 01.01

follows:
“(10) “Machine gun” means any firearm which shoots, is designed to shoot, or

can be readily restored to shoot, automatically more than one shot, without manual reloading, by
a single function of the trigger. The term “machine gun” shall also include the frame or receiver
of any such firearm, any part designed and intended solely and exclusively, or combination of
parts designed and intended, for use in converting a firearm into a machine gun, and any

Codification District of Columbia Official Code, 2001 Edition 1 West Group Publisher, 1-800-328-9378.

011410



DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA REGISTER VOL. 55 - NO. 45 NOVEMBER 7 2008

ENROLLED ORIGINAL

combination of parts from which a machine gun can be assembled if such parts are in the
possession or under the control of a person.”.
(b) Section 202 (D.C. Official Code § 7-2502.02) is amended as follows: ];';E;’soz.oz
(1) Subsection (a)(4) is amended to read as follows:
“(4) Pistol not validly registered to the current registrant in the District prior to
September 24, 1976, except that the prohibition on registering a pistol shall not apply to:
“(A) Any organization that employs at least one commissioned special
police officer or other employee licensed to carry a firearm and that arms the employee with a
firearm during the employee’s duty hours;
“(B) A police officer who has retired from the Metropolitan Police
Department; or
“(C) Any person who seeks to register a pistol for use in self-defense
within that person’s home.”.
(2) Subsection (b) is repealed.
(3) A new subsection (c) is added to read as follows:
“(c) Notwithstanding any other law, a person holding a valid registration for a firearm
shall not be required to obtain a license to carry the firearm:
“(1) Within the registrant’s home;
“(2) While it is being used for lawful recreational purposes;
“(3) While it is kept at the registrant’s place of business; or
“(4) While it is being transported for a lawful purpose as expressly authorized by
District or federal statute and in accordance with the requirements of that statute.”.
(¢) Section 203 (D.C. Official Code § 7-2502.03) is amended by adding new Note,
subsections (d) and (e) to read as follows: §7-250%08
“(d) The Chief shall require any registered pistol to be submitted for a ballistics
identification procedure and shall establish a fee for such procedure.
“(e) The Chief shall register no more than one pistol per registrant during any 30-day
period.”.
(d) Section 601 (D.C. Official Code § 7-2506.01) is amended as follows: Note
(1) Designate the existing text as subsection (a). § 7-2506.01
(2) A new subsection (b) is added to read as follows:
“(b) No person in the District shall possess, sell, or transfer any large capacity
ammunition feeding device. For the purposes of this subsection, the term “large capacity
ammunition feeding device” means a magazine, belt, drum, feed strip, or similar device that has
a capacity of, or that can be readily restored or converted to accept, more than 10 rounds of
ammunition. The term “large capacity ammunition feeding device” shall not include an
attached tubular device designed to accept, and capable of operating only with, .22 caliber
rimfire ammunition.”.

Codification District of Columbia Official Code, 2001 Edition 2 West Group Publisher, 1-800-328-9378.

011411



DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA REGISTER VOL. 55 - NO. 45 NOVEMBER 7 2008

ENROLLED ORIGINAL

(e) Section 702 (D.C. Official Code § 7-2507.02) is amended to read as follows: ?‘;3’507.02
“Sec. 702. Responsibilities regarding storage of firearms.
“(a) It shall be the policy of the District of Columbia that each registrant should keep
any firearm in his or her possession unloaded and either disassembled or secured by a trigger
lock, gun safe, locked box, or other secure device.
“(b) No person shall store or keep any loaded firearm on any premises under his control
if he knows or reasonably should know that a minor is likely to gain access to the firearm
without the permission of the parent or guardian of the minor unless such person:
“(1) Keeps the firearm in a securely locked box, secured container, or in a

location which a reasonable person would believe to be secure; or

“(2) Carries the firearm on his person or within such close proximity that he can
readily retrieve and use it as if he carried it on his person.

“(c)(1) A person who violates subsection (b) of this section is guilty of criminally
negligent storage of a firearm and, except as provided in paragraph (2) of this subsection, shall
be fined not more than $1,000, imprisoned not more than 180 days, or both.

“(2) A person who violates subsection (b) of this section and the minor causes
injury or death to himself or another shall be fined not more than $5,000, imprisoned not more
than 5 years, or both.

“(3) The provisions of paragraphs (1) and (2) of this subsection shall not apply if
the minor obtains the firearm as a result of an unlawful entry to any premises by any person.

“(d) For the purposes of this section, the term “minor” shall mean a person under the
age of 16 years old.”.

Sec. 3. An Act To control the possession, sale, transfer and use of pistols and other
dangerous weapons in the District of Columbia, to provide penalties, to prescribe rule of
evidence, and for other purposes, approved July 8, 1932 (47 Stat. 650; D.C. Official Code § 22-
4501 et seq.), is amended as follows:
(a) The definition of “Machine gun” in section 1 (D.C. Official Code § 22-4501(c))is  Note,
amended to read as follows: § 224501
“ “Machine gun,” as used in this Act, shall have the same meaning as provided in
section 101(10) of the Firearms Control Regulations Act of 1975, effective September 24, 1976
(D.C. Law 1-85; D.C. Official Code § 7-2501.01(10)).”.
(b) Section 4 (D.C. Official Code § 22-4504) is amended by adding a new subsection Note
(a-1) to read as follows: § 224504
“(a-1) Except as otherwise permitted by law, no person shall carry within the District of
Columbia a rifle or shotgun.”.

Codification District of Columbia Official Code, 2001 Edition 3 West Group Publisher, 1-800-328-9378.

011412



DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA REGISTER VOL. 55 - NO. 45 NOVEMBER 7 2008

ENROLLED ORIGINAL

Sec. 4. Savings clause.

Nothing in sections 2(a) and 3(a) shall affect any action, proceeding, or prosecution
commenced before September 16, 2008. Any such action, proceeding, or prosecution shall
continue, or may be enforced, in the same manner and to the same extent as if the amendments
made to those sections had not been made.

Sec. 5. Fiscal impact statement.

The Council adopts the fiscal impact statement of the Chief Financial Officer as the
fiscal impact statement required by section 602(c)(3) of the District of Columbia Home Rule
Act, approved December 24, 1974 (87 Stat. 813; D.C. Official Code § 1-206.02(c)(3)).

Sec. 6. Effective date.

(a) This act shall take effect following approval by the Mayor (or in the event of veto by
the Mayor, action by the Council to override the veto), a 60-day period of Congressional review
as provided in section 602(c)(2) of the District of Columbia Home Rule Act, approved
December 24, 1973 (87 Stat. 813; D.C. Official Code § 1-206.02(c)(2)), and publication in the
District of Columbia Register.

(b) This act shall expire after 225 days of its having taken effect.

a0

Chairman u
Council of the District of Celumbia

oLzt

District of Columbia
APPROVED
October 20, 2008

Codification District of Columbia Official Code, 2001 Edition 4 West Group Publisher, 1-800-328-9378.

011413



DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA REGISTER VOL. 55 - NO. 45 NOVEMBER 7 2008

ENROLLED ORIGINAL
AN ACT g‘i’s':'rf_;“;:’"
Columbia
D.C. ACT 17-537 Official Code
2001 Edition
2009 Winter
IN THE COUNCIL OF THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA Supp.
OCTOBER 20; 2008 :‘l’le;ltig::up
To amend, on a temporary basis, the District of Columbia Procurement Practices Act of 1985 to
clarify that the Chief Financial Officer shall not approve payment of goods, services,
and leases until the Council has affirmatively approved the contract or allowed the
contract to be deemed approved without Council affirmative approval.
BE IT ENACTED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA, That this
act may be cited as the “Chief Financial Officer Approval of Payment of Goods and Services
Temporary Amendment Act of 2008”.
Sec. 2. Section 105A of the District of Columbia Procurement Practices Act of 1985, §N§f§’0 105

effective March 8, 1991 (D.C. Law 8-257; D.C. Official Code § 2-301.05a), is amended by
adding a new subsection (e-1) to read as follows:

“(e-1) The Chief Financial Officer shall not approve payment for goods, services, or
leases required to be reviewed by the Council pursuant to this section until the Council has
affirmatively approved the contract or allowed the contract to be deemed approved without
Council affirmative approval.”.

Sec. 3. Fiscal impact statement.
The Council adopts the fiscal impact statement of the Budget Director as the fiscal

impact statement required by section 602(c)(3) of the District of Columbia Home Rule Act,
approved December 24, 1973 (87 Stat. 813; D.C. Official Code § 1-206.02(c)(3)).

Sec. 4. Effective date.

(a) This act shall take effect following approval by the Mayor (or in the event of veto by
the Mayor, action by the Council to override the veto), a 30-day period of Congressional review
as provided in section 602(c)(1) of the District of Columbia Home Rule Act, approved

Codification District of Columbia Official Code, 2001 Edition 1 West Group Publisher, 1-800-328-9378.

011414



DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA REGISTER VOL. 55 - NO. 45 NOVEMBER 7 2008

ENROLLED ORIGINAL

December 24, 1973 (87 Stat. 813; D.C. Official Code § 1-206.02(c)(1)), and publication in the
District of Columbia Register. .
(b) This act shall expire after 225 days of its having taken effect.

\[MC.M

Chairman
Council of the District of Chlimbia

Mayor

District of Columbia
APPROVED

October 20, 2008

U/Z;@a@%f%h)

Codification District of Columbia Official Code, 2001 Edition 2 West Group Publisher, 1-800-328-9378.

011415



DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA REGISTER VOL. 55 - NO. 45

D.C. ACT 17-538

AN ACT

NOVEMBER 7 2008

ENROLLED ORIGINAL

IN THE COUNCIL OF THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA

OCTOBER 20, 2008

To require, on a temporary basis, the Mayor, prior to closing of Franklin Shelter, to certify to
the Council that no fewer than 300 men have been placed in supportive-housing units,

and to require the Mayor to submit the certification to the Council along with a report on

any proposed closing of the Franklin Shelter that includes a description of the current
capacity, current availability, and location of replacement shelter space, and the ability
to seasonally increase capacity to reduce incidences of hypothermia among the

homeless population prior to closing the Franklin Shelter.

BE IT ENACTED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA, That this

act may be cited as the “Franklin Shelter Closing Requirements Temporary Act of 2008”.

Sec. 2. Definitions.

For the purposes of this act, the term:
(1) "Low barrier shelter" means an overnight housing accommodation for

individuals who are homeless, provided directly by, or through contract with or grant from, the

District, for the purpose of providing shelter to individuals without imposition of identification,

time limits, or other program requirements.

(2) "Supportive-housing unit" means housing provided in connection with
voluntary services designed primarily to help tenants maintain housing, including coordination
or case management, physical and mental health, substance use management and recovery
support, job training, literacy and education, youth and children's programs, and money

management.

Sec. 3. (a) Ptior to the closing of the Franklin Shelter, located at 925 13 Street, N.W.,

the Mayor shall certify to the Council that no fewer than 300 men have been placed in
supportive-housing units and submit the certification to the Council along with a report on the
proposed Franklin Shelter closing that includes:
(1) A description of the supportive-housing placements, including:
(A) For each client who has been placed in a supportive-housing unit

Codification District of Columbia Official Code, 2001 Edition

011416

]

West Group Publisher, 1-800-328-9378.

Codification
District of
Columbia
Official Code

2001 Edition

2009 Winter
Supp.

West Group
Publisher



DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA REGISTER VOL. 55 - NO. 45 NOVEMBER 7 2008

ENROLLED ORIGINAL

since August 1, 2008, the:
(1) Client’s name and supportive-housing address;
(i1) Date the client was placed in the unit;
(111) Name and address of the shelter from which the client
relocated; and
(iv) Supportive services being provided to complement housing;
(B) The percentage of a shelter’s clients that were placed in supportive-
housing units;
(2) A description of the current capacity, current availability, and location of
replacement-shelter space;
(3) The number of men using low barrier shelters each month during the current
fiscal year and the prior fiscal year;
(4) Analysis of the impact, if any, that closing the Franklin Shelter may
have on the homeless population, including any risk of increased cases of hypothermia during
winter months resulting from any reduced capacity in the emergency shelter system;
(5) Any expected increase or decrease in the need for low barrier shelter
space generally and, specifically, during the winter months, when the temperature is at or below
32 degrees Fahrenheit; and
(6) A description of the ability to seasonally increase capacity to reduce
incidences of hypothermia among the homeless population.
(b) Except as provided for in subsection (a) of this section, the Mayor shall continue to
operate the Franklin Shelter as a 300-person low barrier shelter.

Sec. 4. Fiscal impact statement.

The Council adopts the fiscal impact statement of the Budget Director as the fiscal
impact statement required by section 602(c)(3) of the District of Columbia Home Rule Act,
approved December 24, 1973 (87 Stat. 813; D. C. Official Code § 1-206.02(c)(3)).

Sec. 5. Effective date.
(a) This act shall take effect following approval by the Mayor (or in the event of veto

by the Mayor, action by the Council to override the veto), a 30-day period of Congressional
review as provided in section 602(c)(1) of the District of Columbia Home Rule Act, approved

Codification District of Columbia Official Code, 2001 Edition 2 West Group Publisher, 1-800-328-9378.

011417



DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA REGISTER VOL. 55 - NO. 45 NOVEMBER 7 2008

ENROLLED ORIGINAL

December 24, 1973 (87 Stat. 813; D.C. Official Code § 1-206.02(c)(1)), and publication in the
District of Columbia Register.
(b) This act shall expire after 225 days of its having taken effect.

\ed O

Chairman
Council of the District of Columbia

District of Columbia

APPROVED
October 20, 2008

Codification District of Columbia Official Code, 2001 Edition 3 West Group Publisher, 1-800-328-9378.

011418



DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA REGISTER VOL. 55 - NO. 45

D.C. ACT 17-539

AN ACT

NOVEMBER 7 2008

ENROLLED ORIGINAL

IN THE COUNCIL OF THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA

OCTOBER 20, 2008

To amend, on an emergency basis, due to Congressional review, section 16-2326.01 of the
District of Columbia Official Code to increase the maximum attorney compensation in

neglect and termination of parental rights proceedings.

BE IT ENACTED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA, That this

act may be cited as the “Appointed Attorney Compensation Congressional Review Emergency

Act of 2008".

Sec. 2. Section 16-2326.01(b) of the District of Columbia Official Code is amended as

follows:

(a) Paragraph (1) is amended by striking the phrase “$1,600" and inserting the phrase

“$1,760" in its place.

(b) Paragraph (2) is amended by striking the phrase “$1,600" and inserting the phrase

“$1,760" in its place.

(c) Paragraph (3) is amended by striking the phrase “$2,200" and inserting the phrase

“$2,400" in its place.

(d) Paragraph (4) is amended by striking the phrase “$1,100" and inserting the phrase

“$1,200" in its place.

Sec. 3. Applicability of maximum compensation increases.
Section 2 shall apply to compensation for representation provided in cases and

proceedings initiated on or after October 2,

Sec. 4. Fiscal impact statement.

The Council adopts the fiscal impact statement in the committee report of the Appointed

2008.

Attorney Compensation Act of 2008, passed on 2™ reading on September 16, 2008 (Enrolled
version of Bill 17-757), as the fiscal impact statement required by section 602(c)(3) of the

District of Columbia Home Rule Act, approved December 24, 1973 (87 Stat. 813; D.C. Official

Code § 1-206.02(c)(3)).

Codification District of Columbia Official Code, 2001 Edition

011419

West Group Publisher, 1-800-328-9378.

Codification
District of
Columbia
Official Code

2001 Edition

2009 Winter
Supp.

West Group
Publisher

Note,
§ 16-2326.01



DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA REGISTER VOL. 55 - NO. 45 NOVEMBER 7 2008

ENROLLED ORIGINAL

Sec. 5. Effective date.

This act shall take effect following approval by the Mayor (or in the event of veto by the
Mayor, action by the Council to override the veto), and shall remain in effect for no longer than
90 days, as provided for emergency acts of the Council of the District of Columbia in section

412(a) of the District of Columbia Home Rule Act, approved December 24, 1973 (87 Stat. 788;
D.C. Official Code § 1-204.12(a)).

wetand C (i

Chairman
Council of the District of Columbia

Mayo
District of Columbia
APPROVED

October 20, 2008

AV ffm\

Codification District of Columbia Official Code, 2001 Edition 2 West Group Publisher, 1-800-328-9378.

011420



DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA REGISTER VOL. 55 - NO. 45 NOVEMBER 7 2008

ENROLLED ORIGINAL

AN ACT Disitef
D.C. ACT 17-540 e

2001 Edition

2009 Winter
IN THE COUNCIL OF THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA Supp.

OCTOBER 20; 2008 West Group

Publisher

To amend, on an emergency basis, due to Congressional review, Chapter 10 of Title 47 of the
District of Columbia Official Code to provide equitable real property tax relief to certain
property owned by Washington Parks & People, a tax-exempt organization.

BE IT ENACTED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA, That this
act may be cited as the “Washington Parks & People Equitable Real Property Tax Relief
Congressional Review Emergency Act of 2008

Sec. 2. Chapter 10 of Title 47 of the District of Columbia Official Code is amended as
follows:

(a) The table of contents is amended by adding a new section designation to read as
follows:

“§ 47-1079. Washington Parks & People Property Tax Exemption.”.

(b) A new section 47-1079 is added to read as follows:

“§ 47-1079. Washington Parks & People Property Tax Exemption.

“(a) The Council of the District of Columbia orders that all real property taxes, interest,
penalties, fees, and other related charges assessed against real property located at Square 2841,
Lots 0841, 0847, 0848, and 0851, for the period of tax years 1998 to 2008, be forgiven, as of
the effective date of this section; provided, that this property is owned and used by Washington
Parks & People as a public park, which is available for use by the public, and not used for
commercial purposes.

“(b) The one-time transfer of the property specified in subsection (a) of this section to
Washington Parks & People shall not be subject to the recordation and transfer taxes and fees
under Chapters 9 or 14 of this title.

“(c) Upon the transfer of the property described in subsection (a) of this section to
Washington Parks & People, the property shall be exempt from all taxation so long as the same
is used in carrying out the public purposes and activities of Washington Parks & People, and
not used for commercial purposes, subject to the provisions of §§ 47-1005, 47-1007, and 47-
1009.".

Codification District of Columbia Official Code, 2001 Edition 1 West Group Publisher, 1-800-328-9378.

011421



DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA REGISTER VOL. 55 - NO. 45 NOVEMBER 7 2008

ENROLLED ORIGINAL

Sec. 3. Fiscal impact statement.

The Council adopts the fiscal impact statement of the Budget Director as the fiscal
impact statement required by section 602(c)(3) of the District of Columbia Home Rule Act,
approved December 24, 1973 (87 Stat. 813; D.C. Official Code § 1-206.02(c)(3)).

Sec. 4. Effective date.

This act shall take effect following approval by the Mayor (or in the event of veto by the
Mayor, action by the Council to override the veto), and shall remain in effect for no longer than
90 days, as provided for emergency acts of the Council of the District of Columbia in section
412(a) of the District of Columbia Home Rule Act, approved December 24, 1973 (87 Stat. 788;
D.C. Official Code § 1-204.12(a)).

Voo 0 g

Chairman u
Council of the District of Colignfibia

W@J@M

District of Columbia
APPROVED
October 20, 2008

Codification District of Columbia Official Code, 2001 Edition 2 West Group Publisher, 1-800-328-9378.

011422



DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA REGISTER VOL. 55 - NO. 45 NOVEMBER 7 2008

ENROLLED ORIGINAL

AN ACT Codification
District ?f
D.C. ACT 17-541 Official Code
2001 Edition
2009 Winter
IN THE COUNCIL OF THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA Supp.
OCTOBER 20, 2008 west Group

To amend, on an emergency basis, due to Congressional review, Chapter 46 of Title 47 of the
District of Columbia Official Code to provide for tax exemptions for the St. Martin’s
Apartments development project located in Lots 114 and 115, Square 3531.

BE IT ENACTED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA, That this
act may be cited as the “St. Martin’s Apartments Tax Exemption Congressional Review
Emergency Act of 2008”.

Sec. 2. Chapter 46 of Title 47 of the District of Columbia Official Code is amended as
follows:

(a) The table of contents is amended by adding the section designation “§ 47-4616. St.
Martin’s Apartments project-tax exemptions.”.

(b) A new section 47-4616 is added to read as follows:

“§ 47-4616 . St. Martin’s Apartments project-tax exemptions.

“(a) For the purposes of this section, the term:

“(1) “Affordable rental housing project” means a housing development in which
units are rented to elderly households with not more than 60% of area median income (adjusted
for household size) for a rent not exceeding 30% of 60% area median income of such
household, as such amount of area median income is determined by the United States
Department of Housing and Urban Development.

“(2) “Developer Sponsor” means St. Martin’s Apartments LP, its successors,
affiliates, and assigns.

“(3) “St. Martin’s Apartments project” means the acquisition, rehabilitation, and
equipping, including the financing, refinancing, or reimbursing of costs incurred therefore, of an
affordable housing project, located on the St. Martin’s Parish of the Roman Catholic
Archdiocese of Washington property, consisting of:

“(A) A building containing approximately 178 units of rental housing on

Codification District of Columbia Official Code, 2001 Edition 1 West Group Publisher, 1-800-328-9378.

011423



DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA REGISTER VOL. 55 - NO. 45 NOVEMBER 7 2008

ENROLLED ORIGINAL

the St. Martin’s Apartments property; and
“(B) Other ancillary improvements.
“(4) “St. Martin’s Apartments property” means the real property, including any
improvements thereon, located in Lots 114 and 115, Square 3531.

“(b) The following conveyances with respect to the St. Martin’s Apartments project

shall be exempt from the tax imposed by §§ 42-1103 and 47-903:

“(1) Any conveyances to the Developer Sponsor; and

“(2) Any conveyances from the Developer Sponsor to an entity that operates the
St. Martin’s Apartments project as an affordable rental housing project.

“(c) The St. Martin’s Apartments property shall be exempt from the tax imposed by
Chapter 8 of this title so long as the property is operated as an affordable rental housing project,
subject to the provisions of D.C. Official Code §§ 47-1005, 47-1007, and 47-1009, as if the
exemption were granted administratively.

“(d) The St. Martin’s Apartments project shall be exempt from any public space permit
fees imposed by § 47-2718.

“(e) The exemptions pursuant to subsections (c) and (d) of this section shall be in
addition to, and not in lieu of, any other tax relief or assistance from any other source applicable
to the St. Martin’s Apartments project or the St. Martin’s Apartments property.

“(f) This section shall not prevent or restrict the Developer Sponsor from utilizing any
other tax, development, or other economic incentives available to the St. Martin’s Apartments
project or the St. Martin’s Apartments property.”.

Sec. 3. Applicability.
This act shall apply as of August 4, 2008.

Sec. 4. Fiscal impact statement.

The Council adopts the fiscal impact statement of the Budget Director as the fiscal
impact statement required by section 602(c)(3) of the District of Columbia Home Rule Act,
approved December 24, 1973 (87 Stat. 813, D.C. Official Code § 1-206.02(c)(3)).

Sec. 5. Effective date.

This act shall take effect following approval by the Mayor (or in the event of veto by the
Mayor, action by the Council to override the veto), and shall remain in effect for no longer than
90 days, as provided for emergency acts of the Council of the District of Columbia in section

b

Codification District of Columbia Official Code, 2001 Edition West Group Publisher, 1-800-328-9378.

011424



DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA REGISTER VOL. 55 - NO. 45 NOVEMBER 7 2008

ENROLLED ORIGINAL

412(a) of the District of Columbia Home Rule Act, approved December 24, 1973 (87 Stat. 788;
D.C. Official Code § 1- 204.12(a)).

\/wom

Chairman
Council of the District of Columbla

Vzkgghqu

District of Columbia ‘
APPROVED )

October 20, 2008

Codification District of Columbia Official Code, 2001 Edition 3 West Group Publisher, 1-800-328-9378.

011425



DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA REGISTER VOL. 55 - NO. 45 NOVEMBER 7 2008

ENROLLED ORIGINAL

AN ACT Codification
District of
Columbia

DICI ACT 17-5”2 Official Code

2001 Edition

IN THE COUNCIL OF THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA P

OCTOBER 20) 2008 West Group

Publisher

To amend, on an emergency basis, Chapter 10 of Title 47 of the District of Columbia Official
Code to correct the corporate name of SOME, Inc., and to clarify the tax exemptions for
these properties are contingent upon use restrictions during the federal low-income
housing tax credit compliance period.

BE IT ENACTED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA, That this
act may be cited as the “SOME, Inc. Technical Amendments Emergency Act of 2008”.

Sec. 2. Chapter 10 of Title 47 of the District of Columbia Official Code is amended as
follows:
(a) The table of contents is amended by striking the phrase “47-1078. So Others Might
Eat, Inc.” and inserting the phrase “47-1078. SOME, Inc.” in its place.
(b) Section 47-1078 is amended as follows: g:t;’lon
(1) Strike the phrase “So Others Might Eat, Inc.” wherever it appears and insert
the phrase “SOME, Inc.” in its place.
(2) Strike the phrase “Inc.:” and insert the phrase “Inc., or the property
continues to be under applicable use restrictions during a federal low-income housing tax credit
compliance period:” in its place.

Sec. 3. Fiscal impact statement.

The Council adopts the fiscal impact statement of the Budget Director as the fiscal
impact statement required by section 602(c)(3) of the District of Columbia Home Rule Act,
approved December 24, 1973 (87 Stat. 813; D.C. Official Code § 1-206.02(c)(3)).

Sec. 4. Effective date.

This act shall take effect following approval by the Mayor (or in the event of veto by the
Mayor, action by the Council to override the veto), and shall remain in effect for no longer than
90 days, as provided for emergency acts of the Council of the District of Columbia in section

Codification District of Columbia Official Code, 2001 Edition 1 West Group Publisher, 1-800-328-9378.

011426



DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA REGISTER VOL. 55 - NO. 45 NOVEMBER 7 2008

ENROLLED ORIGINAL

412(a) of the District of Columbia Home Rule Act, approved December 24, 1973 (87 Stat. 788;
D.C. Official Code § 1-204.12(a)).

oot Oy

Chairman
Council of the District of Columbia

Soia |

District of Columbia
APPROVED

October 20, 2008

Codification District of Columbia Official Code, 2001 Edition 2 West Group Publisher, 1-800-328-9378.

011427



DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA REGISTER VOL. 55 - NO. 45 NOVEMBER 7 2008

ENROLLED ORIGINAL

AN ACT Codfication
District of
Columbia

D ' C 1 ACT 17‘543 Official Code

2001 Edition

IN THE COUNCIL OF THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA 2009 Winter
Supp.
OCTOBER 20, 2008 PP

West Group
Publisher

To amend, on an emergency basis, due to Congressional review, the Office of Property
Management Establishment Act of 1998 to authorize the Office of Property
Management to make a grant of up to $5.5 million to the Old Naval Hospital Foundation
for the purpose of renovating and making improvements to the Old Naval Hospital,
Carriage House, and adjacent grounds.

BE IT ENACTED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA, That this
act may be cited as the “Old Naval Hospital Grant Congressional Review Emergency
Amendment Act of 2008”.

Sec. 2. The Office of Property Management Establishment Act of 1998, effective March
26, 1999 (D.C. Law 12-175; D.C. Official Code §10-1001 et seq.), is amended by adding a new
section 1806k to read as follows:

“Sec. 1806k. Old Naval Hospital Foundation grant authority.

“Subject to appropriations, the Office of Property Management is authorized to make a
grant in the amount of up to $5.5 million to the Old Naval Hospital Foundation for the purposes
of renovating and making improvements to the Old Naval Hospital, Carriage House, and
adjacent grounds, located at 921 Pennsylvania Avenue, S.E., in accordance with plans and
specifications approved by the Office of Property Management and pursuant to a grant
agreement between the District and the Foundation.”. .

Sec. 3. Fiscal impact statement.
The Council adopts the fiscal impact statement of the Chief Financial Officer as the

fiscal impact statement required by section 602(c)(3) of the District of Columbia Home Rule
Act, approved December 24, 1973 (87 Stat. 813; D.C. Official Code § 1-206.02(c)(3)).

Sec. 4. Effective date.

This act shall take effect following approval by the Mayor (or in the event of veto by the
Mayor, action by the Council to override the veto), and shall remain in effect for no longer than
90 days, as provided for emergency acts of the Council of the District of Columbia in section

Codification District of Columbia Official Code, 2001 Edition 1 West Group Publisher, 1-800-328-9378.

011428



DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA REGISTER VOL. 55 - NO. 45 NOVEMBER 7 2008

ENROLLED ORIGINAL

412(a) of the District of Columbia Home Rule Act, approved December 24, 1973 (87 Stat. 788
D.C. Official Code § 1-204.12(a)).

weed C O

Chairman
Council of the District of CoMmbia

_/' )QYWM (eam

D1stnct of Columbia
APPROVED

October 20, 2008

Codification District of Columbia Official Code, 2001 Edition 2 West Group Publisher, 1-800-328-9378.

011429



DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA REGISTER VOL. 55 - NO. 45 NOVEMBER 7 2008

ENROLLED ORIGINAL

AN ACT
D.C. ACT 17-544

IN THE COUNCIL OF THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA
OCTOBER 20, 2003

To authorize, on an emergency basis, due to Congressional review, the Mayor to enter into a
contract with Waterfront Associates, LLC, for the construction of Fourth Street, S.W_, as
part of the redevelopment of the Waterside Mall site.

BE IT ENACTED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA, That this
act may be cited as the “Waterside Mall and Fourth Street, S.W., Redevelopment and
Reconstruction Congressional Review Emergency Act of 2008”.

Sec. 2. (a) Notwithstanding the District of Columbia Procurement Practices Act of 1985,
effective February 21, 1986 (D.C. Law 6-85; D.C. Official Code § 2-301.01 et seq.), the Mayor
is authorized to enter into a contract with Waterfront Associates, LLC, to provide services for the
construction of Fourth Street, S.W., as part of the redevelopment of the Waterside Mall site, on
such terms and conditions as the Mayor considers necessary or appropriate.

(b) Pursuant to section 451 of the District of Columbia Home Rule Act, approved
December 24, 1973 (87 Stat. 803; D.C. Official Code § 1-204.51), and notwithstanding section
105a of the District of Columbia Procurement Practices Act of 1985, effective March 8, 1991
(D.C. Law 8-257; D.C. Official Code § 2-301.05a), the Council approves the contract between
Waterfront Associates, LLC, and the District of Columbia, as received by the Council on July
14, 2008, in the amount of $13.5 million, for construction services related to the construction of

Fourth Street, S.W.

Sec. 3. Fiscal impact statement.

The Council adopts the fiscal impact statement for the Waterside Mall and Fourth Street,
S.W., Redevelopment and Reconstruction Temporary Act of 2008, signed by the Mayor on
September 29, 2008 (D.C. Act 17- 516; 55 DCR __ ), as the fiscal impact statement required by
section 602(c)(3) of the District of Columbia Home Rule Act, approved December 24, 1973 (87
Stat. 813; D.C. Official Code § 1-206.02(c)(3)).

011430



DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA REGISTER VOL. 55 - NO. 45 NOVEMBER 7 2008

ENROLLED ORIGINAL

Sec. 4. Effective date.

This act shall take effect following approval by the Mayor (or in the event of veto by the
Mayor, action by the Council to override the veto), and shall remain in effect for no longer than
90 days, as provided for emergency acts of the Council of the District of Columbia in section

412(a) of the District of Columbia Home Rule Act, approved December 24, 1973 (87 Stat. 788,
D.C. Official Code § 1-204.12(a)).

ook O

Chairman 7
Council of the District of Columbia

District of Columbia
APPROVED

October 20, 2008

011431



DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA REGISTER VOL. 55 - NO. 45 NOVEMBER 7 2008

ENROLLED ORIGINAL

AN ACT
D.C. ACT 17-545

IN THE COUNCIL OF THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA
OCTOBER 20, 2008

To amend, on an emergency basis, due to Congressional review, Chapter 10 of Title 47 of the
District of Columbia Official Code to exempt from taxation certain real property located
on federal property in the District of Columbia and used by the United States Department
of the Air Force, and to provide equitable real property tax relief for the real property.

BE IT ENACTED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA, That this
act may be cited as the “Bolling Air Force Base Military Housing Real Property Tax Exemption
and Equitable Tax Relief Congressional Review Emergency Act of 2008”.

Sec. 2. Chapter 10 of Title 47 of the District of Columbia Official Code is amended as
follows:

(a) The table of contents is amended by adding a new section designation to read as
follows:

“47-1080. Bolling Air Force Base housing.”.

(b) A new section 47-1080 is added to read as follows:

“§ 47-1080. Bolling Air Force Base housing.

“(a) The real property, located in Square 6072, or otherwise at the Bolling Air Force
Base, together with the improvements thereon, and any future improvements constructed
thereon, shall be exempt from all taxation, including ordinary and special taxes and use or
possessory interest taxes, on real property or the use thereof, so long as the property is used for
the purposes of housing military personnel or their families, as contemplated by 10 U.S.C. §§
2871 through 2885, subject to the proyisions of §§ 47-1005, 47-1007, and 47-1009. The transfer
of a leasehold or fee interest in the property, or the improvements thereon, from the United
States of America, or any branch of the United States military; the recordation of any lease,
deed, deed of trust, other security instrument, or financing used for the improvement or
construction of military housing and related facilities; and the transfer from any entity to the
United States government, or any branch of the United States military, shall be exempt from all
transfer and recordation taxes of or imposed by the District of Columbia.

011432



DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA REGISTER VOL. 55 - NO. 45 NOVEMBER 7 2008

ENROLLED ORIGINAL

“(b) Real property taxes, recordation or transfer taxes, interest, penalties, fees and other
related charges assessed against said real property in Square 6072 located on Bolling Air Force
Base, for the period of October 1, 2007, through July 28, 2008, shall be forgiven, and any
payments made for the period shall be refunded.”.

Sec. 3. Fiscal impact statement.

The Council adopts the fiscal impact statement of the Budget Director as the fiscal
impact statement required by section 602(c)(3) of the District of Columbia Home Rule Act,
approved December 24, 1973 (87 Stat. 813; D.C. Official Code § 1-206.02 (c)(3)).

Sec. 4. Effective date.

This act shall take effect following approval by the Mayor (or in the event of veto by the
Mayor, action by the Council to override the veto), and shall remain in effect for no longer than
90 days, as provided for emergency acts of the Council of the District of Columbia in section
412(a) of the District of Columbia Home Rule Act, approved December 24, 1973 (87 Stat. 788;
D.C. Official Code § 1-204.12(a)).

o0 0

Chairman
Council of the District of Qojumbia

A@mm

District of Columbia
APPROVED

October 20, 2008

011433



DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA REGISTER VOL. 55 - NO. 45 NOVEMBER 7 2008

ENROLLED ORIGINAL
Codification
AN ACT Districcta;_lfa
Columbia
D.C. ACT 17-546 Official Code
' 2001 Edition
IN THE COUNCIL OF THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA 2009 i
inter
Supp.
OCTOBER 20, 2008
West Group
Publisher
To amend, on an emergency basis, due to Congressional review, the Historic Landmark and
Historic District Protection Act of 1978 to exempt historic housing grants from
computation as District gross taxable income; and to amend section 47-1803.02 of the
District of Columbia Official Code to reflect that exemption.
BE IT ENACTED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA, That this
act may be cited as the “Targeted Historic Housing Preservation Assistance Congressional
Review Emergency Amendment Act of 2008”.
Sec. 2. The second section 11a(e) of the Historic Landmark and Historic District §N2f‘1"1 02

Protection Act of 1978, effective March 2, 2007 (D.C. Law 16-189; D.C. Official Code § 6-
1110.02(e)), is amended by adding a new paragraph (3) to read as follows:
“(3) A grant made to a taxpayer pursuant to this section shall be excluded in the

computation of District gross income.”.

Sec. 3. Section 47-1803.02(a)(2) of the District of Columbia Official Code is amended  Note,
by adding a new subparagraph (Y) to read as follows: § 47-1803.02
“(Y) The amount received by a taxpayer pursuant to the second section
11a of the Historic Landmark and Historic District Protection Act of 1978, effective March 2,
2007 (D.C. Law 16-189; D.C. Official Code § 6-1110.02).”.

Sec. 4. Fiscal impact statement.

The Council adopts the fiscal impact statement of the Budget Director as the fiscal
impact statement required by section 602(c)(3) of the District of Columbia Home Rule Act,
approved December 24, 1973 (87 Stat. 813; D.C. Official Code § 1-206.02(c)(3)).

Sec. 5. Effective date.

This act shall take effect following approval by the Mayor (or in the event of veto by the
Mayor, action by the Council to override the veto), and shall remain in effect for no longer than
90 days, as provided for emergency acts of the Council of the District of Columbia in section

Codification District of Columbia Official Code, 2001 Edition 1 West Group Publisher, 1-800-328-9378.

011434



DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA REGISTER VOL. 55 - NO. 45 NOVEMBER 7 2008

ENROLLED ORIGINAL

412(a) of the District of Columbia Home Rule Act, approved December 24, 1973 (87 Stat. 788;
D.C. Official Code § 1-204.12(a)).

Va0

Chairman Lg
Council of the District of Colthbia

Mavyor

District of Columbia
APPROVED

October 20, 2008

Codification District of Columbia Official Code, 2001 Edition 2 West Group Publisher, 1-800-328-9378.

011435





