
’DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA REGISTER ’ AUG 8 -*ZOO3 

DEPARTMENT OF CONSUMER AND REGULATORY AFFAIRS 

NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULEMAKING 

The Director of the Department of Consumer and Regulatory Affairs (DCRA) pursuant to 
the authority set forth in Section 10 of the Construction Codes Approval and 
Amendments Act of 1986, effective March 21, 1987 (D.C. Law 6-216; D.C. Official 
Code, sec. 6-1409) (2001)), and Mayor’s Order 87-259, dated November 13, 1987, 
hereby gives notice of the intent to adopt the District of Columbia Construction Codes of 
2003, consisting of the 2000 edition of the International Code Council (ICC) 
International Building Code, the 2000 edition of the ICC International Residential Code, 
the 2000 edition of the ICC International Fuel Gas Code, the 2000 edition of the ICC 
International Mechanical Code, the 2000 edition of the ICC International Plumbing Code, 
the 2000 edition of the ICC International Property Maintenance Code, the 2000 edition of 
the ICC International Fire Code, the 2000 edition of the ICC International Energy 
Conservation Code, the D.C. Existing Buildings Code Supplement of 2002, the 1996 
edition of the NFPA National Electrical Code, and a new Title 12 of the District of 
Columbia Municipal Regulations (DCMR), the Construction Codes Supplement of 2003 
including local variations to the adopted codes, in not less than thirty (30) days from the 
date of publication of this notice in the D.C. Register. 

The proposed rules will repeal the District of Columbia Construction Codes adopted in 
1999, including the 1996 editions of the BOCA National Building Code, International 
Mechanical Code, BOCA National Fire Prevention Code, BOCA National Property 
Maintenance Code, the NFPA National Electrical Code, and the 1995 editions of the 
International Plumbing Code and the CAB0 One- and Two-Family Dwelling Code and 
the 1999 edition of Title 12 DCMR, the District of Columbia Construction Codes 
Supplement. 

Pursuant to Section 10 of the Act, the proposed rulemaking is being transmitted to the 
Council of the District of Columbia for a 45-day period of review, excluding Saturdays, 
Sundays, legal holidays, and days of Council recess. If the Council does not approve or 
disapprove the proposed rules, in whole or in part, within the 45-day review period, the 
proposed rules shall be deemed approved upon expiration of the 45-day period, except 
that the adoption of the International Existing Building Code shall not be deemed 
approved until expiration of the 90-day review period provided for in the Homestart 
Regulatory Improvement Amendment Act of 2002, D.C. Law 14-162, effective June 25, 
2002. The proposed rules will not become effective until at least thirty (30) days from 
the date of publication of this notice in the D.C. Register, or until approved or deemed 
approved by the Council, whichever occurs later. 

Due to the volume of the texts adopted as proposed rules, the Office of Documents and 
Administrative Issuances has authorized the incorporation by reference of the texts cited 
above with this notice, pursuant to section 4(d) of the District of Columbia Documents 
Act, effective March 6, 1979 (D.C. Law 2-153; D.C. Official Code, sec. 2-553(d)) 
(2001). 





t 

DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA REGISTER’ AUG 8 - 2003 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULEMAKING 

The Director of the Department of Health, pursuant to the authority set forth in An Act to 
enable the District of Columbia to receive Federal financial assistance under Title XIX of 
the Social Security Act for a medical assistance program, and for other purposes, 
approved December 27, 1967 (81 Stat. 744; D.C. Official Code 5 1-307.02), 
Reorganization Plan No. 4 of 1996, and Mayor’s Order 97-42, dated February 18, 1997, 
hereby gives notice of the intent to adopt an amendment to Chapter 9 of Title 29 of the 
District of Columbia Municipal Regulations (DCMR) governing reimbursement of 
nursing facilities. The proposed amendment would revise the rules governing provider 
appeals. 

Each nursing facility is reimbursed on a prospective basis at a facility specific rate. The 
facility specific per diem rate is developed by establishing a base year per diem rate, 
subject to a ceiling and adjustments. The current rules governing the appeals process 
were developed based upon a cost-based reimbursement methodology. The proposed 
amendment would revise the appeals process consistent with a prospective paymeEt 
system. The Medicaid Program is also amending the applicable provisions of the District 
of Columbia State Plan for Medical Assistance. 

The Director also gives notice of the intent to take final rulemaking action to adopt these 
proposed rules in not less than thirty (30) days from the date of publication. 

Amend section 960 (Appeals) of Chapter 9, Title 29 DCMR to read as follows: 

960.1 The Medicaid Program shall issue each provider a Rate Letter which sets 
forth the per diem rate to be paid to each facility for the applicable fiscal 
year, the inflation adjustment applicable to each fiscal year as determined 
in accordance with section 952, and the amount of any interim payment, 
if applicable. 

960.2 

960.3 

A provider who disagrees with the Rate Letter may request an 
administrative review by sending a written request for an administrative 
review within (45) days of the Rate Letter. The request for an 
administrative review should be sent to the Financial Manager, Audit and 
Finance, Medical Assistance Administration, Department of Health, 825 
North Capitol Street, NE, 5“’ Floor, Washington, DC 20002. 

The amounts subject to an administrative review are as follows: 

(a) 
(b) The interim payment amount. 

The amount of the inflation adjustment; and 



960.5 

960.6 

960.7 







'DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA REGISTER' AUG 8 - 2003 

STATE EDUCATION OFFICE OF THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA 

NOTICE OF PROPOSED RULEMAKING 

The State Education Office, pursuant to the authority set forth in the District of Columbia 
Nonresident Tuition Act, approved September 8, 1960 (74 Stat. 853, D.C. Official Code; 
0 38-301 et seq.), and the State Education Office Establishment Act of 2000, effective 
October 21,2000 (D.C. Law 13-176; D.C. Official Code 4 38-2601 et seq.), hereby gives 
notice of its intent to adopt the following amendment to Section 2008 of Title 5 of the 
District of Columbia Municipal Regulations (DCMR) in not less than thirty (30) days 
from the date of publication of these rules in the D. C. Register. The purpose of the 
proposed amendment is to establish new tuition rates for non-resident students attending 
public and public charter schools in the District of Columbia. 

5 DCMR 4 2008.13 is amended to read as follows: 

2008.13 The following shall be the non-resident tuition rates currently in effect for 
public and charter schools in the District of Columbia: 

SCHEDULE OF 2003-04 NON-RESIDENT TUITION RATES 

The rates displayed in the charts below are the same as the per-pupil allocations provided 
by the Uniform Per Student Funding Formula during the FY 2003 school year. Based on 
these rates, the tuition cost for each student who is not a resident of the District of 
Columbia and who is enrolled in the District of Columbia Public Schools or in a public 
charter school in the District of Columbia shall be calculated in the following manner: 

(a) Using the Grade Level Table below, determine the rate for the grade level or 
span at which the student, based on grade assignment or age, will be enrolled. 

Rates by Grade Level or Applicable Grade Range 

Grade Levels 

Pre-School/Pre-Kinder garten 
Grades K-3 

Grades 4-5 

(Includes students enrolled in 
Ungraded elementary school programs.) 

Grades 6-8 (Includes students enrolled in 
Ungraded middle or junior high school programs.) 

Grades 9-12 (Includes students enrolled in 
Ungraded senior high school txograms.) 

Alternative school, all grade levels 
Special Education Schools 
Adult 

Yearly Rate Half-Yearly Daily Rate 

$7,5 10 $3,755 $42 
$6,611 $3,306 $37 

$6,4 19 $3,209 $36 
$6,611 $3,306 $37 

$7,510 $3,755 $42 

$8,344 $4,172 $46 
$7,510 $3,755 $42 
$4,814 $2,407 $27 

Rate 



DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA REGISTER' 

(b) If the student is enrolled in a daytime special education program, use the table 
below to determine the rates for services the student will receive. Add this 
amount to the grade level cost in paragraph (a) of this section. 

Rates for Special Needs Students Enrolled in a Daytime Special Education Program 

LeveVProgram Yearly Rate Half-Yearly Daily Rate 
Rate 

Level 1 $3,530 $1,765 $20 
Special Education 
Level 2 $5,456 $2,728 $30 
Special Education 
Level 3 $9,628 $4,814 $53 
Special Education 
Level 4 $17,330 $8,665 $96 
Special Education 
LEP/NEP Services to Limited- and Non-English $2,567 $1,284 $14 

Proficient Students 

(c) If the student is enrolled in a residential school that serves special needs 
students, use the table below to determine the rates for any of the listed services 
that the student will receive. Add these amounts to the totals from paragraphs 
(a) and (b). 

Rates for Special Needs Students Enrolled in a Residential School 

I LeveYProgram 
Level 1 Special Education (Add-on rates for 

After hours SDecial Education Services) 
Level 2 Special Education (Add-on rates for 1 After hours Special Education Services) 
Level 3 Special Education (Add-on rates for I After hours Special Education Services) 
Level 4 Special Education 

Level 5 Special Education 

(Add-on rates for 

(Residential 24-hour 
After hours Special Education Services) 

Intensity special education school. Includes 
Both daytime and after hours services.) 

Proficient Students 
(Add-on rate for after hour services) 

LEP/NEP Services to Limited- and Non-English 

Yearly Rate I Half-Yearly I Daily Rate 
Rate 

$2,401 $1,200 $13 

$8,729 $4,365 

$18,877 $9,438 

$18,768 $9,384 $104 

$60,334 $30,167 $335 

$4,365 $2,182 $24 



r- 

OlSTRlCT OF COLUMBIA REGISTEf$ AUG 8 - 2003 

(d) Any student enrolled in a residential school, whether or not the student has 
special needs, is entitled to the Residential Rate listed below, which covers the 
cost of room and board. Add this amount to the total of (a), (b), and (c) above. 
This amount is the student’s total non-resident tuition rate for the regular school 
year program. 

Rates for Room and Board for students Enrolled in a Residential School 

Program Yearly Rate Half-Yearly Daily Rate 
Rate 

Residential (Room and Board) I $10,911 $5,456 $6 1 

(e) A non-resident student who wishes to attend summer school in the District of 
Columbia must register for the summer program separately from the regular 
school year program. Students will be admitted on a space-available basis. The 
non-resident tuition rates for summer school are displayed below. 

Additional Rates for Non-Resident Students Enrolled in Summer School 

I Program Rate 
I Summer School I $1,091 I 

The rates in this schedule only apply to non-resident students enrolled in the regular 
school program of the District of Columbia Public Schools or a public charter school in 
the District of Columbia. Some schools may offer services that are not considered part of 
the regular school program, and participation in such programs may require payment of 
additional fees. 

All persons who desire to comment on these proposed rules should submit their 
comments in writing to C. Vannessa Spinner, State Education Officer, 441 Fourth Street, 
NW, Washington, D.C. 20001. All comments must be received by the State Education 
Office not later than thirty (30) days after publication of this notice in the D. C. Register. 
Copies of these proposed rules and related information may be obtained by writing to the 
above address, or by calling the State Education Office at (202) 727-6436. 



‘DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA REGISTER. 



’DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA  REGISTER^ AUG 8 - 2003 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

NOTICE OF EMERGENCY AND PROPOSED RULEMAKING 

The District of Columbia Board of Nursing (“Board”) pursuant to the authority set forth 
under 0 601 (b) of the Use of Trained Employees to Administer Medication to Persons 
with Mental Retardation or Other Disabilities Act of 1995 effective September 22, 1995 
(D.C. Law 1 1-52; D.C. Official Code 6 21-1205), hereby gives notice of the adoption, on 
an emergency basis of an amendment to Chapter 61 of Title 17 DCMR, “ Trained 
Medication Employees.” 

Emergency action is necessary to safeguard the health, safety, and welfare of individuals 
with mental retardation and other developmental disabilities in agencies licensed, 
certified, or approved by the District government as a child care facility, private school, 
day program, community based residence, or other agency providing residential services, 
education, habilitation, vocational, or employment training services. Because of the 
shortage of nurses available to provide medications to the residents of theses facilities, it 
is necessary to provide training to individuals who will then provide medications in a 
timely manner. 

A notice of Emergency and Proposed Rules was published on April 18,2003, at 50 DCR 
307 1. One comment was received in connection with this notice recommending changes 
to sections 6106.4,6110.5 and adding the term “medication” to the list of definitions. 
The Board voted to accept the recommendations; therefore the rules are being 
republished for additional comment. The emergency rulemaking was adopted on June 4, 
2003. These Emergency and Proposed Rules supersede those published on April 18, 
2003. The emergency rule will expire one hundred twenty (120) calendar days after 
adoption or upon publication of a Notice of Final Rulemaking the D.C. Register, 







DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA REGISTER: 

$ection 6105.11 is amended to read as follows: 

6105.1 1 When a new medication is ordered for a program participant the licensed 
nurse shall be notified before the administration of the medication and a 
photocopy of the prescription shall be place in the MAR. 

Section 6106.1 is amended to read as follows: 

6106.1 Upon successful completion of a Trained Medication Employee Course 
approved by the Board, a trained medication employee applicant shall 
submit: 

(a) Documentation signed by the Medication Administration Trainer 
verifying satisfactory completion of the Trained Medication 
Employee Course; 

(b) Proof of least one (1) year of clinical experience in a program or a 
health care facility; 

(c) Proof of satisfactory current completion of cardio-pulmonary 
(CPR) training and a First Aid program; and 

(d) A completed application and required fee. 

Section 6106.2 is amended to read as follows: 

6106.2 An applicant may request a waiver from participation in the Medication 
Administration Course if the applicant has successfully completed a 
substantially equivalent course in another jurisdiction. Program 
employees that have successfully completed a Medication Administration 
Course approved by the State of Maryland or the Commonwealth of 
Virginia need not participate in the Medication Administration Course. 

Section 6106.3 is amended to read as follows: 

6106.3 An applicant requesting a waiver from participation in the Medication 
Administration Course shall submit to the Board: 

(a) Proof of current certification in the administration of medication in 
Maryland or Virginia or any other jurisdiction approved by the 
Board; 

(b) Proof of at least one (1) year of clinical experience in a program or 
a health care facility; 



’DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA REGISTER’ 

(c) Proof of satisfactory current completion of a cardio-pulmonary 
(CPR) training and First Aid program; and 

(d) A completed application and required fee. 

Section 6106.4 is amended to read as follows: 

6 106.4 The Board shall issue to qualified applicants a certification as a trained 
medication employee authorized to administer medication to program 
participants in a program licensed, certified or approved by the District of 
Columbia government as defined in D.C. Official Code 9 21-1201 (10). 

Section 6106.5 is amended to read as follows: 

6106.5 The Board shall maintain a registry of certified trained medication 
employees. 

Section 6106.6 is amended to read as follows: 

6106.6 If, after certification, the supervisory registered nurse or licensed 
practitioner observers serious or multiple deficiencies or errors, he or she 
shall report the deficiencies to the Board in writing. 

Section 6106.7 is amended to read as follows: 

6106.7 If a licensed nurse or licensed practitioner observes serious or multiple 
deficiencies or errors that have jeopardized the health or welfare of any 
program participant which include, but are not limited to, errors involving 
medication administration, dosage documentation and storage of 
medications, the licensed nurse or licensed practitioner shall report the 
deficiencies to the Board and the employing program shall prohibit the 
trained medication employee from administering medication until the 
Board has taken action on the notice of deficiency. 

Sections 6106.8,6106.09,6106.10,6106.14,6106.15,6106.16,6106.17,6106.18 and 
6106.19 are repealed. 

Section 6107.1 is amended to read as follows: 

6107.1 Recertification of a trained medication employee shall be required every 
two (2) years, and shall include verification of a Board-approved twelve 
(1 2) hours of in-service training in pharmacology or medication 
administration and the supervisory registered nurse’s verification of the 
trained medication employee’s continued adequacy of performance. 



DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA REGISTER ’ 

Section 6107.2 is amended to read as follows: 

6107.2 Recertification applications shall be submitted to the Board before the 
expiration of the current certification and shall: 

(a) 

(b) 

Be signed by the trained medication employee; 

Include the supervisory registered nurse’s written verification of 
the trained medication employee’s continued adequacy of 
performance; 

Include documentation verifying successhl completion of twelve 
(12) hours of board approved in-service training; and 

Be accompanied by the required registration fee. 

(c) 

(d) 

Section 6108.1 is amended to read as follows: 

6108.1 Before administering medication to a program participant, all trained 
medication employees shall: 

Observe a supervisory registered nurse administering medication 
to a program participant on at least two (2) occasions; 

Be observed by a supervisory registered nurse on a least four (4) 
separate occasions while engaged in the process o f  administration, 
documentation, and monitoring side effects at one hundred percent 
(1 00%) proficiency; 

Demonstrate his or her proficiency and knowledge of all 
medication procedures for the storage of medications, and all 
program policies pertaining to the administration of medication; 
and 

Demonstrate knowledge of medications to be administered by 
reviewing the following with the supervisory nurse: 

(1) Compatibility with other prescribed and non-prescribed 
medications; 

(2) Known patient allergies; 

(3) Usage warnings; 



~ISTRICT OF COLUMBIA REGISTER' 

(4) Side effects; 

(5) Indications for usage; and 

(6) Other potential adverse reactions. 

Section 6108.2 is amended to read as follows: 

6108.2 A registered nurse shall review the completed MAR monthly for proper 
and accurate documentation, including vital signs. 

Section 6108.3 is amended to read as follows: 

6108.3 A registered nurse shall observe, review and evaluate in writing the ability 
of the trained medication employee to properly administer, document and 
store medication for a program participant every three (3) months for the 
first year of certification and every six (6) months thereafter. 

Section 6108.4 is amended to read as follows: 

6108.4 The supervisory registered nurse shall be available to the trained 
medication employee for general or direct supervision. 

Section 6108.5 is repealed. 

Section 6108.6 is amended to read as follows: 

6108.6 The supervisory registered nurse shall, on a monthly basis, review the 
licensed practitioner's orders, MAR, and medication intervals for all 
program participants. 

Section 6108.7 is amended to read as follows: 

6108.7 The supervisory registered nurse shall review with the trained medication 
employee any errors in documentation that are noted. Serious or multiple 
errors or omissions shall be reported to the Board of Nursing. 

Section 6108.8 is amended to read as follows: 

6108.8 Only a licensed nurse shall accept a telephone medication order from a 
licensed practitioner for a new prescription or change in dosage or 
frequency. 

Section 6108.9 is amended to read as follows: 







Section 6112.1 is amended to read as follows: 

61 12.1 Each program shall develop guidelines to assess whether a program 
participant: 

(a) Has the ability to self-administer his or her medications; 

(b) Requires the prescribed medication to be administered by a trained 
medication employee; or 

(c) Requires the prescribed medication to be administered by a licensed 
practical or registered nurse. 

Subsection 6199.1 is amended as follows: 

a) The following terms with the ascribed meanings are added as follows: 

Direct supervision - supervision in which the supervising nurse is available to the 
trained medication employee on the premises and within vocal communication either 
directly or by a communication device. 

General supervision - supervision in which the supervising nurse is available to the 
trained medication employee for consultation either in person or by a communication 
device, but need not be physically present on the premises at the time the actions are 
performed. 

Medication - a controlled (excluding Classes I and 11) or non-controlled substance or 
treatment regarded as effective in bringing about recovery, restoration of health, 
alleviation of pain or symptoms of an illness, or the normal fimctioning of the body. 

b) The defmition for trained medication employee is amended to read as follows: 

Trained medication employee - an individual employed to work in a program who has 
successfully completed a training program approved by the Board and is certified to 
administer medication to program participants. 

All persons wishing to comment on the proposed rulemaking shall submit written 
comments no later than thirty (30) days after the date of publication of this notice in the 
D.C. RePister, to the Department of Health, Office of the General Counsel, 825 North 
Capitol Street, N.E., 4* Floor, Washington, D.C. 20002. Copies of the proposed rules 
may be obtained between the hours of 9:00 a.m. and 5:OO p.m. Monday through Friday, 
excluding holidays, at the address listed above. 



DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA REGISTER AUG 8 - 2003 

DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

NOTICE OF EMERGENCY AND PROPOSED RULEMAKING 

The Director of the Department of Health, pursuant to the authority set forth in An Act to enable 
the District of Columbia to receive federal financial assistance under Title XIX of the Social 
Security Act for a medical assistance program and for other purposes, approved December 27, 
1967 (81 Stat. 774; D.C. Official Code 5 1-307.02), Reorganization Plan No. 4 of 1996, and 
Mayor’s Order 97-42, dated February 18, 1997, hereby gives notice of the adoption, on an 
emergency basis of a new section 936 of Title 29 of the District of Columbia Municipal 
Regulations (DCMR), entitled “Dental Services”. These rules establish standards governing 
reimbursement by the District of Columbia Medicaid Program for dental services provided by a 
licensed dentist or dental hygienist to participants with mental retardation in the Home and 
Community Based Waiver for Persons with Mental Retardation and Developmental Disabilities 
(Waiver). These rules also establish Medicaid reimbursement rates for dental services. 

On November 22,2002, a notice of emergency and proposed rulemaking was published in the 
D. C. Register (49 DCR 10630). These rules amend the previously published rules by adopting 
the dental services available to eligible Medicaid recipients residing in an intermediate care 
facility (ICF/MR) for persons with mental retardation. This change will ensure that persons 
residing in an ICF/MR and Waiver participants receive the same dental services. Emergency 
action is necessary for the immediate preservation of the health, safety, and welfare of Waiver 
participants who are in need of dental services. 

The emergency rulemaking was adopted on July 16, 2003 and will become effective one day 
after publication of this notice of emergency rulemaking in the DC Register. The emergency 
rules remain in effect for 120 days or until November 13,2003 unless earlier superceded or 
publication of a Notice of Final Rulemaking in the D. C. Register, whichever comes first. 











'DISTRICT OF COLUMBiA REGISTER' AUG 8 - 2003 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

NOTICE OF EMERGENCY AND PROPOSED RULEMAKING 

The Director of the Department of Health, pursuant to the authority set forth in An Act to enable 
the District of Columbia to receive federal financial assistance under Title XIX of the Social 
Security Act for a medical assistance program, and for other purposes, approved December 27, 
1967 (81 Stat. 744; D.C. Official Code, 4 1-307.02), Reorganization Plan No. 4 of 1996, and 
Mayor's Order 97-42, dated February 18, 1997, hereby gives notice of the adoption, on an 
emergency basis, of a new section 944 to Chapter 9 of Title 29 of the District of Columbia 
Municipal Regulations (DCMR), entitled "Adult Companion Services". These rules establish 
standards governing reimbursement by the District of Columbia Medicaid Program for adult 
companion services provided by qualified professionals to participants with mental retardation in 
the Home and Community Based Waiver for Persons with Mental Retardation and 
Developmental Disabilities (Waiver). These rules also establish Medicaid reimbursement rates 
for adult companion services. 

The Centers for Medicare and Medicaid Services (CMS), formerly the federal Health Care 
Financing Administration has advised the District that the maintenance and expansion of adult 
companion services to persons with mental retardation and developmental disabilities is essential 
to the continuation of the Waiver. These rules establish standards governing the provision of 
adult companion services. 

Emergency action is necessary for the immediate preservation of the health, safety, and welfare 
of Waiver participants who are in need of adult companion services. 

The emergency rulemaking was adopted on July 10, 2003, and will become effective on the date 
of publication of this notice of emergency rulemaking in the D. C. Register. The emergency rules 
will expire on November 7, 2003, or upon publication of a Notice of Final Rulemaking in the 
D. C. Register, whichever comes first. A notice of emergency and proposed rulemaking was 
published on March 21,2003, at 50 DCR 2370. The emergency rule expired on June 5,2003. 
This proposed rulemaking supersedes the proposed rulemaking published on March 2 1,2003. 
This emergency and proposed rule reflects changes prohibiting concurrent billing for personal 
care, respite, chore, homemaker, attendant care, residential habilitation, or independent 
habilitation services and clarifying that transportation services provided under section 944.3(g) 
can only be billed if the provider has a provider agreement to bill for transportation services 
under the waiver. 

The Director also gives notice of his intent to take final rulemaking action to adopt these 
emergency and proposed rules not less than thirty (30) days from the date of publication of this 
notice in the D.C. Register. 

Title 29 (Public Welfare) (May 1987) of the District of Columbia Municipal Regulations is 
amended by adding a new section 944, to read as follows: 

944 ADULT COMPANION SERVICES 

1 

6479 





confirmed by an annual PPD Skin Test or documentation from a physician 
stating that the person is free of communicable diseases; 

Be able to communicate with the client; 

Be able to read and write the English language; 

d) 

e) 

f) Complete required training; 



* 
DJSTRICT OF COLUMBIA REGISTER' 

client's IHP or ISP; 

(h) Comply with the requirements of the Health-Care Facility Unlicensed 
Personnel Criminal Background Check of 1998, effective April 20, 1999 
(D.C. Law 12-238, D.C. Official Code 5 44-551 et seq.); and 

(i) Have two (2) or more years of college education, or a high school 
diploma, or its equivalent, and five (5) years of experience working with 
persons with mental retardation and developmental disabilities. 

944.9 The billable units of service shall be one (1) hour. 

944.10 The reimbursement rate shall be twelve dollars ($12.00) per hour. 

944.99 DEFINITIONS 

When used in this section, the following terms and phrases shall have the meanings ascribed: 

Client -an individual with mental retardation who has been determined eligible to receive 
services under the Home and Community-Based Waiver for Persons with mental Retardation and 
Developmental Disabilities. 

Communicable disease- that term as set forth in section 201 of Chapter 2 of Title 22, District of 
Columbia Municipal Regulations. 

Individual Habilitation Plan or IHP-that plan as set forth in section 403 of the Mentally 
Retarded Citizens Constitutional Rights and Dignity Act of 1978, effective March 3, 1979 (D.C. 
Law 2-137; D.C. Official Code 5 7-1304.03). 

Individual Support Plan or ISP- the successor plan to the individual habilitation plan (IHP) as 
defined in the court-approved Joy Evans Exit Plan. 

Socialization- interaction in the community with non-handicapped peers and access to 
neighborhood and community resources that strengthen the development of natural and informal 
supports. 

Comments on the proposed rules shall be submitted in writing to Wanda Tucker, Interim Senior 
Deputy Director, Medical Assistance Administration, Department of Health, 825 North Capitol 
Street, N.E., 5th Floor, Washington, D.C. 20002, within thirty (30) days from the date of 
publication of this notice in the D.C. Revister. Copies of the proposed rules may be obtained 
Monday through Friday between 8: 15 A.M. and 4:45 P.M. at the same address. 


