
DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA REGETER ' 
MAR 4 - 2005 

OFFICE OF DOCUMENTS & ADMINISTRATIVE ISSUANCES 

LIST OF SECTIONS W N D E D  
of 

D.C. MUNICIPAL REGULATIONS 
As of February 28,2005 

Below is the cumulative index of amendments to the D.C. Municipal Regulations (DCMR). An 
asterisk (*) indicates that the particular DCMR Title is still in progress and not yet available in final form. A. 
list of agency abbreviations appears at the end of this document. This document is updated each month. 

AMENDMENTS BY DCMR TITLE 

[Chapter amended, sections amended, nature of amendment, D. C. 
Register citation, date, and agency promulgating amendment] 

DCMR Title 1Mayor and Executive Agencies (June 2001 ed.) 

Chapter 4, Freedom ofhformation, 52 DCR 52 (1-7-05) 
Chapter 11, Guidelines of the Board of Review for Anti-Deficiency Violations, EXPIRES 120 DAYS, 

5 1 DCR 7968 (8-13-04) (BORAV) 
Chapter 28, Rules of Practice and Procedure, 5 1 DCR 6399 (6-25-04) (OAH) 
Chapter 28, Rules of Practice and Procedure, 5 1 DCR 8595 (9-3-04) (OAH) 
Chapter 28, Rules of Practice and Procedure), $4 2802.2,2804.4,2804.5,2838.9, 2839.8 through 

2839.10, 2840.4, Sec. 2898: Publication of Schedule of Filing and Related Fees, 5 1 DCR 8606 
(9-3-04) 

Chapter 28, Rules of Pract~ce and Procedure, EXPIRES 120 DAYS, 5 1 DCR 9322 (10-1-04) (OAH) 
Chapter 28, Rules of Practice and Procedure, 52 DCR 720 (January 28,2005) OAH 
Chapter 29, Appellate Rules of Practice and Procedure, 51 DCR 6433 (6-25-04) ( O M )  
Chapter 56, Review and Approval of Information Technology Procurements, 5 1 DCR 1 15 17 (1 2-1 7-04) 

(CTO) 

DCMR Title 3/Elections and Ethics (June 1998 ed.) 

Chapter 1, Organization of the Board of Elections and Ethics, Sec. 102,46 DCR 6976 (8-27-99) (BEE) 
Chapter 4, Hearings, §§ 400.1,408.1,408.6,428.6 through 428.9, New Sec. 432: Alternative Dispute 

Resolution Procedures for Help America Vote Act Complaints, 50 DCR 11071 (12-26-03) (BEE) 
Chapter 4, Hearings, Sec. 430: Subpoenas and Depositions; and Sec. 43 1 : Service of Subpoena and Notice 

of Deposition, 45 DCR 7349 (10-9-98) (BEE) 
Chapter 5, Voter Registration, Chapter 6, Eligbility of Candidates, Chapter 9, Filling Vacancies, Chapter 

11, Recall of Elected Officials, and Chapter 16, Candidates: Delegate US .  House of 
Representatives, Mayor, Chairman, and Members of the Council of D.C., US Senator, US 
,Representative, Members of the Board of Education, and Advisory Neighborhood Commissions to 
be in Compliance With DC Law 13-159, "School Governance Chapter Amendment Act of 2000", 
49 DCR 2737 (3-22-02) (BEE) 

Chapter 5, Voter Registration, 98 500.8, 5 10.9 & 5 10.10,50 DCR 11071 (12-26-03) (BEE) 
Chapter 7, Elections Procedures; and Chapter 8, Tabulation and Certification of Election Results, 5 1 DCR. 

7401 (7-30-04) (BEE) 
Chapter 7, Election Procedures, $ 4  703.1,703.2, 703.3, 710.4, 722.2 , 722.4 through 722.7, 

50 DCK 1107 1 (12-26-03) (BEE) 



. . 
DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA REGISTER 

DCMR Title 3lElections and Ethics Continued 

Chapter 7, Elections Procedures, Sec. 7 13 : Vote Casting Procedures: Regular Ballot, $ $ 7 13.10 through 
713.15; and Sec. 723: Closing the Polls, $ 723.1, 5 1 DCR 271 8 (3-12-04) (BEE) 

Chapter 7, Election Procedures; and Chapter 8 (Tabulation and Certification of Election Results), 
EXPIRES 120 DAYS, 5 1 DCR 5038 (5-14-04) (BEE) 

Chapter 8, Tabulation and Certification of Election Results, Sec. 8 19: Voting System Standards, 
48 DCR 4lO4a (5-1 1-01) (BEE) 

Chapter 8, Tabulation and Certification of Election Results, EXPIRES 120 DAYS, 5 1 DCR 5038 
, (5-14-04) (BEE) 

Chapter 10, Initiative Referendum, $$1003.6 (a) & (e); 1006.3 (e); 1007.4 (g); 1009.9 (G) & Appendix 10- 
1,46 DCR 6977 (8-27-99) (BEE) 

Chapter 10, Initiative and Referendum; Chapter 11, Recal,l of Elected Officials; Chapter 13, Filling Vacant 
Seats on Advisory Neighborhood Commissions; Chapter 14, Candidates: Political Party Primaries 
for Presidential Preference and Convention Delegates; Chapter 15, Candidates: Electors of 
President and Vice-president; Chapter 16, Candidates: Delegate US.  House of Representatives, 
Mayor, Chairman, and Members of the Council of District of Columbia, U.S. Commissions, and 
Chapter 17, Candidates: Members and Officials of Local Committee of Political Parties and 
National Committee Persons; to Clarify the Proper Method by Which Challenges to Petitions are 
to be Expressed, 47 DCR 5927 (7-28-00) 

Chapter 13, Filling a Vacant Seats on Advisory Neighborhood Commissions; Chapter 14, Candidates: 
Political Party Primaries for Presidential Preference and Convention Delegates; Chapter 15, 
Candidates: Electors of President and Vice-president; Chapter 16, Candidates: Delegate US.  
House of Representatives, Mayor, Chairman, and Members of the Council of the District of 
Columbia, US.  11 Senator, U.S. Representative, Members of the Board of Education and Advisory 
Neighborhood Commissions; and Chapter 17, Candidates: Members and Officials of Local 
Committees of Political Parties and National Committee Persons, 46 DCR 4335 (5-14-99) (BEE) 

Chapter 15, Candidates: Electors of President and Vice President, Chapter 16, Candidates: Delegate US 
House of Representatives, Mayor, Chairman, and Members of the Council of D.C., US Senator, 
US Representative, Members of the Board of Education and Advisory Neighborhood 
Commissions, and Chapter 17, Candidates: Members and Officials of Local Committees of 
Political Parties and National Committee Persons to be in Compliance with DC Law 14-43, 
"Nominating Petitions Signature Amendment Act of 2001", 49 DCR 2740 (3-22-02) (BEE) 

Chapter 16, Candidates: Delegate U.S. House of Representatives, Mayor, Chairman, and Members of the 
Council of D.C., U.S. Senator, U.S. Representative, Members of the Board of Education and 
Advisory Neighborhood Commission, $ 1607.8, 51 DCR 7434 (7-30-04) (BEE) 

Chapter 18, Charter Amending Procedures, Sec. 1805: Date of Election, $l805.1,47 DCR 5930 (7-28-00) 
(BEE) 

Chapter 15, Candidates: Electors of President and Vice-president), Sec. 1500: Nomination of Candidates 
by Message, $1500.9; 50 DCR 6696 (8-15-03) (BEE) 

Chapter 18, Charter Amending Procedures, Sec. 1805: Date of Election, 48 DCR 4105 (5-1 1-01) (BEE) 
Chapter 20, Freedom of Information, 46 DCR 1191 (2-12-99) (BEE) 
Chapter 30, Campaign Finance Operations, $$3000,3002,3004,3008-3009, 301 1, 3015 & 3017; Chapter 

3 1, Lobbying, $3100; Chapter 32, Financial Disclosure), 493201-3202; Chapter 33, Conflict of 
Interest, 93300; Chapter 34, Campaign Finance Record Keeping, $3400; and Chapter 37, 
Investigations and Hearings, $3709,47 DCR 21 71 (3-24-00) (BEE) 

Chapter 30, Campaign Finance Operations, $$3002 - 3003; Chapter 3 1, Lobbying, $43 100 et al; 
and Chapter 32, Financial Disclosure, $$3201 - 3202, to Implement DC Law 13-79, Campaign 



MAR 4 - 2005 

DCMR Title 3/Elections and Ethics Continued 

Chapter 30, Campaign Finance Operations, $$3005, 3008,3010-301 1,3013, and 3017; Chapter 3 1, 
Lobbyng, $43 103-3104; Chapter 32, Financial Disclosure, $3200; Chapter 33, Conflict of 
Interest, $93300 & 3301-2; and Chapter 37, Investigations, $371 1,49 DCR 2731 (3-22-02) (BEE) 

Chapter 30, Campaign Finance Operations, Sec. 30 1 1 : Limitations on Contributions, 930 1 1.2, EXPIRES 
1-5-01, 47 DCR 7510 (9-15-00) (BEE) 

Chapter 3 1, Lobbying, $$3 100 et al, to Implement DC Law 13-79, Campaign Finance Reform Amendment 
Act of 1999,47 DCR 5919 (7-28-00) (BEE) 

Chapter 32, Financial Disclosure, 993201 - 3202, to Implement DC Law 13-79, Campaign Finance 
Reform Amendment Act of 1999,47 DCR 59 19 (7-28-00) (BEE) 

Chapter 37, Investigations and Hearings, Sec. 37 1 1 : Schedule of Fines, $37 1 1.3,48 DCR 47 1 (1-1 9-0 1) 
(BEE) 

DCMR Title 41Human Rights and Relations (March 1995 ed.) 

Chapter 1, Complaints of Discrimination in D.C. To Clarify the Time for Filing Complaints and to 
Eliminate the Right to Appeal to the City Administrator, 43 DCR 6569 (12-13-96) (OM) 

Chapter 2 ,Guidelines for Payment of Compensatory Damages, Civil Penalties, and Attorney's Fees Under 
the Human Rights Act of 1977,46 DCR 2804 (3-19-99) (CHR) 

Chapter 5, Employment Guidelines, Sec. 508: Family Responsibilities Guidelines, 48 DCR 4662 (5-25-0 1) 
(OHR & CHR) 

Chapter 10, Housing and Commercial Space , 99 1000, 100 1 & 1002 to Clarify Certain Prohibited 
Discriminatory Practices and Exceptions Under the Human hghts Act and Federal Fair Housing 
Act, 46 DCR 4339 (5-14-99) (HRLBD) 

DCMR Title 51Board of Education (December 2002 ed.) 

Chapter 1, By-Laws of the Board, Sec. 104: Duties of the Officers of the Board, 9 104.10, 50 DCR 8806 
(1 0-1 7-03) (BOE) 

Chapter 1, By-Laws of the Board, Sec. 105: Meetings of the Board of Education; Regular Meetings; Sec. 
109: Committees of the Board of Education; Sec, 109: Meetings of Board Committees, 
50 DCR 8807 (1 0- 17-03) (BOE) 

Chapter 1, By-Laws, Sec. 110: Meetings of the Board Committees, $1 10.3, EXPIRES 120 DAYS, 
49 DCR 11314 (12-13-02) (BOE) 

Chapter 4, Parent and Community Involvement in Education, Sec. 401: Parent Involvement in the D.C. 
Public Schools; and Sec. 404: Definitions, 50 DCR 6166 (8-1-03) (BOE) 

Chapter 9, Public Charter School Policies), $ 903.1, EXPIRES 120 DAYS, 5 1 DCR 1 1862 (BOE) 
Chapter 10, General Personnel Policies, Sec. 102 1 : Reappointment, $9 102 1.1 - 102 1.6, 5 1 DCR 6026 

(6- 1 1 -04) (BOE) 
Chapter 16, License Requirements, Sec. 1667: Administrative Services Credentialing, 5 1 DCR 6445 

(6-25-04) 
Chapter 16, License Requirements, Sec. 1667: Administrative Services Credentialing, 9 1667.4 (a)@), 

EXPIRES 120 DAYS, 5 1 DCR 8383 (8-27-04) (BOE) 
Chapter 20, Admission of Students, Sec. 2008: Computation of Nonresident Tuition Rates, 9 2008.13, to 

Establish a Schedule of 2003-04 Non-Resident Tuition Rates, 50 DCR 9067 (1 0-24-03) (SEO) 
Chapter 20, Admission of Students, Sec. 2008: Computation of Nonresident Tuition Rates, tj 2008.13, 

2004-2005 Non-Resident Tuition Rates 5 1 DCR 7301 (7-23-04) (SEO) 



DCMR Title 5JBoard of Education Continued 

Chapter 2 1, Attendance and Transfers, Sec. 2 106: Out-of-Boundary Transfers, 4 5 2 106.1 - 2 106.4; and 
Sec. 2199: Definitions, 50 DCR 1850 (2-28-03) (BOE) 

Chapter 22, Grades, Promotion and Graduation, Sec. 2203: Graduation: Academic Requirements, § 
2203.1,5 1 DCR 6024 (6-1 1-04) (BOE) 

Chapter 27, Interscholastic Athletics, Sec. 270 1 : Eligibility of Participation, $ 270 1.3 (j), EXPIRES 120 
DAYS, 5 1 DCR 765 1 (8-6-04) Q30E) 

Chapter 30, Special Education Policy (New), 50 DCR 1854 (2-28-03) (BOE) 
Chapter 30, Special Education Policy, $5 3001.1,3002.2, 3003.1, 3003.6, 3006.6,3022.1,3027.5,3029.5 

& 3030.3,50 DCR 8810 (10-17-03) (BOE) 
Chapter 37, Procurement and Negotiated Service Contracts, $53700.5 - 3700.7 to Meet Requirements of 

D.C. Law 12-268,50 DCR 1903 (2-28-03) (BOE) 
Chapter 38, State Education Agency Functions of the Board of Education, Secs. 3804,3805,3806, 3807, 

3808 & 3809, to Enable the State Education Agency to Comply with the Unsafe School Choice 
Option Requirements of P.L. 107-1 10,51 DCR 271 1 (3-12-04) (BOE) 

DCMR Title GlGovernment Personnel* 

Chapter 2, Retention of Rights and Benefits, 27 DCR 4342 (10-3-80)(DCOP) 
Chapter 3, Sec. 301, Residency Preference in Career Service Employment, 37 DCR 41 17 

(6-22-9O)@COP) 
Chapter 3, Residency, 37 DCR 85 1 (1-26-90)@COP) 
Chapter 3, Residency, §§301.14, 304.1, 304.3, 304.7 - 304.9, 305.7 & 399.1, EXPIRES 120 DAYS, 

47 DCR 2453 (4-7-00) (DCOP & MFD) 
Chapter 3, Sec. 302, Residency Preference in Employment for Attorneys Appointed Under D.C. Code 

l-6lO.9,40 DCR 2485 (4-16-93)(DCOP) 
Chapter 3, Residency to Authorize Waiver of Residency Requirement for Certain Hard-to-Fill Positions in 

the Executive Service and Implement Waiver Provisions Applicable to the Office of the Inspector 
General, EXPIRES 120 days, 46 DCR 10353 (12-17-99) (DCOP & MPD) 

Chapter 3, Residency, $6 301.14,303.1,304.1,304.3, 304.7,304.8,304.9, 305.7 & 399.1,47 DCR 2416 
(4-7-00) @COP & MPD) 

Chapter 3, Residency, $303.1; and Chapter 24, Reductions In Force, EXPIRES 120 DAYS, 47 DCR 2462 
(4-7-00) (DCOP & W D )  

Chapter 3, Residency, $4 305.9, 305.10 & 307.18,51 DCR 9309 (10-1-04) (DCOP) 
Chapter 4, Organization for Personnel Management - Amended, 33 DCR 4447 (7-25-86)(DCOP) 
Chapter 4, Office of Personnel Management, 32 DCR 75 (1-4-85)(DCOP) 
Chapter 4, Organization for Personnel Management, 5 1 DCR 928 (1-23-04) (DCOP) 
Chapter 4, Organization for Personnel Management, Sec. 412: Criminal Background Checks in District 

Government Agencies that Provide Direct Services to Children and Youth, EXPIRES 120 DAYS, 
5 1 DCR 9724 (1 0- 15-04) (DCOPO 

Chapter 4, Organization for Personnel Management, 5 1 DCR 11591 (12-24-04) (DCOP) 
Chapter 4, Organization for Personnel Management, Sec. 412: Criminal Background Check and Traffic 

Record Check Requirements - District Government Agencies Considered Covered Child or Youth 
Service; Sec. 499: Definitions, EXPIRES120 DAYS, 52 DCR 1006 (2-4-05) (DCOP) 

Chapter 5, Public Employee Relations Board Rules to Implement Comprehensive Merit Personnel Act, 37 
DCR 5267 (8-10-90)(PERB) 

Chapter 5, Sec. 500: General Provisions, 42 DCR 6383 (1 1-17-95)(PERl3) 
Chapter 5,'Rules of the Public Employee Relations Board), Sec. 552: Subpoenas, $ 552.7, 50 DCR 9580 

(1 1-14-03) ( P E N )  



MAR 4 - 2005 

DCMR Title 6lGovernment Personnel Continued* 

Chapter 4, Sec. 500: General Provisions; Sec. 544: Standards of Conduct; and 559: Finality of Board 
Decision and Order, 46 DCR 8276 (10-15-99) (PERB) 

Chapter 5, Sec. 500.4, General Provisions, 44 DCR 3504 (6-20-97)(PERB)) 
Chapter 5, Sec. 520: Unfair Labor Practice Complaints, 4520.15; and Sec. 544: Standards of Conduct 
Complaints, $544.8,44 DCR 7448 (12-5-97) (PERB) 
Chapter 5, Sec. 560: Enforcement, 4560.1,43 DCR 5270 (9-27-96) (PERB) 
Chapter 6, Rules and Regulations of the Office of Employee Appeals, 39 DCR 7404 (1 0-2-92) (OEA) 
Chapter 6, Rules and Regulations of the Office of Employee Appeals ,46  DCR 9297 (1 1-19-99)(OEA) 
Chapter 7, Sec. 700, Equal Employment Opportunity, 27 DCR 5038 (I 1-14-8O)@COP) 
Chapter 7, Sec. 703, Veteran Preference - Amended, 30 DCR 4604 (9-9-83)(DCOP) 
Chapter 8, Sec. 807.1, Firefighter Appointments, 32 DCR 1364 (3-8-85)(DCOP) 

' 

Chapter 8, Career Service, Secs. 81 1 & 848, Rescinded, 5 1 DCR 9706 (10-15-04) @COP) 
Chapter 8, Career Service, $8 13.4 to Extend Probationary Period for Certain Employees in the Fire and 

Emergency Medical Services Department, 49 DCR 6842 (7-19-02) (DCOP) 
Chapter 8, Career Service, $4 823.3, 823.4, 824.7, 824.8, 824.9 & 829.1 (g) Governing Non-Competitive 

Appointments in the Career Service, 47 DCR 2419 (4-7-00) (DCOP & MPD) 
Chapter 8, Career Service, $4  823.3, 823.4, 824.7, 824.8, 824.9 & 829.1 (g) Governing Non-Competitive 

Appointments in the Career Service, EXPIRES 120 DAYS, 47 DCR 2456, (4-7-00) (DCOP & 

W D )  
Chapter 8, Career Service, Sec. 849: Attorney Certificate of Good Standing Filing Requirement, 

51 DCR 10410 (11-12-04) @COP) 
Chapter 8, Sec. 870, Career Service - Amended, Processing Entry-Level Candidates for Police Officer and 

Firefighter Positions, 33 DCR 4299 (7-1 8-86)(DCOP) 
Chapter 8, Sec. 870.9@), Correction to Notice of Final Rulemaking Amending Chapter 8 of D.C. 

Personnel Regulations, 32 DCR 2953 (5-24-85)(DCOP)(Errata) 
Chapter 8, Career Service - Amended, 32 DCR 2473 (5-3-85)(DCOP) 
Chapter 8, Career Service, Sec. 871: Processing Candidates for Police Sergeant, Lieutenant, and Captain 

Positions; Sec. 872: Appointment to Inspector, Commander and Assistant Chief of Police, and 
Sec. 873: Processing Entry-Level Candidates for Police Officer Positions, 45 DCR 45 1 (1-23-98) 
(MPD) 

Chapter 8, Career Service, Sec. 871: Processing Candidates for Police Sergeant, Lieutenant, and Captain 
Positions; Sec. 872: Appointment to Inspector, Comrnander and Assistant Chief of Police, 
EXPIRES 3-18-99,45 DCR 106 (1-1-99) (MPD) 

Chapter 8, Career Service, Sec:. 871: Processing Candidates for Police Sergeant, Lieutenant, and Captain 
Positions; and Sec. 872: Appointment to Inspector, Commander and Assistant Chief of Police, 
49 DCR 1859 (3-1-02) (MPD) 

Chapter 8, Career Service, Sec. 876, Processing Candidates for Fire Sergeant, Lieutenant, and Captain 
Positions, 3 1 DCR 27 15 (6-1 -84)pCOP) 

Chapter 8, Sec. 870, Processing Entry-Level Candidates for Police and Firefighter Positions, 30 DCR 2555 
(5-27-83)(DCOP) 

Chapter 8, Career Service, Sec. 874: D.C. Police Training and Standards Board, 48 DCR 8973 (9-28-01) 
W D )  

Chapter 8, Career Service) to Amend Regulations Governing the Promotion of Officers to Police Sergeant, 
Lieutenant, and Captain Positions, EXPIRES 120 DAYS, 48 DCR 10942 (1 1-30-01) (MPD) 

Chapter 8, career Service, Sec. 874: Ketirement'Resignation of Members While Under Disciplinary 
Investigation, 49 DCR 8368 (8-30-02) (MPD) 

Chapter 8, Sec. 875, Promotion of Battalion Chief, Deputy Fire Chief, & Assistant Fire Chief, 
30 DCR 4608 (9-9-83)(DCOP) 



DCRIR Title 6/Government Personnel Continued* 

Chapter 8, Career Service), Sec. 877: RetirementResignation of Members While Under Disciplinary 
Investigation (ERRATA Notice), 49 DCR 9298 (10-1 1-02) O\/LPD) 
Chapter 9, Secs. 904,907 & 908, Excepted Service Amended, 36 DCR 793 1 (1 1-17-89)@COP) 
Chapter 9, Excepted Service - Amended, 32 DCR 2271 (4-26-85)(DCOP) 
Chapter 9, Secs. 908.10, 9 10.1 & 9 10.2, Excepted Service Amended, 39 DCR 6 17 1 (8-7-92) P C P )  
Chapter 9, Excepted Service to Modify Provisions Concerning Appointments to the Excepted Service, 

EXPIKES 120 days, 46 DCR 40 18 (4-30-99) (DCOP) 
Chapter 9, Excepted Service, 47 DCR 8093 (10-6-00) (DCOP & MPD) 
Chapter 9, Excepted Service, 50 DCR 4743 (6-1 3-03 (DCOP) 
Chapter 9, Excepted Service, Sec. 915: Certificate of Good Standing Filing Requirement, 50 DCR 10565 

(12-12-03) @COP) 
Chapter 9, Excepted Service, Sec. 915: Attorney Certificate of Good Standing Filing Requirement, 

5 1 DCR 10416 (1 1-12-04) (DCOP) 
Chapter 9, Excepted Service, Sec. 915: Attorney Certificate of Good Standing Filing Requirement 

(Corrected Notice), 5 1 DCR 10934 (1 1-26-04) (DOMV) 
Chapter 10, Sec. 1005, Notice to Rescind Notice of Final Rulemalung, Retreat Rights of Exec. Service 

Employees, Pub. at 3 1 DCR 6494 dated 12-21-84, 32 DCR 2372 (4-26-85) (Errata - DCOP) 
Chapter 10, Executive Service, 28 DCR 1325 (3-27-81)(DCOP) 
Chapter 10, Deferred Compensation Plan, 32 DCR 4036 (7-12-85)(DCOP) 
Chapter 10, Executive Service, 47 DCR 4435 (5-26-00) @COP) 
Chapter 10, Executive Service, 47 DCR 6224 (8-4-00) @COP) 
Chapter 10, Executive Service, 50 DCR 4254 (5-30-03) @COP) 
Chapter 10, Executive Service, 50 DCR 6707 (8-15-03) (DCOP) 
Chapter 10, Executive Service, $ 1000.2, Sec. 1005: Performance Incentives; Sec. 1006: Additional 

Income Allowance for Medical Officers, 4 1006.1 ; Sec., 1007: Separation Pay; Sec. 1008: 
Universal Leave, 5 1 DCR 90 17 (9- 1 7-04) (DCOP) 

Chapter 1 1, Classification, 28 DCR 23 18 (5-22-8 l)(DCOP) 
Chapter 1 1, Classification - Amended, 29 DCR 1225 (3-19-82)(DCOP) 
Chapter 11, Classification, Sec. 1152, Additional Income Allowance for Medical and Dental Officers, 

37 DCR 6361 (10-5-90)PCOP) 
Chapter 1 1, Classification andcompensation, Sec. 1154: Recruitment and Retention Incentives - Child and 

Family Services Agency, 48 DCR 41 79 (5-1 1-0 1) (DCOP) 
Chapter 11, Sec. 1155, Compensation - Operation Desert Shield and Desert Storm Pay Differential, 

39 DCR 2072 (3-27-92)@COP) 
Chapter 1 1, Classification and compensation, Sec. 1 156: Operation Enduring Freedom Pay Differential, 

EXPIRES 120 DAYS, 49 DCR 5 820 (6-2 1-02) (DCOP) 
Chapter 11, Sec. 1162, Classification and Compensation; Voluntary Severance Incentive Program, 

EXPIRED, 42 DCR 2362, pub. May 12, 1995 
Chapter 1 1, Sec. 1 162: Voluntary Severance Incentive Program, Expires 120 days, 42 DCR 3530 

(7-7-95) @COP) [EXPRED] 
Chapter 1 1, Classification and Compensation, Secs. 1 160, 1 16 1, 1 162, 1 163 & 1 169 Governing Easy Out, 

Early Out, and Voluntary Severance Incentive Programs for the Public Housing Authority, 
EXl'lREiD, 43 DCR 605 (2-9-96)(DCOP) 

Chapter 1 1, Classification and Compensation, Secs. 1 1 10, 1 1 14, & 1 1 15, EXPIRES 120 days, 
46 DCR 4767 (5-28-99) (DCOP) 

Chapter 11, Classification and compensation, §§1110.1 - 11 10.6, 11 14.1 - 11 14.4, 11 15.3, 11 15.5, & 
11 15.7, and New Sec. 1153: Employment and Salary Reduction of Reemployed Annuitants, 
47 DCR 2421 (4-7-00) (DCOP & MPD) 



DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA REGISTER 

I '  DCMR Title 6lGovernment Personnel Continued* 

Chapter 11, Classification and Compensation, §§ 11 10.1 - 11 10.6, 11 14.1 - 11 14.4, 11 15.3, 11 15.5 & 
1 1 15.7, and New Sec. 1 153 : Employment and Salary Reduction of Reemployed Annuitants, 
EXPllFES 120 DAYS, 47 DCR 2458 (4-7-00) @COP & MPD) 

Chapter 11, Classification and Compensation, Sec. 1156: Operation Enduring Freedom Pay Differential, 
EXPIRES 1-21-03 DAYS, 49 DCR 1 1049 (12-6-02) @COP) 

Chapter 11, Class~fication and Compensat~on, Secs. 1164 & 1165, EXPIRES 120 DAYS, 47 DCR 5668 
(7-7-00) @COP & MPD) 

Chapter 11 Classification and Compensation, Secs. 1170 & 1175 to Implement the D.C. Pre-Tax Benefits 
Program, 48 DCR 5004 (6-1-01) (DCOP) 

Chapter 1 1, compensation) to Implement the D.C. Pre-Tax Benefits Program, EXPIRES 120 DAYS, 
47 DCR 1207 (2-9-01) @COP & MPD) 

Chapter 1 1, Classification and Compensation, Sec. 1 155: Operation Enduring Freedom and Operation 
Iraqi Freedom Pay Differential, EXPIRES 120 DAYS, 5 1 DCR 7655 (8-6-04) (DCOP) 

Chapter 11, Classification and Compensation, 52 DCR 934 (2-4-05)@COP) 
Chapter 1 1, Classification and Compensation, Sec. 1 155: Operation Enduring Freedom and Operation 

Iraqi Freedom Pay Differential EXPIRES 120 DAYS 52 DCK 133 1 (2-1 1-04)@COP) 
Chapter 12, Secs. 1250 - 1299, Rules to Allow District Employees to Donate a Portion of Their Annual 

Leave to an Annual Leave Bank, 40 DCR 1292 (2-12-93)@COP) 
Chapter 12, Hours of Work, Legal Holidays and Leave); and Add New Sec. 1259: Excused Absence in 

Connection with Serving as a Bone Marrow or Organ Donor, 49 DCR 9056 (1 0-4-02) @COP) 
Chapter 13, Secs. 1302 - 13 13, Enlployee Development - Amended, 32 DCR 3 173 (6-7-85)@COP) 
Chapter 13, Employee Development, 30 DCR 5865 (1 1-1 1-83)@COP) 
Chapter 13, Employee Development, 5 1 DCR 89 (1 -2-04) @COP) 
Chapter 14, Performance Evaluation, 28 DCR 4961 (1 1-20-81)@COP) 
Chapter 14, Performance Management, 47 DCR 5560 (7-7-00) @COP & MPD) 
Chapter 14, Performance Management, 5 1400.1 (a), (b) & (c), EXPIRES 120 DAYS, 47 DCR 7 147 

(9-1-00) (DCOP & MPD) 
Chapter 14, Performance Evaluation, 48 DCR 30 1 (1 - 12-0 1) (DCOP & MPD) 
Chapter 14, Performance Management, to Add Certain Uniformed Members of MPD, 49 DCR 1862 

(3-1 -02) @COP & MPD) 
Chapter 14, Performance Management, 50 DCR 285 1 (4-1 1-03) (DCOP) 
Chapter 14, Performance Management, 52 DCR 1302 (2-1 1-05) @COP) 
Chapter 16, Adverse Actions and Grievances, 34 DCR 1845 (3-20-87)(DCOP) 
Chapter 16, Secs. 160 1.1, 1603 & 1618, Adverse Actions and Grievances - Amended, 37 DCR 8297 

(1 2-2 1 -9O)(DCOP) 
Chapter 16, Adverse Actions and Grievances, Sec. 1603: Definition of Cause, 46 DCR 7208 (9-10-99) 

(DCOP) 
Chapter 16, General Discipline and Grievances, 47 DCR 7094 (9- 1-00) (DCOP) 
Chapter 16, General Discipline and Grievances, 49 DCR 11781 (12-27-02) @COP) 
Chapter 16, General Discipline and Grievances, Sec. 163 1.1 (x)(y) & (z), 50 DCR 3 185 (4-25-03) (DCOP) 
Chapter 16, General Discipline and Grievances, 5 1 DCR 795 1 (8-1 3-04) (DCOP) 
Chapter 18, Sec. 1805.2, Employee Conduct - Amended, 36 DCR 3860 (6-2-89)(DCOP) 
Chapter 18, Sec. 1804, Employee Conduct - Amended, 35 DCR 764 (2-5-88) (DCOP) 
Chapter 18, Employee Conduct, 33 DCR 6794 (10-3 1-86)@COP) 
Chapter 18, Employee Conduct, $8 1803.4 - l803.12,48 DCR 9639 (10-19-01) (DCOP) 
Chapter 18, Employee Conduct, $81803.7 & 1803.8,48 DCR 3074 (4-6-01) @COP) 
Chapter 18, Sec. 1816, Government Contracts, 40 DCR 8358 (12-3-93)(DCOP) 
Chapter 18, Employee Conduct, Sec. 1803, 8 1803.13,50 DCR 105 17 (12-5-03) (DCOP) 
Chapter 19, Secs. 1901.3, & 1914, Incentive Awards -Amended, 31 DCR 993 (3-2-84)(DCOP) 



MAR 4 - 2005 

DCMR Title GIGovernment Personnel Continued* 

Chapter 19, Incentive Awards - Amended, 29 DCR 1517 (4-9-82) (DCOP) 
Chapter 19, Incentive Awards, 47 DCR 8102 (10-6-00) (DCOP & MPD) 
Chapter 19, Incentive Awards, 50 DC 2244 (3-14-03 (DCOP) 
Chapter 20, Health, Sec. 2049: Pre-Employment and Other Physical Examinations and General Medical. 

Qualifications Requirements; and Sec. 2050: Employee Assistance Program, 5 1 DCR 10422 (1 1- 
12-04) (DCOP) 

Chapter 20, Sec. 2050, Employee Assistance Program, 40 DCR 7649 (1 1-5-93)(DCOP) 
Chapter 21, Health Benefits, 27 DCR 2055 (5-16-80)@COP) 
Chapter 2 1, Sec. 2130, Continued Health Benefits Coverage, 39 DCR 6 172 (8-21-92)(DCOP) 
Chapter 21, Health Benefits, Sec. 2 129: Optional Self-Financed Health Benefits Coverage for Domestic 

Partners; and Sec. 2130: Continued Health Benefits coverage; and 2199: Definitions, 
50 DCR 3027 (4-18-03) (DCOP) 

Chapter 22, Life Insurance Benefits, 4 1 DCR 3235 (6-1 0-94)(DCOP) 
Chapter 22, Life Insurance Benefits - Amended (Viatica1 Settlements), 44 DCR 2833 (4-9-97)(DCOP) 
Chapter 22, Life Insurance Benefits - Amended, 44 DCR 5368 (9-19-97)(DCOP) 
Chapter 24, Secs. 2401,2402,2404,2414,241 5,2416,2422 & 2435, Reductions in Force - Amended, 

40 DCR 2 1 14 (3-26-93)(DCOP) 
Chapter 24, Secs. 2460 - 2488, Rules for Modified Reduction In Force (Downsizing), 44 DCR 3933 

(7-1 1-97)(DCOP) 
Chapter 24, Reductions in Force - Amended, 47 DCR 2425 (4-7-00) (DCOP & MPD) 
Chapter 24, Reductions In Force, 50 DCR 10573 (12-12-03) @COP) 
Chapter 25, Political Rights of Employees, 29 DCR 3799 (9-3-82)(DCOP & MPD)) 
Chapter 26, Defined Contribution Pension Plan, 37 DCR 954 (2-2-90)(DCOP) 
Chapter 26, Secs. 2602.9,2603.5(a), & 2606.4, Defined Contribution Pension Plan - Amended, 

38. DCR 2 130 (4-12-91)(DCOP) 
Chapter 26, Retirement Benefits, 27 DCR 2223 (5-23-8O)(DCOP) 
Chapter 27, Temporary Assignment 36 DCR 8069 (1 1-24-89)(DCOP) 
Chapter 27, Temporary Assignment of Personnel, Secs. 2700 - 2704,44 DCR 1670 (3-21-97) (DCOP) 
Chapter 27, Temporary Assignment of Personnel, Secs. 2700,2701, and New Sec. 2702: Assignment of 

Employees From Private Sector Organizations to District Government, 2704 & 2705, 
49 DCR 1272 (2-15-02) (DCOP) 

Chapter 27, Temporary Assignment of Personnel), Sec. 2702: Assignment of Employees From Private 
Sector Organizations to District Government; and Sec. 2705: Travel Expenses, 49 DCR 487 1 
(5-24-02) (DCOP) 

Chapter 28, Agreements Authorized, 28 DCR 3 328 (7-24-8 l)(DCOP) 
Chapter 29, Employee Debt Set-Offs, 34 DCR 6996 (10-30-87)(DCOP) 
Chapter 29, Employee Debt Set-Offs, $ 4  2901.3 & 2902.7,47 DCR 2446 (4-7-00) (DCOP & MPD) 
Chapter 29, Employee Debt Set-Offs, $6 2901.3 & 2902.7, EXPIRES 120 DAYS, 47 DCR 2484 (4-7-00) 

(DCOP & MPD) 
Chapter 3 1, Records Management and Privacy of Records, 28 DCR 4288 (10-2-8 l)(DCOP) 
Chapter 3 1, Records Management and Privacy of Records), $3 102.3 to Add the DC Office of Labor 

Relations and Collective Bargaining to the List of "Law Enforcement Authorities", 48 DCR 5824 
(6-22-01) (DCOP) 

Chapter 31, Records Management and Privacy of Records, $931 18.13(c) & 3122.4,46 DCR 2372 (3-5-99) 
@COP) 

Chapter 34, Annual Report, 28 DCR 2 159 (5-15-8 l)(DCOP) 
Chapter 35, Annual Report (REPEALED), 46 DCR 2373 (3-5-99) (DCOP) 
Chapter 36, Legal Service, 47 DCR 7371 (9-8-00) (OCC) 



DCMR Title GIGovernment Personnel Continued* 

Chapter 36, Legal Service, Secs. 3603,3604,3605,3606,3607,3615,3616 & 3699, EXPIRES 120 
DAYS, 49 DCR 8568 (9-13-02) (OCC) 

Chapter 36, Legal Service, Secs. 3603,3604,3605,3606, & 3616 3615,50 DCR 3461 (5-2-03) (OCC) 
Chapter 36, Legal Service, Sec. 3605: Evaluation of Performance - Line Attorneys, $9 3605.5, 3605.6 & 

3605.7, 5 1 DCR 1431 (2-6-04) (OCC) 
Chapter 36, Legal Service, Sec. 3617: Certificate of Good Standing Filing Requirement, 50 DCR 10569 

(1 2-1 2-03) (DCOP) 
Chapter 36, Legal Service, Sec. 3617: Attorney Certificate of Good Standing Filing Requirement, 

5 1 DCR 1043 1 (1 1-12-04) @COP) 
Chapter 36 (Legal Service), Sec 3605: Evaluation of Performance - Office of the Attorney General for the 

District of Columbia Line Attorneys, EXPIRES 120 DAYS, 52 DCR 1917 (2-28-05)(OAG) 
Ch.apter 37, Appointment, Reappointment, Discipline and Removal of Administrative Law Judges, 

5 1 DCR 7033 (7-16-04) (DMIPSJ) 
Chapter 38, Management Supervisory Service, EXPIRES ,120 DAYS, 48 DCR 2812 (3-30-01) (DCOP & 

W D )  
Chapter 38, Management Supervisory Service, 51 DCR 9707 (10-15-04) @COP) 
Chapter 3 8, Management Supervisory Service, Sec. 3 8 17 Performance Evaluation System for Management 

Supervisory Service Employees; Sec. 38 18: Employee Rights, 52 DCR 13 14 (2-1 1-05) @COP) 
Chapter 38 (Management Supervisory Service) - To Correct Final Rules Published at 52 DCR 13 14 

(2-1 1-05), 52 DCR 1913 (2-28-05) (DCOP) ERRATA 
Chapter 39, Testing for the Presence of Controlled Substances and Alcohol, Sec. 3900: Drivers of 

Commercial Motor Vehicles, EXPlRES 120 days, 46 DCR 4021 (4-30-99) (DCOP) 
Chapter 39, Testing for the Presence of Controlled Substances and Alcohol, 47 DCR 793; 1 (9-29-00) 

@COP & Ml'D) 
Chapter 39, Testing for the Presence of Controlled Substances an,d Alcohol, 52 DCR 1021 (2-4-05) 

W O P )  
Chapter 40, Utilization of Voluntary Services, 29 DCR 5405 (12-10-82)(DCOP) 
Chapter 41, Furlough and Delay of WithinGrade Salary Increases, 40 DCR 1289 (2-12-93)(0M) 

DCMR Title 6NYolice Personnel (May 1.988 ed.1 

Chapter 1, Repeal §§103.8, 103.9, 103.13, 103.14, 103.15, 103.16 through 103.19, Sccs. 206,302 & 303 
of the Omnibus Police Reform Amendment Act of 2000, effective 10-4-00 (DC Law 13-160), 47 
DCR 461 9 (DC LAW) 

Chapter 1, Secs. 105 - 110, Regarding Procedures for Rehlring of Retired Police Officers, 40 DCR 249 
(1 -2 1 -94)(MPD) 

Chapter 2, General Rules, Sec. 206: Badges, Cap Plates, Identification Cards, and Revolvers, $206.1, DC 
Act 14403 effective 10-1-02,49 DCR 6968 (7-26-02) (DC ACT) 

Chapter 3, Police Officers Outside Employment Amendment Act of 1996, effectzve July 26, 1996, D.C. 
Law 11-151,43 DCR 2838 (D.C. Law) 

Chapter 3, 4301.4 , Secs. 206,302 & 303 of the Omnibus Police Reform Amendment Act of 2000, 
effective 10-4-00 (DC Law 13-160), 47 DCR 4619 (DC LAW) 

Chapter 4, Sex Offender Registry, 47 DCR 15 11 (3-10-00) (MPD) 
Chapter 4, Sex Offender Registry), Secs, 412 - 432 & 433,47 DCR 4888 (6-9-00) (MPD) 
Chapter 4, Sex Offender Registration, 47 DCR 10042 (1 2-22-00) (Ml'D) 
Chapter 8, Secs. 805 - 8 10, Procedures for Forfeiture of Seized or Unclaimed Property, 3 8 DCR 1227 

(2-22-9 l)(MPD) 



DCMli Title 6A/Police Personnel CMav 1988 ed.) 

Chapter 1 1, Special Police, Sec. 1109: Uniforms, $1109.4 to provide for special designation of police 
officers under the control of the Department of General Services, the D.C. Protective Services 
Police Identification Act of 1982, effective 6-4-82, DC Law 4-1 15,29 DCR 2522 (6-18-82) (DC 
LAW) 

Chapter 12, College and University Campus Security Amendment Act of 1995, $9  1200 1208 (D.C. Law 
11-63), 42 DCR 4109 (8-1 1-95) 

Chapter 21, Secs. 2105.6, 21 19.1 & 21 19.7, Amend Rules Governing Conciliation and Clarifylng 
Amendments, 4 1 DCR 25 15 (5 -6-94) 

Chapter 21, Sec. 21 10, Civilian Complaint Review Board - Amended, 36 DCR 5373 (7-28-89) (CCRB) 
Chapter 21, Rules to Implement the Civilian Complaint Review Board Amendment Act of 1992 and 

Technical and Clarifylng Changes, 40 DCR 2926 (5-7-93)(CCRB) 
Chapter 2 1, The Citizen Complaint Review Board and the Office of Citizen Complaint: Review, 

49 DCR 8347 (8-30-02) (CCRB) 

DCMR Title 71 Em~lovment Benefits (Jan. 1986 ed.) 

Chapter 1, Disability Compensation, $4104.4, 106.3, 107.2, 107.3, 107.4, 107.5, 107.7, 107.15, 107.16, 
112.1, 112.3, and Sec. 118: Appeal to the Director; Repeal Chapter 13,47 DCR 7484 (9-15-00) 
(DOES) 

Chapter 1, Disability Compensation, Sec. 119: Utilization Review, 43 DCR 1466 (3-22-96) (DOES) 
Chapter 1, Disability Compensation, Sec. 120: Medical Savices and Supplies, 43 DCR 1466 

(3-22-96)(DOES) 
Chapter 1, Disability Compensation, Sec. 12 1 : Voluntary Settlements, 47 DCR 9675 (12-8-00) (DOES) 
Chapter 2, Compensation Issued Without a Hearing; Vocational Rehabilitation; Administrative and 

Judicial Review; and Special Fund, 33 DCR 2308 (4-1 8-86) ERRATA 
Chapter 2, Private Sector Workers' Compensation Program - Amended, 41 DCR 3213 (6-3-94)(DOES) 
Chapter 2, Secs. 220,221.222 to eliminate the use of prehearing conferences; sec. 3 of the Workers' 

Compensation Amendment Act of 1998, effective 4-16-99 (DC Law 12-229,46 DCR 891) @C 
LAW) 

Chapter 2, Private Sector Workers' Compensation Program, 47 DCR 6454 (8-1 1-00) (DOES) 
Chapter 3, Sec. 3 12, Misconduct, 41 DCR 4167 (6-24-94) (DOES) 
Chapter 3, Sec. 3 14, Refusal of Training or Reemployment Services, 43 DCR 1470 (3-22-96) (DOES) 
Chapter 3, Sec. 323, Collection Procedures for Delinquent Unemployment Compensation Accounts, 

35 DCR 8833 (12-23-88)VCB) 
Chapter 3, Sec. 399.1, Regarding Definition of Labor Dispute, 35 DCR 2375 (4-1-88)(DUCB) 
Chapter 8, Youth Employment: Training and Retraining Employment Program, 37 DCR 6947 

(1 1 -2-90)(DOES) 
Chapter 9, Secs. 946 & 935, Wage Order for Clerical and Semi-Technical Occupations Rescission Act of 

1992, effective June 11, 1992, D.C. Law 9-121,39 DCR 3198 (D.C. Law) 
Chapter 9, Wage-Hour Rules, 41 DCR 187 (1-14-94)(DOBS) 
Chapter 1 1, Apprenticeship, 37 DCR 5999 (9-14-90)(DCAC) 
Chapter 15, Secs. 1508.1 & 1508.2, Staff Reporting - Amended, 39 DCR 7 153 (9-1 8-92)(DCRB) 
Chapter 15, D.C. Retirement Board, 49 DCR 10791 (1 1-29-02) (DCRB) 
Chapter 17, Elections for D.C. Retirement Board Members, 30 DCR 4333 (8-26-83)@CRB)(Errata) 
Chapter 17, Amendment to the Rules for the Election of Members, 49 DCR 1095 (2-8-02) (DCRB) 
Chapter 18, Classification and compensation Program Regulations, 47 DCR 9892 (12-15-00) (DCRB) 
Chapter 25, Sec. 2522, Rules of Practice and Procedure for the Police and Firefighters Retirement and 

Relief Board, 33 DCR 6793 (10-3 1 -86)(OM) 



DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA REGISTER 

DCMR Title 8nrniversity of the District of Columbia (June 1988 Provisional ed.) 

Chapter 1, Board of Trustees, 39 DCR 2296 (4-3-92)(UDC) 
Chapter 1, Board of Trustees, Sec. 103:Duties of Officers of the Board; Sec. 104: Administrative Support; 

Sec. 105: Meetings of the Board of Trustees: Regular Meetings; Sec. 106: Meetings of the Board 
of Trustees: Special Meetings; Sec. 108: Conduct of Meetings of the Board of Trustees; Sec. 110: 
Committees of the Board of Trustees; Sec. 11 1: Meetings of Board Committees; Sec. 120: Alumni 
Members of the Board of Trustees & Sec. 126: Discussion Drafts of Proposed Rules, 
48 DCR 3413 (4-13-01) (UDC) 

Chapter 1, Sec. 122: Student Member of the Board of Trustees, § 122.2,43 DCR 2341 (5-3-96) (UD) 
Chapter 2, Sec. 21 1: Executive Appointment: Non-Academic Administrator, $21 1.2 , 44  DCR 5835 

(1 0-10-97 P C )  
Chapters 2 & 11, Secs. 207.1 & 1 102, Excepted Service - Amended, 37 DCR 5077 (8-3-90)(UDC) 
Chapters 2, 11 & 14, Administration and Management - Amended, 40 DCR 3353 (5-21-93)wC 
Chapter 3, Academic Procedures and Methods, Sec. 308: New or Modified Academic Degree or 

Certificate Programs, 45 DCR 2001 (4-3-98) (UDC) 
Chapters 3 & 5, Repeal Sec.302, Add Sec. 5 15, Smoking Restriction, 40 DCR 23 84 (4-9-93)(LJDC) 
Chapter 4, Sec. 410: Student Activity Fees, 42 DCR 21 12 (5-5-95) (UDC) 

Chapter 6, Campus Life, Sec. 604: Student Leaders Remitted Tuition Assistance, 49 DCR 2901 (3-29-02) 
W C )  

Chapter 6, Sec. 607 & 6 18, Parlung Permits; Registration Fees, Parking Fees and Fines, 4 1 DCR 7682 (1.1- 
25-94)(UDC) 

Chapter 6, Secs. 607 & 618, Parking Permits; Registration Fees, and Fines - Amended, 39 DCR 558 
(1 -3 1 -92)(UDC) 

Chapter 6, Secs. 605 - 617, Traffic Regulations - Amended, 35 DCR 7339 (10-7-88)(UDC) 
Chapter 6, Secs. 618 & 607.9, Regarding Parking Fees, 35 DCR 4401 (6-10-88)(UDC) 
Chapter 6, Campus Life, Sec. 61 8: Registration Fees, Parking Fees, and Fines, $61 8.4,49 DCR 2163 

(3 -8-02) (UDC) 
Chapter 7, Secs. 706, 725, 726, 728 & 729, Tuition and Fees, 37 DCR 5078 (8-3-90)(UDC) 
Chapter 7, Sec. 721, Deferment of Tuition and Fees for Incarcerated Students, 35 DCR 203 1 

(3-1 1-88)(UDC) 
Chapter 7, Sec. 722: Preferential Tuition for D.C. Residents, 45 DCR 4395 (7-3-98) UDC) 
Chapter 7, Sec. 725: Tuition and Fees, General Provisions, $4725.3 & 725.4,45 DCR 4397 (7-3-98) 
Chapter 7, Sec. 727, Tuition and Fees: Early Childhood Learning Center, 38 DCR 1685 (3-15-91)(UDC) 
Chapter 7, Sec. 728: Tuition and Fees: Undergraduate Students, $728.3 ,44  DCR 5835 (10-10-97)wC) 
Chapter 7, Sec. 728: Tuition and Fees: Undergraduate Students, §728.5,45 DCR 2002 (4-3-98) (UDC) 
Chapter 7, Sec. 728, Tuition and Fees, 41 DCR 1099 (3-4-94)(UDC) 
Chapter 7, Sec. 728, Tuition and Fees; and to Establish a Fee for the Graduate Writing Proficiency 

Examination, 42 DCR 21 13 (5-5-95) (UDC) 
Chapter 7, Sec. 728: Tuition and Fees, Fall Semester 1996 and 1997,43 DCR 2996 (6-7-96) (UDC) 
Chapter 7, Sec. 728: Tuition and Fees, Undergraduate Students, $728.6 to Restrict Use of Funds Collected 

as Laboratory Fees, 45 DCR 4398 (7-3-98) (LJDC) 
Chapter 7, Sec. 728: Tuition and Fees, Undergraduate Students, 9728.7 to Require a Technology Fee of 

All Students, 45 DCR 4399 (7-3-98) (UDC) 
Chapter 9, Alumni Affairs, 5 1 DCR 775 (1-16-04 (UDC) 
Chapter 1 I, Secs. 1140, 1141, 1142 & 1143 Pertaining to Employee Performance Evaluations, 

46 DCR 6145 (7-23-99) 
Chapter 11, Secs. 1140 - 1145, Employee Performance Evaluations, 37 DCR 5083 (8-3-90)(UDC) 
Chapter 11, Full University Furlough, 38 DCR 2150 (4-12-91)vDC) 



MAR 4 - 2005 

DCMR Title XKJniversi* of the District of Columbia Continued 

Chapter 13, Sec. 1332, Remitted Tuition, 38 DCR 1686 (3-15-91)VC) 
Chapter 13, Leave and Benefits, Sec. 1332: Remitted Tuition, 5 1332.3,46 DCR 3996 (4-30-99) (UDC) 
Chapter 18, Reduction In Force, 39 DCR 4795 (6-26-92)(UDC) 
Chapter 21, Leasing of Real Property, 37 DCR 5091 (8-3-90)(UDC) 
Chapter 22, Property Management, 38 DCR 1680 (3-15-91)(UDC) 
Chapters 30 - 35, University Procurement, 39 DCR 4769 (6-26-92)(UDC) 

DCMR Title 8AlD.C. School of Law* 

Chapter 1, Board of Governors, 35 DCR 3577 (5-13-88)@CSL) 
Chapter 1, Sec. 120, Election of the Alumni Member of the Board of Governors, 37 DCR 3960 

(6- 15-9O)@CSL) 
Chapter 2, Educational Mission and Academic Policy, 36 DCR 8286 (12-8-89)(DCSL) 
Chapter 2, Education Mission, 5200.5; Sec. 203, Transfer Between the Full-Time and Part-Time Program, 

42 DCR 5438 (9-29-95) (DCSL) 
Chapter 3, Administration and Management, 35 DCR 6883 (9-16-88)@CSL) 
Chapter-3, Sec. 350, Drug and Alcohol Abuse Prevention, 37 DCR 3962 (6-15-90)(DCSL) 
Chapter 3, Sec. 353, Sexual Harassment, 40 DCR 6356 (9-3-93)(DCSL) 
Chapter 5, Admissions, Tuition, And Fees, 35 DCR 3589 (5-1 3-88)(DCSL) 
Chapter 5, Secs. 505.1, 5 10.1 & 5 10.6, Application Fee; Tuition and Fees - Amended, 38 DCR 5 184 

(8-1 6-9 l)(DCSL) 
Chapter 5, Sec. 5 10, Tuition and Fees, 41 DCR 457 1 (7-8-94)(DCSL) 
Chapter 5, Sec. 5 10, Tuition and Fees, 42 DCR 2584 (5-26-95)@CSL) 
Chapter 5, Secs. 510.1 & 5 10.7, Tuition and Fees; Graduation Fee - Amended, 42 DCR 5438 (9-29-95) 

@CSL) 
Chapter 5, Sec. 5 11, Withdrawal, Admissions, Tuition, and Fees - Amended, 35 DCR 9076 

(12-30-88)@CSL) 
Chapter 5, Sec. 5 12, Mandatory Health Insurance, 40 DCR 6358 (9-3-93)(DCSL) 
Chapter 5 & 6, Secs. 5 1 1.7,5 1 1.8 & 602.9, Withdrawal, Grading System and Grades - Amended, 39 DCR 

2740 (4-1 7-92)(DCSL) 
Chapter 6, Academic Standards and Requirements, Secs. 600 - 610,615 & 616,42 DCR 5438 (9-29-95) 

(DCSL) 
Chapter 6, Academic Standards and Requirements, 35 DCR 6899 (9-16-88)(DCSL) 
Chapter 6, Sec. 600.7, Academic Standards and Requirements - Amended, 38 DCR 3785 

(6-14-9 l)@CSL) 
Chapter 6, Secs. 600, 601,602, & 605, Academic Standards and Requirements - Amended, 37 DCR 1280 

(2-1 6-9O)(DCSL) 
Chapter 6, Sec. 600.1 & 600.4, Degree Requirements - Amended, 39 DCR 5358 (7-17-92)(DCSL) 
Chapter 6, Secs. 602 - 609, Academic Standards and Requirements, 40 DCR 6359 (9-3-93)(DCSL) 
Chapter 6, Secs. 605.1,608.l, 608.2,615.1, & Repeal Sec. 606 in its Entirety, Academic Standards and 

Requirements - Amended, 38 DCR 426 (1-1 1-9l)(DCSL) 
Chapter 7, Sec. 702, Law Review, $702.8,42 DCR 5438 (9-29-95) (DCSL) 
Chapter 7, Student Activities and Records, 35 DCR 6908 (9-16-88)(DCSL) 
Chapter 10, General Personnel Policies, 35 DCR 4365 (6-10-88)(DCSL) 
Chapter 13, Accrual of Vacation Leave, 38 DCR 1825 (3-22-9 l)@CSL) 
Chapter 10, Secs. 1006, 1007, & 1008, ~ene ra l  Personnel Policies - Amended, 36 DCR 566 1 

(8-4-89)(DCSL) 
Chapter 1 1, Classification & Compensation, 35 DCR 4374 (6-10-88)(DCSL) 



DISTRICT OF COLUhhB1A REGlSTEW MAR 4 - 2005 

DCMR Title 8Am.C. School of Law* Continued 

Chapter 12, Conditions of Employment, 35 DCR 58 10 (7-29-88)@CSL) 
Chapter 13, Leave & Benefits, 35 DCR 4379 (6-10-88)(DCSL) 
Chapter 14, Faculty Appointments and Service, 35 DCR 4390 (6-10-88)(DCSL) 
Chapter 14, Secs. 1423 & 1424, Faculty Appointment and Service, 37 DCR 1282 (2-16-90)(DCSL) 
Chapter 16, Grievance Procedures, 35 DCR 7764 (10-28-88)(DCSL) 
Chapter 17, Adverse Actions, 35 DCR 7771 (10-28-88) (DCSL) 
Chapter 17, Sec. 1708, Conduct of Adverse Action Hearings - Amended, 39 DCR 8107 (1 1-6-92 (DCSL) 
Chapter 18, Reduction in Force - Furlough, 42 DCR 1210 (3-10-95) (DCSL) 
Chapter 20, Labor Relations, 36 DCR 1487 (2-24-89)(DCSL) 
Chapter 21, Collective Bargahing, 36 DCR 1501 (2-24-89)(DCSL) 
Chapter 25, Procurement, 35 DCR 5822 (7-29-88)@CSL) 

DCMR Title 91 Taxation (April 1998 ed.) 

Chapter 1, Income and Franchise Taxes, Sec. 105: General Requirements for Filing Tax Returns 
(Including Electronic [Internet] Filing, $4 105.1 1 - 105.13 & 105.99, 50 DCR 2864 (4-1 1-03) 
( O W  

Chapter 1, Income and Franchise Taxes, Sec. 109: Consolidated Tax Returns, 5 1 DCR 1688 (2-13-04) 
(OTR) 

Chapter 1, Income and Franchise Taxes), Sec. 155: D.C. College Savings Program, 5 1 DCR 739 (1 -16-04) 
(OTR) 

Chapter 3, Real Property Taxes, Regarding Procedures for Freedom of Information Act Requests; and 
Information for Receiving a Real Property Tax Exemption, 48 DCR 1 1705 (1 2-28-0 1) (OTR) 

Chapter 3, Real Property Taxes, New Sec. 3 14: Privatized Tax Sale Research and Notification, 
48 DCR 6445 (7-20-0 1) (OTR) 

Chapter 3, Real Property Taxes, Sec. 315: Tax Sale Costs, 48 DCR 8197 (8-31-01) (OTR) 
Chapter 3, Real Property Tax Sales, Sec. 3 16: Real Property Tax Sale Redemption and Tax Deed Issuance 

Rules, 5 1 DCR 757 (1-16-04) (OTR) 
Chapter 3, Real Property Taxes, Sec. 336:Fees; and Chapter 5 (Tax on Recordation of Deeds), Sec. 513: 

Uniform Commercial Code (UCC) Article 9 Filings, to Increase Fees and Set Procedures for 
Article 9 Uniform Commercial Code Filings, 48 DCR 10040 (1 1-2-01) (OTR) 

Chapter 3, Real Property Taxes), 43221.1 (a) Relating to Ownership of Real Property for Real Property 
Tax Exemption Purposes, 49 DCR 4347 (5-10-02) (OTR) 

Chapter 4, Sales and Use Taxes, Sec. 493: Sales Price: Communication Services, 5 1 DCR 6029 (6-1 1-04) 
(OTR) 

Chapters 5 & 6 to Define for the Purposes of Recordation and Transfer Taxes, the Terms "Nominal 
Consideration" and "Fair Market Value", 46DCR 8264 (10-15-99) (CFO) 

Chapter 11, Qualified High Technology Company, 49 DCR 2142 (3-8-02) (OTR) 
Chapter 20, Board of Real Property Assessments and Appeals, Sec. 2002: Members and Stafc Sec. 2003: 

Panel Assignments, Meetings and Decisions; and Sec. 2004: Prohibitions on Members, 
49 DCR 2897 (3-29-02) (BRPAA) 

DCMR Title 10Wlanning and Develop~rient (Part 1) (February 1999 ed.) 

Chapters 1 through 19, Adopts Comprehensive Plan for the Nation's Capital, sec. 2 of the Comprehensive 
Plan Amendments Act of 1998, effective 4-27-99 (DC Law 12-275,46 DCR 1441 (Part 2) (DC 
LAW) 



DCMR Title lO\Planning; and Development part  2) (March 1994 ed.) ~ 1 1 9 9 6  Supplement 

Chapters 1,4, 9, 11, 13, 14, 17, 18, 19, secs. 199.1,404.4, 940.2, 1100.7, 1108.1, 11,20.2, 1409.7, 1711.1, 
1109.1, 1129.1, 1138.1, 1342.1, 1365.3, 1700.8, 1711.1, 1734, 1804.8, 1903.5; secs. 101 & 201 
of the Comprehensive Plan Technical Corrections and Response to NCPC Recommendations and 
Closing of a Public Alley in Square 1189, S.O. 98-150, Act of 1999, effective 9-22-99 (DC Law ' 

13-130,46 DCR 563 1) (DC LAW) 
Chapter 2 1, 32 1 16.3, Technical correction to change 42 102.4 to 2 102.3 ERRATA 

Chapter 26, Sec. 2625: Review of Applications for Landmark Status; Sec. 2626: Hearings for 
Individual Landmark Designation; Sec. 2627: Order of Procedure for Landmark Designation 
Hearings; Sec. 2628: Closure of Record in Landmark Designation Cases; Sec. 2629: Post Hearing 
Procedures in LandmarkDesignation; Sec. 2630: Evidence; and Sec. 263 1: Ot'ficial Transcript, 
EXPIRES 120 DAYS, 46 DCR 8983 (1 1-5-99) (HPRB) 

Chapter 26, Historic Preservation Review Board, Sec. 2609: Meetings, 32609.5 Regarding the Conduct of 
Board Hearings by Establishing a Summary "Denial Calendar", "Consent Calendar" & "Agenda", 
EXPIRES 120 DAYS, 48 DCR 2909 (3-30-01) (HPRB) 

Chapter 26, Sec. 2614: Unsafe and Insanitary Buildings, EXPIRES 120 DAYS, 49 DCR 11852 (12-27-02) 
(HPW & SHPO) 

Chapter 30, Board for the Condemnation of Insanitary Buildings, §§3000.1,3005.2, and 3099.1, 
49 DCR 9493 (1 0-1 8-02) (DCRA) 

Chapter a4, Low Income Housing Tax Credit Program, Delete 340 1.4; New Sec. 3406: Program Fees, 
EXPIRES 120 DAYS, 5 1 DCR 7652 (8-6-04) (DHCD) 

Chapter 41, Housing Production Trust Fund), Secs. 4,100 - 4199,49 DCR 10582 (1 1-22-02) (DHCD) 
Chapter 58, Security Deposit and Affordable Facilities Assistance for Qualified High Technology 

Companies, 49 DCR 7502 (8-2-02) (DCRA) 
Chapter 59, Tax Abatements for New Residential Development program, 50 DCR 553 (1-17-03) 

@ W E D )  
Chapter 60, Special Merits, EXPIRES 9-3 1-04,5 1 DCR 6662 (7-2-04) @ W E D )  
Chapter 61, Rules of Operation for the Downtown Retail Priority Area, EXPIRES 120 DAYS, 

51 DCR 9326 (10-1-04) (DMPED) 

DCMR Title 10AlHistoric Preservation * 

Adoption of a New 10A DCMR, Historic Preservation; and Amendment of 10 DCMR, Planning and 
Development, 5 1 DCR 7447 (7-30-04) (HPRB) 

DCMR Title IlIZoning Webruarv 2003 ed.) 

Chapter 1, Sec. 199: Definitions, 4 199.1 to Revise Definition of "Building Height" and the Tenn "Curb" 
(Case No. 02-35), 50 DCR 9387 (1 1-7-03) (ZC) 

Chapter 1, Sec. 199: Definitions, 50 DCR 10822 (12-19-03) (ZC) 
Chapters 1,2, 5, 6, 9 & 2 1 to Establish Metropolitan Police Department Uses in the Zoning Regulations 

(Case No. 02-28), 5 1 DCR 4778 (5-7-04) (ZC) 
Chapters 1 ,2 ,4 ,5 ,6 ,  9, 21,22, & 34 to Allow Public Recreation and Community Centers in R-1 and Less 

Restrictive Districts (Case No. 02-15), 50 DCR 10137 (1 1-28-03) (ZC) 
Chapters 1, 5,6, 7, 9 & 21 to Establish Optical Transmission Nodes (Case No. 02-34TA), 50 DCR 88 I8 

(10-1 7-03) (ZC) 
Chaptersl, 9, 20, 21,24,25, 31 & 32 to Establish a New Zone District to be Known as the Waterfront 

Open Space Zone District (W-0) (Case No. 02-42), 5 1 DCR 3440 (4-2-04) (ZC) 
Chapter 2[Sec. 201: Uses as a Matter of Right, 50 DCR 10~2(J.~19-03) (ZC) 

L,: $.%, 



DCMR Title 111Zonine Continued) 

Chapter 4, Residence Districts: Height, Area, and Density Regulations Chapter 17, Definitions), $1799.1; 
Chapter 21, Off-Street Parqng Requirements; and Chapter 30, Zoning Commission Procedures, 9 
3041.1 (b), (Case No. 00-04TA), Technical Corrections, 50 DCR 8824 (10-17-03) (ZC) 

Chapter 6 ,  Sec. 601: Uses as a Matter of R~ght, 50 DCR 10822 (12-19-03) (ZC) 
Chapter 6, Mixed Use Districts, Sec. 63 1, Chapter 30 (Rules of Practice and Procedure), Chapter 16 
(Capitol Gateway Overlay District) 52 DCR 63 (1 -7-05) 
Chapter 7, Sec. 70 1 : Uses as a Matter of Right, 570 1.6 (b), 50 DCR 10822 (12-19-03) (ZC) 
Chapter 8, Industrial Districts, $9 801.7Cj), 802.17 through 802.20 Regarding Concrete Plants (Case No. 

0 1-32TA), 50 DCR 1 194 (2-7-03) (ZC) 
Chapter 9, Sec. 901 : Uses as a Matter of Right, $901.1, 50 DCR 10822 (12-19-03) (ZC) 
Chapter 13, Sec. 1302: Designated nd Restricted Uses, $1301.2@), 50 DCR 10822 (12-19-03) (ZC) 
Chapter 18, Southeast Federal Center Overlay District; and Map Amendment (Case No. 03-06), 

5 1 DCR 6837 (7-9-04) (ZC) 
Chapter 2 1, Sec. 2 102: Off-Street Parlung Requirements for Parking Spaces; and Sec. 2 104: Exceptions to 
the Schedule of Requirements: Nonresidential Structures Near Metrorail Stations, to Add Three Types of 
Public Library Uses (Case No 03-10), 50 DCR 10822 (12-19-03) (ZC) 
Chapter 25, Miscellaneous Zoning Requirements, Sec. 25 15: Exceptions to Density Regulations for Open 

Arcades), $9 25 15.3 & 25 15.13 - 25 15.15 (Case No. 02-44), 5 1 DCR 4785 (5-7-04) (ZC) 
Chapter 30, Zoning Commission Rules of Practice and Procedure), Sec. 3045: Miscellaneous Fees, 

5 3045.1 (c) (d), to Increase Fees for Copies of Zoning Map (Case No. 03-25), 50 DCR 
939 1 (1 1-7-03) (ZC) 

Chapter 3 1, Board of Zoning Adjustment Rules of Practice and Procedure), 93 1 12.2 Regarding Filing 
Deadline for Appeals to the BZA (Case No. 02-01), 50 DCR 1200 (2-7-03) (ZC) 

Chapter 32, Adminisbation and Enforcement), Sec. 3202: Building Permits, $ 3202.5 (a) (Case No. 
03-14), 50 DCR 8826 (10-17-03) (ZC) 

Chapter 32, Admin~stration and Enforcement, Sec. 3202: Building Permits, 4 3202.5 (a) (Case No. 03-14), 
Corrected Notice, 5 1 DCR 263 (1 -9-04) 

DCMR Title 12lConstruction Code Supplements (2003 ed.1 

Adopts Title 12 DCMR, D.C. Construction Codes Supplement of 2003; Adopts 2000 Edition of the 
International Code Council (ICC) International Building Code; the 2000 Edition of the ICC 
International Residential Code; the 2000 Edition of the ICC International Fuel Gas Code; the 2000 
Edition of the ICC International Mechanical Code; the 2000 Edition of the ICC International 
Plumbing Code; the 2000 ~di t ion  of the ICC International Property Maintenance Code; the 2000 
Edition of the ICC International Fire Code; the 2000 Edition of the ICC international Energy 
Conservation Code; the D.C. Existing Building Code Supplement of 2002; the 1996 
Edition of the NFPA National Electrical Code, 5 1 DCR 292 (1-9-04) (DCRA) 

Chapter 1, Administration and Enforcement, 9 §PM- 105.3.1 through PM- 105.3.6 of 12E DCMR, 
50 DCR 48 (1-3-03) (DCRA) 

ERRATA - Text of the D.C. Existing Buildings Code Supplement of 2003 (DCMR 12 J), 5 1 DCR 1 19 1 
(1-30-04) (DCRA) 

ERRATA - Text of the D.C. Existing Buildings Code Supplement of 2003 (DCMR 12 J) - Republished, 
5 1 DCR 1894 (2-20-04) (DCRA) 

ERRATA - Text of Sections 106.6 through 109.1 of DCMR 12A, the D.C. Building Code Supplement of 
2003,5 1 DCR 3267 (3-26-04) (DCRA) 

Chapter 1 A, Administration and Enforcement, Sec. 105A: Permits, Sec. 113A: Violations and 
Infractions; Sec. 114A: Stop Work Order, EXPIRES120 DAYS 52 DCR 1323 (2-1 1-05) DCRA 



DCMR Title 14lHousing (December 2004 ed.) 

Chapter 28, Single Family Residentla1 Rehabilitation Program, 5 1 DCR 1 106 1 (1 2-3-04) (DHCD) 
Chapter 6 1, Admission and Recertification, Sec. 6 1 13 : Tenant Admissions and Occupancy: Redeveloped 

and Special Needs Properties, ERRATA, 5 1 DCR 1 1326 (1 2-1 0-04) (HA) 
Chapter 61, Admission and Recertification, Sec. 61 14: Tenant Selection and Assignment: Elderly-Only 

Designations, ERRATA, 5 1 DCR 1 1330 (12-10-04) (HA) 
Chapter 6 1, Admission and Recertification, Sec. 6 1 15 : Adding Individuals to the Lease and Live-In Aids, 

ERICATA, 5 1 DCR 1 1333 (12-10-04) (HA) 
Chapter 62, Low Rent Housing Rent and Lease, Sec. 6200: Rent Calculations, ERRATA, 51 DCR 11336 

(12-1 0-04) (HA) 
Chapter 83, Rent and Housing Assistance Payments, EXPIRES 120 DAYS, 52 DCR 577 (1-2 1-05)(HA) 

DCMR Title 15/Public Utilities and Cable Television (June 1998) 

Chapter 1, Sec. 1 18: Electronic Filing Procedures; and Sec. 1 19: Electronic Fi'ling Formats and Document 
Verification, 49 DCR 8721 (9-20-02) (F'SC) 

Chapter 6, Pay Telephones, 48 DCR 1 15 1 (2-9-0 1) (PSC) 
Chapter 6, Pay Telephone, $600.2,49 DCR 531 (1-18-02) (PSC) 
Chapter 9, Net Energy Metering, 52 DCR 1586 (2-28-05) 
Chapter 2 1, Provisions for Construction of Electric Generating Facilities and Transmission Lines, 

5 1 DCR 8637 (9-3-04) (PSC) 
Chapter 21, ERRATA Notice, Omitted Pages from the 9-3-04 DCR, 51 DCR 9454 (10-8-04) (ODAI) 
Chapter 22, Procurement Regulations, 47 DCR 2600 (4-14-00) (PSC) 
Chapter 23, Natural Gas, Sec. 2398: Penalties, 49DCR 8223 (8-23-02) (PSC) 
Chapter 25, Certification of Local Exchange Service Providers, 47 DCR 2601 (4-14-00) (PSC) 
Chapter 25, Certification of Local Exchange Service Providers, Sec. 2505: Certification by Waiver 

Requirements, §2505.5,47 DCR 8 1 12 (10-6-00) (PSC) 
Chapter 25, Certification of Local Exchange Service Providers, Sec. 25 12: Assignment or Transfer of 

Certification to Provide Local Exchange Service, 5 1 DCR 9998 (1 0-29-04) (PSC) 
Chapter 25, Certification of Local Exchange Service Providers, Sec. 2513: Waiver, 47 DCR 5778 

(7-14-00) (PSC) 
Chapter 26, Rules Implementing Section 252 of the Federal Telecommunications Act of 1996, 

47 DCR.83 15 (10-20-00) (PSC) 
Chapter 26, Rules Implementing Sec. 252 of the Federal Telecommunications Act of 1996, Secs. 2600, 

2613,2614,2622,2623,2624,2625 & 2699,48 DCR 140 (1-5-01) (F'SC) 
Chapter 26, Rules Implementing Section 252 of the Federal Telecommunications Act of 1996, 

5 1 DCR 2905 (3-19-04) (PSC) 
Chapter 27, Regulation of Certified Telecommunications Service Providers, 48 DCR 4664, (5-25-01) 

(F'SC) 
Chapter 27, Regulation of Certified Telecommunications Service Providers, 5 1 DCR 1000 1, (10-29-04) 

( P W  
Chapter 27, Regulation of Certified Telecommunications Service Providers, 52 DCR 724 (1-28-05) 
Chapter 28, Universal. ~ervice, 50 DCR 8198 (10-3-03) (PSC) 
Chapter 28, Universal Service, EXPJRES 120 DAYS, 5 1 DCR 9466 (10-8-04) (PSC) 
Chapter 28, Universal Service, $9 2805.2,2812.1,2813.2 & 2813.3, 51 DCR 10940 (1 1-26-04) (PSC) 
Chapter 3 1, Customer Service Standards, 49 DCR 6797 (7-19-02) (OCTT) 
Chapter 3 1, Customer Service Standards, 99 3107.2,3108.8, 3106.7,3 106.8, 3 107.2, 3 109.2, 3 115.8, 

3 1 18, 3 198; Sec. 5 of the Approval of the Franchise of Corncast Cablevision of the District to 
Provide Cable Service in D.C. Act of 2002, projected effective date 10-3-02 (DC Act 1441 1, 
49 DCR 7328) @C ACT) 



DCMR Title lS/Public Utilities and Cable Television (June 1998) Continued 

Chapter 33, Allocation of Public, Educational, and Government (PEG) Cable Television Channels, 
50 DCR 7543 (9-5-03) (OCTT) 

Chapter 35, Applications for Authority to Issue or Amend Tariffs or Issue Stock or Evidences of 
Indebtedness, 47 DCR 8202 (10-13-00) PSC) 

Chapter 35, Appls. for Authority to Issue or Amend Tariffs or Issue Stock or Evidences of Indebtedness, 
$3503.1,47 DCR 9890 (12-15-00) (PSC) 

DCMR Title 16/Consumers, Commercial Practices, & Civil Infractions (July 1998 ed.)w/December 
1998 Supplement 

Chapter 3, $30 1.4(c), to require sales finance companies engaging in dealer activities to acquire a dealer 
license; Sec. 403 of the Fiscal Year 2003 Budget Support Act of 2002, projected effective date 
September 25,2002 (DC Act 14403,49 DCR 6968 (7-26-02)) (DC ACT) 

Chapter 4, Towing Service for Motor Vehicles, 50 DCR 2473 (3-28-03) (DCRA) 
Chapter 4, Towing Service for Motor Vehicles, 50 DCR 3935 (5-23-03) (DCRA) 
Chapter 4,Towing Service for Motor Vehicles, Sec. 402: Licenses Required for Towing Businesses and 

Towing Service Storage Lots; Sec. 403:Tow Truck Licenses; Sec. 404: Required Tow Truck 
Equipment and Markings; Sec. 405: Towing Storage Lot Requirements; Sec. 406: Public Tows; 
Sec. 408: Payment for Services; Sec. 409: Itemized Statements and Receipts; Sec. 410: Prohibited 
Acts; Sec. 41 1: Penalties and Enforcement; and Sec. 499: Definitions, 5 1 DCR 3428 (4-2-04) 
( D C W  

Chapter 4, Towing Service for Motor Vehicles, Sec. 412: Licensing Fees, 50 DCR 4942 (6-20-03) 
W R A )  

Chapter 4, Towing Service for Motor Vehicles, EXPIRES 2-25-05, 5 1 DCR 10234 (1 1-5-04) (DCRA) 
Chapter 4, Towing Service for Motor Vehicles, 52 DCR 522 (1-21-05) 
Chapter 22, Postsecondary Nondegree Schools, Sec. 22 19: Refund Policies, 5 1 DCR 87 (1 -2-04) (DCRA) 
Chapter 3 1, Civil Infractions: Administrative Procedures), $3 1 13.6; Sec. 3 1 14: Cost, Penalties, and 

Interest, 93 114.2; Sec. 3 117: Collection Proceedings and Liens, $93 117.2 through 3 117.14; 
$83118.1 & 3118.2, 3118.14 & 3199,49 DCR4995 (5-31-02) (DCRA) 

Chapter 32, Civil Infractions, Sec. 3210: DCRA Office of Investigation, Weights and Measures - Towing 
Service for Motor Vehicle Infractions, $32 10.1, Reserved; and 3210.2 - 3210.5, 5 1 DCR 7394 
(7-30-04) (DCRA) 

Chapter 32, Civil Infractions, Sec. 32 16: DCRA Business Inspection Division - Food Protection Branch 
Infractions), $6 321 6.1 & 32 16.4 to Establish Fines for Violations of the Provisions of the Rodent 
Control Act of 2000,48 DCR 6656 (7-27-0 1) (DOH) 

Chapter 32, Civil Infractions, §§ 3216.1 through 3216.8 to make amendment to regulations that govern 
rodent control, Sec. 910 Fiscal Year 2001 Budget Support Act of 2000, effective October 19,2000 
(DC Law 13-1 72,47 DCR 6308) (DC LAW) 

Chapter 32, 993224.3, 3224.3(p) to increase the civil infractions fine for violating the engine idling 
provisions, and to make the engine idling provisions of the regulations comport with the engme 
idling provisions of the D.C. Air Pollution Control Act of 1984; Sec. 2 of Motor Vehicle 
Excessive Idling Fine Increase Amendment Act of 1999, effective. October 7, 1999 (DC Law 1.3- 
35,46 DCR 6017) (DC LAW) 

Chapter 32, Civil Infractions, Sec. 3234: DOH Environmental Health Administration - Soil Erosion and 
Sedimentation Control and Storm Water Management, 47 DCR 6892 (8-25-00) (DOH 

Chapter 32, Civil Infractions, $3239, Operation of Group Homes for Mentally Retarded Persons, 
$§3239.l(c)(d) & 3239.2(d), EXPIRES 120 DAYS, 47 DCR 329 (1-21-00) (DOH) 

Chapter 32, Civil Infractions, Sec. 3239: Operation of Group Homes for Mentally Retarded Persons, 
47 DCR 6217 (84-00) (DOH) Chapter 32, Civil In&actions, Sec. 3240: Lead-Based Paint 
Abatenlent and Control, 47 DCR 8091 (10-6-00) (DOH) 



DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA REGISTER MAR 4 - 2005 

DCMR Title 16/Consumers, Commercial Practices, & Civil Infractions (Julv 1998 ed.) Continued 

Chapter 32, Civil Infractions, Sec. 3241:Mental Health Community Residence Facility Infractions, 
47 DCR 9677 (12-8-00) (DOH) 

Chapter 32, Civil Infractions: Schedule of Fines), Sec. 3242: Licensing of Hospitals, 48 DCR 7212 
(8-3-0 1) (DOH) 

Chapter 32, Civil Infractions, Sec. 3243: Licensing of Nursing Facilities, 50 DCR 990 (1-31-03) (DOH) 
Chapter 32, Civil Infractions), Sec. 3245: Criminal Background Checks for Health-Care Workers, 

50 DCR 15 14 (2-14-03) (DOH) 
Chapter 33, Department of Mental Health Civil Infractions, Sec. 3300: Mental Health Certification 

Infractions, §3300.1,49 DCR 9857 (11-1-02) (DOMH) 
Chapter 33, Department of Mental Health Civil Infractions, Sec. 3301: MHRS Provider Certification 

Infractions, 5 1 DCR 1267 (1 -30-04) (DOMH) 

DCMR Title 17/Business, Occupations, and Professions lMav 1990 ed.) 

Chapter 1, Sec. 100, Civil Enforcement Alternative, Sec. 7 of the DCRA Civil Infractions Act of 1985 
Technical and Clarifymg Amendments Act of 1990, D.C. Law 8-23 7, effective March 29, 199 1, 
38 DCR 314 (D.C. Law) 

Chapter 1, Repeal Secs. 100.1 (b) & (c), Barber and Cosmetology Revision Act of 1992, effective March 
17,1993, D.C. Law 9-245,40 DCR 660 (D.C. Law) 

Chapter 1, Repeal Sec. lOO.l(a), 42 DCR 7266 (12-29-95 (DCFL4) 
Chapter 2, Sec. 200.9, Civil Enforcement Alternative, Sec. 7 ofthe DCRA Civil hfiactions Act of 1985 

Technical and Clarifying Amendments Act of 1990, D.C. Law 8-237, effective March 29, 1991, 
38 DCR 314 

Chapter 16, Optometry, Sec. 64 12: Administration of Diagnostic Pharmaceutical Agents; Sec. 
6413:Administration of Therapeutic Pharmaceutical Agents; and Sec. 3500, $3500.1 Description 
of Service, 46 DCR 4197 (5-7-99) (DOH) 

Chapter 17, Athlete Agents, 50 DCR 9549 (1 1-14-03) (DCFL4) 
Chapter 18, Broker-Dealers and Agents, (Chapters 18 & 19 repealed), 48 DCR 4106 (5-1 1-01) (ISR) 
Chapter 18, Sec. 1800: Investment Adviser Registration, 45 DCR 1841 (3-27-98) (ISR) 
Chapter 18, Investment Advisor Act Rules, 40 DCR 6732 (9-24-93)(PSC) 
Chapter 18, 441805.1, 1805.2, 1805.3, 1805.4, & 1805.5 Regarding Investment Advisers, 47 DCR 1221 

(2-25-00) (ISR) 
Chapter 18, Sec. 1823, Rules of PracticeProcedure for Investment Advisers, 42 DCR 659 (2-3-95)(PSC) 
Chapter 19, Sec. 1907.8 & 1907.9, Surety Bond Requirements, 38 DCR 61 1 (1-18-91)(PSC) 
Chapter 19, Registration of Securities Offerings, EXPIRES 2-1-02,48 DCR 9177 (10-5-01) (ISR) 
Chapter 23, $$2302.17 2302.2,2302.3,2304.1, 2304.2 & 23 1 1.3 to Incorporate the Minimum Criteria for 

Certification Issued by the Appraiser Qualification Board of the Appraisal Foundation, EXPIRES 
120 days, 45 DCR 44 (1-2-98) (DCRA) 

Chapters 23 & 33, Real Estate Appraisers, and Amend sec. 3300.l(d), 40 DCR 8480 (12-10-93) 
Chapter 24, §42407.2,2408.2 & Sec. 2409 to Increase the License Fee for Notaries Public and the 

Fees for the Issuance of Certifications of Notaries Public, 42 DCR 3365 (6-30-95)(0M) 
Chapter 25, Secs. 2505 & 2506, Examinations and Conditional Credit, 40 DCR 8168 (1 1-19-93)(BA) 
Chapter 25, Sec. 2508, Reciprocity for Canadian Chartered Accountants, 41 DCK 7352 

(1 1 - 1 1 -94)(DCRA) 
Chapter 25, Accountants, 5 1 DCR 4401 (4-30-04) (DCRA) 
Chapter 26, Real Estate LicenslnglContinuing Education Requirements - Amended, 38 DCR 50 10 

(8-9-9 l)(REC) 



DCMR Title 17/Business, Occupations, and Professions Continued 

Chapter 26, Real Estate Licenses, Secs. 2600,2602,2603, & 2605 to Change Requirements for Pre- 
Licensing Education, and Continuing Education, for Property Managers and Real Estate Brokers 
and Salespersons, 46 DCR 7335 (9- 17-99) (REC) 

Chapter 26, Secs. 2603,2605, 2622 & 2623, To Amend Continuing Education and License Reinstatement 
Requirements, 40 DCR 1108 (2-5-93)(REC) 

Chapter 26, Regarding Continuing Education Requirements and Establishing Alternative Continuing 
Education Courses, 40 DCR 8500 (1 2-1 0-93)(REC) 

Chapter 26, $$2601.1,2602.1, 2603.1, 2603.4, 2605.7, 2621.3 & 2612.5; Repeal 2603.1 8 & 2605.8, To 
Require Home Addresses of Licensees Shall be Street Addresses, Not Post Off~ce Boxes; and 
Continuing Education Requirements, 42 DCR 3 178 (6-23-95)(REC) 

Chapter 26, Real Estate Licenses, Prelicensing Education Requirements for Real Estate Salepersons, 
43 DCR 6838 (12-20-96) (REC) 

Chapter 26, repeal section 2608; section 23 of the Mortgage Lender and Broker Act of 1996, effective 
September 9, 1996 (DC Law 11-155,43 DCR 4213) (DC LAW) 

Chapter 27, Sec. 2704.3, To Increase the Minimum and Maximum Balances of the Real Estate Guaranty 
and Education Fund, 40 DCR 3925 (6-1 8-93) (REC) 

Chapter 27, Real Estate Practice and Hearings, Sec. 2708: Real Property Seller's Disclosure Statement, 46 
DCR 6966 (8-27-99) (DCRA) 

Chapter 3 1, Funeral Services Establishments, 39 DCR 7853 (10-23-92) (DCRA) 
Chapter 3 1, Sec. 3 109, Licensing Fees for Funeral Services Establishments, 41 DCR 1427 (3-1 8-94)(0-M) 
Chapter 32, Secs. 3203, 3206 & 3207, Regarding National Examination and Continuing Education 

Requirements for Interior Designers, 39 DCR 6824 (9-1 1-92)(DCRA) 
Chapter 33, Amend Sec. 33OO.l(f), 42 DCR 7266 (12-29-95) (DCRA) 
Chapter 33, General Rules, $ 3300.1 (e), 50 DCR 7699 (9-12-03) (DCR) 
Chapter 34, Architects, 42 DCR 7266 (12-29-95) (DCRA) 
Chapter 35, Sec. 3500.1, Occupational and Professional License Fee Schedule,40 DCR 5204 (7-16-93)(0- 

M) 
Chapter 35, Sec. 3500.1, Occupational and Professional License Fee Schedule - Amended, 41 DCR 8087 

(1 2-23 -94)@CRA) 
Chapter 35, Sec. 3500.1, Occupational and Professional License Fee Schedule - Amended, 46 DCR 7282 

(9-17-99) (DOH) 
Chapter 35, Occupational and Professional License Fee Schedule, Sec. 3500: Fees, 93500.1 to Modify 

Health Occupations License Fees, 49 DCR 8215 (8-23-02) @OH) 
Chapter 35, Occupational and Professional License Fee Schedule), Sec. 3500: Fees, $ 3500.1 to Increase 

Fees Associated with Non-Health Related Occupations and Professions, 5 1 DCR 4438 (4-30-04) 
( D C W  

Chapter 35, Sec. 3503, Schedule of Fees for the Registered Limited Liability Partnership Amendment Act 
of 1993,41 DCR 3 154 (5-27-94)(DCRA) 

Chapter 37, Barber and Cosmetology, 50 DCR 7699 (9-12-03) (DCR) 
Chapter 40, Health Occupations: General Rules, Sec. 4001: Application for a License, Registration, 

Renewal, or Reinstatement, $400 1.1 to Eliminating the Requirement that all Applications for 
Licensure be Attested to By a Notary Public, 5 1 DCR 167 1 (2-1 3-04) (DOH) 

~ h a ~ t e r ' 4 0 ,  Health Occupations: General Rules, $4099.1; and Chapter 48 (Chiropractic), Sec. 4800: 
General Provisions, $$4800.2 & 4804.3, Sec. 48 1 1 : Scope of Practice for Chiropractic and 
Certification for Ancillary Procedures, and Sec. 4899: Definitions, 49 DCR 6820 (7-19-02) (DOH) 

Chapter 40, Health Occupations: General Rules), $4099,1; and Chapter 48 (Chiropractic), Sec. 4800: 
General Provisions, $$4800.2 & 4804.3, Sec. 4811: Scope of Practice for Chiropractic and 
Certification for Ancillary Procedures, and Sec. 4899: Definitions, 49 DCR 11237 (12-13-02) 
P O W  

Chapter 42, Dentistry, Sec. 4203: Applicants Educated in Foreign Countries, $4203.2 (c) , 51 DCR 3272 
(3 -26-04) (DOH) 



DETRICT OF @OLUMB,IA REGISTER 

DCMR Title 17/Business, Occu~ations, and Professions Continued 

Chapter 43, Dental Hygiene, Secs. 43 lO.l(a), 43 10.2 - Amended, 42 DCR 797 (2-10-95) (DCRA) 
Chapter 43, Dental Hygiene, Sec, 43 10: Functions of Dental Hygienists, 43 10.1 & 43 10.2, 50 DCR 9240 

(10-3 1-03) (DOH) 
chapter 43, Dental Hygiene), Sec. 43 10: Functions of Dental Hygienists, $4  43 10.2 & 43 10.3, 

5 1 DCR 50 1 1 (5-14-04) (DOH) 
Chapter 43, Dental Hygiene, Sec. 43 11: Anesthesia and Nitrous Oxide Training, 5 1 DCR 8847 (9-10-04) 

@OH) 
Chapter 44, Sec. 4405, Supervised Practice by Students and Graduates (Registered Dietitians Eligble 

WE)), 41 DCR 4927 (7-22-94) 
Chapter 44, $440 1.1 Governing the Term of Licensure (Dietetics), 42 DCR 1428 (3-24-95)@CRA) 
Chapter 45, Sec. 4505, Supel-vised Practice by Students and Graduates (Nutrition), 41 DCR 4929 

(7-22-94) (DCRA) 
Chapter 45, $4501.1 Governing the Term of Licensure (Nutrition), 42 DCR 1428 (3-24-95)(DCRA) 
Chapter 46, Sec. 4605, National Examinations, 42 DCR 5019 (9-1-95) (DCRA) 
Chapter 46, Sec. 4608, Waiver for Foreign Educated Applicants of Conceded Eminence, 38 DCR 1653 

(3-15-9 l)@CRA) 
Chapter 46, Medicine, Sec. 461 1: Pre-Licensure Practice by Students and Postgraduate Physicians, 4 

461 1.5 (a)(b)(c)(d) to Establish a Monitoring Program of Postgraduate Physicians in Train,ing in 
D.C., 5 1 DCR 6028 (6-1 1-04) (DOH) 

Chapter 48, Chiropractic, Sec. 4800: General Provisions, $44800.2 & 4804.3, Sec. 481 1: Scope ofpractice 
for Chiropractic and Certification for Ancillary Procedures, and Sec. 4899: Definitions, 49 DCR 
6820 (7-19-02) (DOH) 

Chapter 48, Chiropractic, Sec. 4800: General Provisions, $$4800.2 & 4804.3, Sec. 481 1: Scope of Practice 
for Chiropractic and Certification for Ancillary Procedures, and Sec. 4899: Definitions, 
49 DCR 11237 (12-13-02) (DOH) 

Chapter 48, Chiropractic, Sec. 4800: General Provisions, 4 4800.3,4802.1 (b)(3), 4805.3,4807.17 481 1.1 
& 48 11.2,50 DCR 3955 (5-23-03) (DOH) 

Chapter 48, Chiropractic, Sec. 48 12: Vitamins and Minerals, 5 1 DCR 6628 (7-2-04) (DOH) 
Chapter 49, Sec. 4094, Waiver of Education and Examination Requirements, 38 DCR 5 166 

(8-1 6-9 l)@CRA) 
Chapter 50, Naturopathy, 39 DCR 6 129 (8-14-92)(DCRA) 
Chapter 54, Registered Nursing, 5 1 DCR 8613 (9-3-04) (DOH) 
Chapters 54 & 55, §$5411.1 & 55 1 1.1 to Provide Supervised Practi,ce by Registered and Practical Nurses 

Licensed in Another Jurisdiction, EXPIRES 120 days, 45 DCR 295 (1-16-98) (DCRA) EXPIRED 
Chapters 54 & 55, 54541 1.1 & 551 1.1 to Provide Supervised Practice by Registered and Practical Nurses 

Licensed in Another Jurisdiction, 45 DCR 1639 (3-20-98) (DCRA) 
Chapters, 54, 55, 57, 58 & 59, Subtitle: Health Occupations,~5411.15; $55 11.16; $571 1.1 115; Sec. 

5899; Sec. 5999,40 DCR 5353 (7-23-93)(DCRA) 
Chapter 56, Accreditation of Nursing Schools and Education Programs, 44 DCR 3504 (6-20-97)@CRA) 
Chapter 56, Nursing Schools and Programs, 51 DCR 7190 (7-23-04) @OH) 
Chapters 57, 58 & 59, Subtitle: Health Occupations, Amendments to Advanced Registered Nursing 

Categories, 42 DCR 3359 (6-30-95)pCR.A) 
Chapter 57, Certified Registered Nurse-Anesthetists; Chapter 58, Nurse-Midwives; Chapter 59, Nurse- 

Practitioners; and New Chapter 60, Clinical Nurse Specialist, 49 DCR 1 175 1. (12-27-02) (DOH) 
Chapter 57, Certified Registered Nurse-Anesthetists, Secs. 5703, 5705, 5706, 5707,5714, 5715, 5716; and 

Chapter 58, Nurse-Midwives, Secs. 5803, 5805, 5806,5807,5809, 5814, 5815, 5816, Chapter 59 
Nurse-Practitioners, Secs. 5903, 5905, 5906,5907, 5914, 5915, 5916, and Chapter 60, Clinical 
Nurse Specialist, Secs. 6003, 6005, 6006, 6007, 6009, 6014, 6015, 6016, 51 DCR 7228 (7-23-04) 
(DOH) 

Chapter 58, Nurse-Midwives, 49 DCR 11751 (12-27-02) (DOH) 



DlSTRlCT OF COLUMBIA REGlSTER MAR 4 - 2005 

DCMR Title 17/Business, Occupations, and Professions Continued 

Chapter 58, Nurse-Midwives, Secs. 5803, 5805,5806, 5807, 5809, 5814, 5815, 5816, 51 DCR 7228 
(7-23 -04) (DOH- 

Chapter 59, Nurse-Practitioners, 49 DCR 1 175 1 (1 2-27-02) (DOH) 
Chapter 59 (Nurse-Practitioners), Secs. 5903,5905, 5906,5907, 5914, 5915,5916, 51 DCR 7228 

(7-23-04) (DOH) 
Chapter 60, Clinical Nurse Specialist, 49 DCR 1 175 1 (12-27-02) (DOH) 
Chapter 60, Clinical Nurse Specialist, Secs. 6003, 6005,6006, 6007, 6009, 6014, 6015, 6016, 

5 1 DCR 7228 (7-23-04) (DOH) 
Chapter 6 1, Trained Medication Employee, 48 DCR 25 8 1 (3-23-0 1) (BON) 
Chapter 6 1, Trained Medication Employees, 50 DCR 9242 (1 0-3 1-03) @OH) 
Chapter 62, Nursing Home Administration, Sec. 6200: Educational Requirements, Secs. 6202,6204,6205, 

6206,6207,6208,621 1,6299; New Secs. 6209,6210,6212,51 DCR 3731 (4-9-04) (DOH) 
Chapter 62, Nursing Home Administration, Sec. 6200: Educational Requirements, Secs. 6202, 6204, 6205, 

6206,6207,6208,621 1,6299; New Secs. 6209,6210,6212,51 DCK 10622 (1 1-19-04) (DOH) 
Chapter 64, Secs. 6404 & 6405, Optometry, 41 DCR 2517 (5-6-94) 
Chapter 65, Secs. 6504, 6507, 6508 & 6509, Continuing Education and Examination Requirements for 

Pharmacists, 41 DCR 8091 (12-23-94)(DCRA) 
Chapter 66, Professional Counseling, 41 DCR 5238 (8-5-94)pCR.A) 
Chapter 66, Professional Counseling, Sec. 6609: Standards of Conduct, 50 DCR 6697 (8-15-03) (DOH) 
Chapter 67, Physical Therapy, Sec. 6704: National Examination, 886704.5 through 6704.8, 

49 DCR 11780 (12-27-02) (DOH) 
Chapter 67, Physical Therapy, Sec. 6714: Standards of Conduct, 4 6714.4, 50 DCR 2607 (4-4-03) (DOH) 
Chapter 67, Physical Therapy, to Make District Regulations Comparable to the Regulations in the 2002 

Model Practice Act for Physical Therapy Promulgated by the Federation of State Boards of 
Physical Therapy, 5 1 DCR 645 1 (6-25-04 (DOH) 

Chapter 68, Podiatry, Sec. 6804: National Examination, 4 6804.1, 6804.2 & 6804.3, 50 DCR 5294 
(7-4-03) (DOH) 

Chapter 70, Sec. 7006, Continuing Education Requirements for License to Practice Social Work, 
38 DCR 6156 (10-4-91)@CRA) 

Chapter 70, (Social Work, Sec. 7012: Waiver of Examination or Education Requirements, Repealed, 
50 DCR 9252 (10-3 1-03) (DOH) 

Chapter 70, Social Work, Sec. 7009: Standards of Conduct, 50 DCR 5881 (7-25-03) @OH) 
Chapter 70, Social Work, Sec. 701 1: Supenision of Practice by Students, Applicants and Social Workers, 

5 701 1.1,50 DCR 3 174 (4-25-03) (DOH) 
Chapter 7 1, Dance Therapy, 37 DCR 60 16 (9- 14-90)(DCRA) 
Chapter 72, Recreation Therapy, 41 DCR 5953 (8-19-94)@CRA) 
Chapter 73, Addiction Counselor, 41 DCR 5252 (8-5-94)(DCRA) 
Chapter 75, Massage Therapy, 45 DCR 77 16 (1 0-30-98) (DOH) 
Chapter 75, Massage Therapy, Sec. 7506: Continuing Education Requirements, $7506.4; and Sec. 75 13: 

Advertisement, 50 DCR 2048 (3-7-03) @OH) 
Chapter 8 1, Rules of Practice and Procedures for Hearings, 49 DCR 9285 (10-1 1-02) (ISR) 
Chapter 89, Trade Name Registration, 49 DCR 10075 (1 1-8-02) (DCRA) 

DCMR Title 18/Vehicles and Traffic (April 1995 ed.) (March 1997 Supplement) 

Chapter 1, section 100.1, 102.2 through 102.5, 102.14, 103.1, 103.7, 104.1, 107.10(c), 109.1, to establish, 
a three-tiered graduated driver's license program for drivers under the age of 21, nighttime driving 
restrictions and passenger limits for drivers under the age of 18, and to require certified driving 
experience and demonstxated safe driving habits prior to the removal of driving restrictions; Sec. 3 
of the Safe Teenage Driving Amendment Act of 1999, effective April 5,2000 @C Law 13-73, 
47 DCR 104 17) (DC LAW) 



DlsTRlCT OF CBLUMGIA REGISTER 
MAR 4 - 2005 

DCMR Title l8Nehicles and Traffic Continued 

Chapter 1, Issuance of Driver's Licenses), Sec. 103: Application for a Driver's License or Learner's 
Permit, 8 103.8 to Increase the Provisional Operators' Permit Fee, 50 DCR 108 19 (12-19-03) 
(DOMV) 

Chapter 1, Issuance of Driver's Licenses, $8106.4, 110.1 through 110.3 & 110.8 (a)(b)(c) to Permit the 
Renewal of a Driver's License Through the Mail or Over the Internet, 48 DCR 3071 (4-6-01) 
(DOMV) 

Chapter 1, Issuance of Driver's Licenses, Sec. 110: Renewal of Driver's Licenses, $ 110.8; Chapter 4 
Motor Vehicle Title and Registration, Sec. 412: Refusal of Registration, $4 12.1 (e); and Chapter 30 
Adjudication and Enforcement, Sec. 3007: Payment of Civil Fines, $ $3007.5 through 3007.9, 49 
DCR 10317 (1 1-15-02) (DOMV) 

Chapter 1, Issuance of Driver's Licenses, Sec. 1 10: Renewal of Driver's Licenses, $ 1 10.8; Chapter 4 
Motor Vehicle Title and Registration, Sec. 412: Refusal of Registration, 8412.l(e); and Chapter 30 
Adjudication and Enforcement, Sec. 3007: Payment of Civil Fines, $ $3007.5 through 3007.9, 
(REVISED), EXPIRES 10-25-02,49 DCR 7951 (8-16-02) @ O W )  

Chapter 1, Issuance of Driver's Licenses); Chapter 3 (Cancellation, Suspension, or Revocation of 
Licenses); Chapter 4 (Motor Vehicle Title and Registration); Chapter 7 (Motor Vehicle 
Equipment); Chapter 10 (Procedures for Administrative Hearings); Chapter 26 (Civil Fines for 
Moving and Non-Moving Infractions); and Chapter 30 ) Adjudication and Enforcement), 50 DCR 
4399 (6-6-03) (DOMV) 

Chapter 1, Issuance of Driver's Licenses); Chapter 3, Cancellation, Suspension, or Revocation of Licenses; 
Chapter 4, Motor Vehicle Title and Registration; Chapter 7, Motor Vehicle Equipment; Chapter 
10, Procedures for ~dministrative Hearings; Chapter 26, Civil Fines for Moving and Non-Moving 
Infractions); and Chapter 30, Adjudication and Enforcement, 50 DCR 5984 (7-25-03) (DOMV) 

Chapter 1, Issuance of Driver's Licenses); Chapter 3 (Cancellation, Suspension, or Revocation of 
Licenses); Chapter 4 (Motor Vehicle Title and Registration); Chapter 7 (Motor Vehicle 
Equipment); Chapter 10 (Procedures for Administrative Hearings); Chapter 26 (Civil Fines for 
Moving and Non-Moving Infractions); and Chapter 30 (Adjudication and Enforcement), 50 DCR 
4399 (6-6-03) OOMV) 

Chapter 1, Issuance of Driver's Licenses); Chapter 3 (Cancellation, Suspension, or Revocation of 
Licenses); Chapter 4 (Motor Vehicle Title and Registration); Chapter 10 (Procedures for 
Administrative Hearings), 52 DCR 929 (2-4-05) 

Chapter 2, School Bus Driver's License, Sec. 200: General Provisions, $ 200.5, EXPIRES 120 DAYS, 
5 1 DCR 887 1 (9-10-04) (DOMV) 

Chapter 2, School Bus Driver's License) Repealed, 5 1 DCR 109 13 (1 1-26-04) (DOMV) 
Chapter 3, section 30 1.1, 303.1 (m), 306.8 to establish .08% as the blood alcohol level at which a person is 

conclusively presumed to be operating a motor vehicle while under the influence of alcohol; Sec. 6 
of the Anti-Drunk Driving Amendment Act of 1998, effective April 13, 1999 (DC Law 12-212,46 
DCR 5) (DC LAW) 

Chapter 3, sections 303.1, 303.3,303.4,303.5,303.6,303.9, 303.10, 303.15, 307.1, 307.2 through 307.6, 
310.1, 3 10.4, 3 10.5, 3 10.7, 3 10.9, 1004.2 & 9901.1 to require suspension and revocation of driver 
licenses based upon traffic points, to assign up to a total of 5 good driving points to drivers who 
drive continuously without fines or points, to eliminate points gwen by automated traffic 
enforcement systems, Sec. 70 1 of the Motor Vehicle and Safe Driving Amendment Act of 2000, 
effective April 27,2001 @C Law 13-289,48 DCR 2057) (DC LAW) 

Chapter 3, Cancellation, Suspension, or Revocation of Licenses, $$301.l(a), 303(m), 306.8, "Anti-Drunk 
Driving Amendment Act of 1998" (DC Act 12-5 l7), 46 DCR 7 (1-1-99) (DC Act) 

Chapter 3, Cancellation, Suspension, or Revocation of Licenses, Sec. 303: Establishment of a Point 
System; and $307.3,45 DCR 7872 (1 1-6-98) (DPW) 

Chapter 3, Cancellation, Suspension, or Revocation of Licenses, $307.1; Chapter 4, Motor Vehicle Title 
and Registration, $ $4 1 1.1 l(g), 4 1 1.120); and Chapter 10, Procedures for Administrative Hearings, 
Sec. 1006: Hearing on Revocation of License, Registratio 9 e iprocity Sticker, Pursuant to the 2L1&6 



DlSTRiCf OF COLUWlRlA REGISTER 

DCMR Title 18Nehicles and Traffic Continued 

Clean Hands Act, 48 DCR 73 14 (8-10-01) (DOMV) 
Chapter 3, Suspension and Revocation for Traffic Offenses, Establishment of a Point System, Sec. 303: 

Establishment of a Point System, 9 303.2(g) repealed, 9 303.16 added; Chapter 4, Motor Vehicle 
Title and Regstration, Sec. 417: Lost, Stolen, or Mutilated Identification Tags, 8 417.2, Sec. 423: 
Personalized Identification Tags, 9 423.3, Sec. 433: Organization Tags; Chapter 6, Inspection of 
Motor Vehicles, Sec. 60 1 : Inspection Requirements, 6 60 1.4, 4 60 1.1 1 S: 60 1.12 repealed, 60 1.13, 
601.16 (a)@); Chapter 8, Safety Responsibility, Sec. 800: General Provisions, 9 800.1 (a) 
repealed, Sec. 801: Abstract of Operating Record, 6 801.5; Chapter 30, Adjudication and 
Enforcement, Sec. 3007: Payment of Civil Fines, Q; 3007.5, 8Q; 3007.13 through 3007.16 repealed, 
5 1 DCR 5029 (5-14-04) (DOMV) 

Chapter 4, Motor Vehicle Title and Registration; and Chapter 5, Motor Vehicle Dealers, EXPIRES 120 
DAYS, 5 1 DCR 8872 (9-10-04) (DOMV) 

Chapter 4, $9411.11 (f) & 41 1.12 of the "Driving Under the Influence Repeat Offenders Amendment Act 
of 2000", (D.C. Law 13-238), 48 DCR 3480 (4-20-01) (DC Law) 

Chapter 4, Motor Vehicle Title and Registration, Sec. 41 1: Registration of Motor Vehicles: General 
Provisions, 3 41 1.13 to Establish a Reinstatement Fee, 50 DC 71 77 (8-29-03) (DOMV) 

Chapter 4, Motor Vehicle Title and Registration), $9 415.5(d), 9 422.1 ,$ 423.13 & 423.14; Chapter 5, 
Motor Vehicle Dealers, 99 507.2, 507.6, 507.7 & 507.8; Chapter 6, Inspection of Motor Vehicles, 
Sec. 601: Inspection Requirements; and Chapter 30, Adjudication and Enforcement, Sec. 3001: 
Tickets Supplies, Distribution, and Security, Repealed, 5 1 DCR 8 108 (8-20-04) (DOMV) 

Chapter 4, Motor Vehicle Title and Registration, Sec. 417: Lost, Stolen, or Mutilated Identification Tags, 9 
4 17.2, Sec. 423 : Personalized Identification Tags, 9 423.3, Sec. 433 : Organization Tags, 
5 1 DCR 5029 (5-14-04) (DOMV) 

Chapter 4, Motor Vehicle Title and Regstration, Sec. 422: Display of Identification Tags, 6422.7 (a)@), 
49 DCR 11260 (12-13-02) (DOMV) 

Chapter 4, Motor Vehicle Title and Registration), Sec. 426: Special Use Identification Tag, 6 426.13, 
EXPIRES 8-1 8-04, 5 1 DCR 6048 (6-1 1-04) (DOMV) 

Chapter 4, Motor Vehicle Title and Registration, Sec. 429: Enforcement of Registration and Reciprocity 
Requirements, 49 DCR 5 8 14 (6-2 1-02) (DOMV & DPW) 

Chapter 4, Motor Vehicle Title and Registration, Sec. 432: Exceptions to Insurance Requirements is 
Repealed; Sec. 433: Organization Tags, 9 433.4, 5 1 DCR 10223 (1 1-5-04) @ O W )  

Chapter 4, Motor Vehicle Title and Registration, Regarding Temporary Tags, 5 1 DCR 11340 (12-10-04) 
(DOMV) 

Chapter 5, Motor Vehicle Dealers, $4 507.2,507.6,507.7 & 507.8,51 DCR 8108 (8-20-04) (DOMV) 
Chapter 5, Motor Vehicle Dealers, EXPIRES 120 DAYS, 5 1 DCR 8872 (9-10-04) @ O W )  
Chapter 5, Motor Vehicle Dealers, Regarding Temporary Tags, 5 1 DCR 1 1340 (12-10-04) (DOMV) 
Chapter 6, Inspection of Motor Vehicles, Sec. 601: Inspection Requirements, 5 1 DCR 8108 (8-20-04) 

@OMV) 
Chapter 6, Inspection of Motor Vehicles, Sec. 60 1 : Inspection Requirements, $ 60 1.4, 4 60 1.1 1 & 60 1.12 

repealed, 601.13, 601.16 (a)@), 5 1 DCR 5029 (5-14-04) (DOMV) 
Chapter 6, Inspection of Motor Vehicles, §.603.1,5 1 DCR 10223 (1 1-5-04) (DOMV) 
Chapter 6, Inspection of Motor Vehicles, 49601.6 & 604.8 (g), 49 DCR 748 (1-25-02) (DOMV) 
Chapter 6, Inspection of Motor Vehicles), 46601.6 & 604.8,49 DCR 11261 (12-13-02) (DOMV) 
Chapter 6, Inspection of Motor Vehicles), Sec. 601 : Inspection Requirements, $960 1.16 - 601.19; and Sec. 

609: Inspection of Non-Registered Motor Vehicles, $8 609.2 & 609.3,48 DCR 6261 (7-13-01) 
(DOMV) 

Chapter 6, Inspection of Motor Vehicles, Sec. 602: Inspection Requirements, 4660 1.6, 601.15, 601.16 & 
601.17; and Sec. 609: Inspection of Non-Registered Motor Vehicles, §609.2,47 DCR 1150 
(2-9-0 1) (DOMV) 



DISTRICt OF COLUMBlA REGISTER 

DCMR Title 18Nehicles and Traffic Continued 

Chapter 6, Inspection of Motor Vehicles, Sec. 603: Vehicle Inspection: Approved Vehicles, 5 603.4 (a) 
through (q); Sec. 604: Vehicle Inspection: Rejected Vehicles, 8 604.2; and Sec. 752: Maximum 
Allowable Levels of Exhaust Components, Q; 752.3,50 DCR 8196 (10-3-03) (DOMV) 

Chapter 6, Inspection of Motor Vehicles, Sec. 618: Automotive Emissions Repair Technician, 5618.5, 
46 DCR 420 1 (5-7-99) 

Chapter 6, Sec. 619: Vehicle Emission Recall Compliance ,44  DCR 5966 (10-17-97@PW) 
Chapter 7, General Provisions, Sec. 700: Motor Vehicle Equipment, Q; 700.9,5 1 DCR 10223 (1 1-5-04) 

(DOMV) 
Chapter 7, 5703.10, Windshield Wipers and Headlamp Regulation Amendment Act of 1998, DC Law 12- 

162, effective October 7, 1998,45 DCR 7580 (10-23-98) (DC LAW) 
Chapter 8, Safety Responsibilily, Sec. 800: General Provisions, 4 800.1 (a) repealed, Sec. 801: Abstract of 

Operating Record, 4 801.5, 5 1 DCR 5029 (5-14-04) (DOMV) 
Chapter 8, Safety Responsibility, Sec. 803: Accident Reports, is Repealed, 50 DCR 10564 (12-12-03) 

@ O W )  
Chapter 10, Procedures for Administrative Hearings), Sec. 1035: Evidence: Photo Radar De-vice, 

48 DCR 73 16 (8-10-01) @ O W )  
Chapter 1,0, Procedures for Administrative Hearings), Sec, 1035: Evidence: Photo Radar Device, 51035.2, 

50 DCR 10820 (12-19-03 (DOMV) 
Chapters 12,22 & 23, Bicyclist Responsibility Regulation Amendment Act of 1996, effective July 22, 

1996, DC Law 11-178, effective April 9, 1997,43 DCR 4240 (8-9-96) (DC LAW) 
Chapter 13, Classification and Issuance of Commercial Driver's Licenses, 5 1 DCR 109 13 (1 1-26-04) 

@OMV) 
Chapter 14, Establish Fines for Violations of the Commercial Transportation Safety Regulations, Repeal 

the Regulatory Exemption for Passenger Vehicles, Restrict Hazardous Materials Traffic to 
Specified Routes, and Establish Criteria to Determine When a Vehicle or Driver Should be Placed 
Out-of-Service, 47 DCR 8861 (1 1-3-00) (MPD) 

Chapter 20, Correction to 52000.2 [Rev. 3-20-971, last sentence should read "This section shall apply to 
pedestrians and to the operators of vehicles.", ERRATA 

Chapter 20, Secs. 2000.1 1, 2000.12 & 2000.13, "Collateral Reform Amendment Act of 1998" (DC Law 
12-87), 46 DCR 1226 (3-6-98) )DC LAW) 

Chapter 23, Repeal §$ 2302.4 & 2303.1; the fine listed in 5 2600.1 should reflect the penalties in this act - 
up to $500, plus criminal penalties or community service, Pedestrian Protection Amendment Act 
of 1978, effective October 9, 1978 (DC Law 7-34,34 DCR 5316 

Chapter 24, $82406.9, 2406.10, 2406.1 1, 241 1.2 of the "Individuals with Disabilities Parking Reform 
Amendment Act of 200OW, DC Law 13-279, effective Apri1.27,2001,48 DCR 1882 (3-2-01) @C 
L A W  

Chapter 24, 54 2406.9, 2406.1 1 to insert the phrase "individuals with disabilities"; insert the phrase 
"issued pursuant to Chapter 27 or issued by any other state or country", and insert the phrase 
"handicapped parlung procedures"; Sec. 19 of the Technical Amendments Act of 200 1, effective 
October 26,2001 (DC Law 14-42,48 DCR 7612) (DC LAW) 

Chapter 24, $8 2411.1, 2411.14, 2411.15,2411.16, 2411.7, 2411.18, 2413.4 & 2413.9 regarding 
residential parlung restrictions; Sec. 2 of the Motor Vehicle Parking Regulation Amendment Act 
of 1999, effective May 9,2000 (DC Law 13-97,47 DCR 4334( (DC LAW) 

Chapter 24, 5 $24 1 1.14 - 24 1 1.18 & amend 524 1 1.1 of the "Motor Vehicle Parlung Regulation 
Amendment Act of 1999", D.C. Law 13-97, effective May 9,2000,47 DCR 4334 (5-26-00) @C 
LAW) 

Chapter 24, 44  241 1,19, 241 1.20,2412.9, repeal 2425; Sec. 2 of the Residential Permit'Parlung Area 
Amendment Act of 2002, effective June 28, 2002 (DC Law 14-167,49 DCR 4475 (5-17-02)) @C 
LAW) 



DISTRICt OF COLUMBIA REGISTER 

DCMR Title 18Nel1icles and Traffic Continued 

Chapter 24, 32413.4 to authorize the Director to grant residential parking privileges to residents of private 
stieets that abut streets with residential parking restrictions; Sec. 2 of the Motor Vehicle 
Residential Parking Regulation Amendment Act of 2000, effective March 3 1,200 1 @C Law 
13-209,47 DCR 9435) (DC LAW) 

Chapter 24, $3 2418.3 & 2601.2 to increase the civil infractions fine for violating the engine idling 
provisions, and to make the engine idling provisions of the regulations comport with the engine 
idling provisions of the D.C. Air Pollution Act of 1984; Sec. 3 of the Motor Vehicle Excessive 
Idling Fine Increase Amendment Act of 1999, effective October 7, 1999 (DC Law 13-35,46 DCR 
60 17) (DC LAW) 

Chapter 24, Stopping, Standing, Parking, and Other Non-Moving Violations, $$ 241 1. .l(a)(b)(c), 
24 1 1.4(c), 24 1 1.19 related to Residential Permit Parking, 5 1 DCR 4774 (5-7-04) (DOT) 

Chapter 24, Stopping, Standing, Parlang, and Other Non-Moving Violations, Sec. 2420: Official Parlung 
Permits and Spaces, (j$ 2420.3 through 2420.8 to ~ e ~ u l ' a t e  Permit Parking prikleges for ANC 
Commissioners, 5 1 DCR 343 8 (4-2-04) P O T )  

Chapter 24, Sec. 2426 Saturday and Evening Parhng Meter Fee Moratorium of the "Parking ~ e t &  Fee 
Moratorium Amendment Act of 1998, D.C. Law 12-135, effective July 24, 1998,45 DCR 6506 
(9-1 1-98) (DC Law) 

Chapter 24, Sec. 2427: Streets Exempted From Parking Meter Fee Moratorium, 46 DCR 3498 (4-16-99) 
(OM) 

Chapter 25, $2603.1 strikes $25 offense of failure to comply with lawful order of a police officer; Sec. 3 of 
the "Interference with Medical Facilities and Health Professionals Amendment Act of 1996", 
effective September 20, 1996 (DC Law 1 1-157,42 DCR 3699, 10-18-96) @C LAW) 

Chapter 26, 32601.1 to increase various parking fees; Sec. 1602 of the "Fiscal Year 2003 Budget Support 
Act of 2002", effective September 25,2002, (DC Act 14-403,49 DCR 6968 (7-26-02) (DC ACT) 

Chapter 26, $2601.1 of the "Individuals with Disabilities Parlung Reform Amendment Act of 2000", DC 
Law 13-279, effective April 27,2001,48 DCR 1882 (3-2-01) (DC LAW) 

Chapter 26, Civil Fines for Moving and Non-Moving Infractions), Sec. 2600: Civil Fines for Motor 
Vehicle Moving Infractions, $2600.1, 50 DCR 10564, 50 DCR 10564 (12-12-03) (DOMV) 

Chapter 27, $9 27Ol.l,2704.3, 27 17.1 & 27 18.4 of the "Individuals with Disabilities Parhng Reform 
Amendment Act of 2000", DC Law 13-279, effective April 27,200 1,48 DCR 1882 (3-2-0 1) @C 
LAW) 

Chapter 30, Adjudication and Enforcement, to Permit the Use of Hand Held Electronic Ticketing Devices 
as an Alternative Method for the Issuing Parhng Tickets, 47 DCR 5558 (7-7-00) @OM) 

Chapter 30, Adjudication and Enforcement, to Authorize the U.S. Mint Police to Issue Tickets for 
Both Parking Moving Violations, $$3002.1 & 3003.1,49 DCR 58 16 (6-2 1-02) @PW) 

Chapter 30, Adjudication and Enforcement, Sec. 3001: Tickets Supplies, Distribution, and Security, 
Repealed, 51 DCR 8108 (8-20-04) (DOMV) 

Chapter 30, Adjudication and Enforcement, Sec. 3007: Payment of Civil Fines, $ 3007.5, $$ 3007.13 
through 3007.16 repealed, 5 1 DCR 5029 (5-14-04) @OMV) 

Chapter 40,44025.4 to prohibit parlung and loading of tour buses of Eastern Avenue, N.E., between Riggs 
Road, N.E. and Kennedy St., N.E.; Sec. 2 of the "Eastern Avenue Tour Bus Parking Prohibition 
Temporary Amendment Act of 2002", effective May 2,2002 @C Law 14-120,49 DCR 1966, 3- 
8-02) @C LAW) 

DCMR Title 19/Amusements, Parks and Recreation (June 2001 ed.) 

Chapter 1, By-Laws, Rescinding $$lO6.lO, 106.11 & 106.12 and Replace with $ 106.10 Regarding the 
Marketing Contracts Oversight Committee, 49 DCR 457 1 (5-1 7-02) (WCCA) 

Chapter 3, Procurement Rules, 49 DCR 10814, pub. 11-29-02 



DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA REGISTER 

DCMR Title 19/Amusen1ents, Parks and Recreation (June 2001 ed.) Continued 

Chapter 3, Procurement Rules, Sec. 303: General Requirements: Economic Opportunity), $ 303.4, 
50 DCR 3860 (5-16-03) (WCCA) 

Chapter 4, Bookings, 50 DCR 3035 (4-1 8-03) (WCCA) 
Chapter 7, Department of Recreation, Sec. 719: Establishment of User Fees for the Southeast Tennis and 

Learning Center and Other Similar Tennis Facilities; and Sec. 799: Definitions, 49 DCR 2479 
(3-1 5-02) (DOPR) 

Chapter 8, Public Library, Sec. 802: Circulation of Library Materials, $802.1, 5 1 DCR 2720 (3-12-04) 
(PL) 

Chapter 14, Video Arcades and Amusement Devices, Sec. 1409: Penalties, civil enforcement alternative, 
sec. 36 of the Department of Consumer and Regulatory Affairs Civil Infractions Act of 1985 
Technical and Clarifymg Amendment Act of 1990, effective 3-29-91, DC Law 8-237, 
38 DCR 3 14 (1-1 1-91) (DC LAW) 

DCMR Title 20/1Environment Web. 1997 ed.) 

Chapter 1, $199.1& 199.2; Chapter 2, Sec. 205: New Source Performance Standards, $205.1; Chapter 3, 
Operating Pern~its and Acid Rain Programs, Sec. 306: Acid Raid Program; Chapter 4, Ambient 
Monitoring, Emergency Procedures, Chemical Accident Prevention and Conformity, Sec. 402: 
Chemical Accident Prevention, Sec. 403: Determining Conformity of Federal Actions to State or 
Federal Implementation Plans; Appendix 5-1, Test Methods for Sources of Volatile Organic 
Compounds; Chapter 7, $$708.9, 708.10,708.11, 708.12 & 716 to Regulate Solvent Cleaning 
(Degreasing) Activities and Offset Lithography Printing Operations, Sec. 799; and Chapter 8, 
§$800.7(a), (d), (0 & (g) by Correcting Code of Federal Regulations (CFR), 45 DCR 7037 
(1 0-2-98) (DOH) 

Chapter 1 & 2, Secs. 199, 200,204 & 206, Notice and Comment Procedures for Permit Applications, 
44 DCR 2793 (5-9-97)(DCRA) 

Chapter 1, General Rules, $ $ 105.5 & 199.1 ; Chapter 2, General and Non-Attainment Area Permits, Add 
New Sec. 207: Pennit Requirements for Indirect Sources; Amend Chapter 7 (Volatile Organic 
Compounds and Hazardous Air Pollutants), Add New Sec. 717: National Emission Standards for 
Hazardous Air Pollutants for Source Categories; Chapter 8, Asbestos, Sulfur and Nitrogen Oxides, 
$$805.l (c), 805.6(~)(2), 805.7, 805.8; and Chapter 10, Nitrogen Oxides Emissions Budget 
Program, 47 DCR 8638 (1,O-27-00) (DOH) 

Chapters 1, 2, 5, 7 & 8 to Amend the Air Quality Regulations to Reinstate the Provision That Makes Each 
Day of Violation a New Offense and Establish NOx Emission Budget Rules That Comply with 
Requirements in the Federal Clean Air Act, 47 DCR 9686 (12-8-00) (DOH) 

Chapters 1, 2, 6, 7 & 8 of Subtitle A: Air Quality by Setting Emission Standards, 5 1 DCR 3877 (4-16-04) 
(DOH) 

Chapter 3, Operating Permits to Clarify the Requirements of the Title V Operating Permit Program; and 
Chapter 10 (Nitrogen Oxides Emissions Budget Program), Sec. 1014: NOx Budget Trading 
Program for State Implementation Plans, 48 DCR 4479 (5-18-01) @OH) 

Chapter 3, Operating Permits, $$302.3(e)(3)(c); and 303.10(a)(l)(b), 50 DCR 2343 (3-21-03) (DOH) 
Chapter 3, of Subtitle A: Air Quality (Operating Permits), Sec. 307: Enforcement for Severe Ozone 

Nonattainment Areas, 5 1 DCR 3878 (4-16-04) (DOH) 
Chapter 7, of Subtitle A: Air Quality (Volatile Organic Compounds), Secs. 7 18 through 754 Pertaining to 

the Reduction of Volatile Organic Compound Emissions, 5 1 DCR 3879 (4-16-04) @OH) 
Chapter 7, of Subtitle A: Air Quality, (Volatile Organic Compounds), Secs. 7 18 - 754, 5 1 DCR 10781, (1- 

26-04) (DOH) 
Chapter 8, Control of Asbestos - Amended, 44 DCR1979 (4-4-97) (DCRA) 
Chapter 8, Asbestos, Sulhr, Nitrogen Oxides and Lead, Sec. 806: Control of Lead, 45 DCR 20 (1 -2-98) 

( D C W  



DISTRIm OF COLUMBIA REGISTE~ MAR 4 - 2005 

DCMR Title ZOIEnvironment Continued 

Chapter 9, Sec. 900: Engine Idling, $900.1 to increase the civil infractions fine for violating the engine 
idling provisions, and to make the engine idling provisions of the regulations comport with the 
engine idling provisions of the D.C. Air Pollution Control Act of 1984; sec. 4 of the Motor 
Vehicle Excessive Idling Fine Increase Amendment Act of 1999, effective 10-7-99, DC Law 
13-35,46 DCR 6017 (7-23-99) 

Chapter 9, Sec. 904.3, Regarding the Oxygenated Fuels Program, 44 DCR 4256 (7-25-97)(DCRA) 
Chapter 9, Motor Vehicle Pollutants, Lead, Odors, and Nuisance Pollutants, Sec. 915: National Low 

Enlission Vehicle Program, 47 DCR 886 (2-1 1-00) (DOH) 
Chapter 9, Motor Vehicle Pollutants, Lead, Odors, and Nuisance Pollutants, Sec. 9 16: Heavy Duty Diesel 

Engine Emission Standards, 48 DCR 11 130 (12-7-01) (DOH) 
Chapter 10, Nitrogen Oxides Emissions Budget Program, Sec. 10 14: NOx Budget Trading Program for 

State Implementation Plans, 48 DCR 4479 (5-18-01) (DOH) 
Chapter 25, Pesticides: Administration & Enforcement), Sec. 2506: Product Registration Fees and Terms, 

g2506.2 to Increase Fees for Pesticide Products, 48 DCR 8744 (9-21-01) (DOH) 
Chapter 28, Maximum Noise Levels, Sec. 2800: Musical Instruments, Loud Speakers, Amplifiers, and 

Unamplified Voices, ERRATA, 48 DCR 11747 (12-28-01) (ODIA) 
Chapters 40 - 54, Hazardous Waste Regulations, 47 DCR 7930(9-29-00) (DOH) 
Chapters 55 through 70, Underground Storage Tank Regulations, 46 DCR 7699 (10-1-99) (DOH) 
Chapter 72, Environmental Policy Act Regulations, 44 DCR 2799 (5-9-97)(DCEO) 

DCMR Title 2ltWater and Sanitation (February 1998 ed.) 

Chapter 1, 44106.4, 112.1 & 112.2 to Increase Fees for Certain Services, 46 DCR 5943 (7-16-99) 
IWASA) 

Chapter 1, Water Supply, Sec. 106: Permits for Use of Water From Fire Hydrants, §§ 106.4; Sec. 112: 
Fees, $9 1 12.1 & 1 12.2 , and Add §§ 1 12.4 Retail and Commercial Customer Fees and Charges; 
112.5: Engineering Reviews, Sale of Documents, Maps and Manuals; and 1 12.6: Pre-Treatment 
Fees, 50 DCR 6448 (8-8-03) (WASA) 

Chapter 1, Water Supply, Sec. 1 12: Fees, 4 1 12.7 to Establish a Standard Fee Structure for Replacing 
Private Lead Water Services Lines, 5 1 DCR 6836 (7-9-04) (WASA) 

Chapter 2, Public Sewer System; and Chapter 4, Contested Water and Sewer Bills, 46 DCR 5358 
(6- 1 8-99) (WASA) 

Chapter 3, Water Meters, Secs. 300 - 3 11 & 399, 50 DCR 782 (1-24-03) (WASA) 
Chapter 3, Water Meters, Sec. 301: Meter Setters and Connections, 3Ol.2,5 1 DCR 78 1 (1-16-04) 

(WASA) 
Chapter 3, Water Meters, Sec. 309: Meter Reading and Billing, 49 DCR 8725 (9-20-02) 
Chapter 4, Contested Water and Sewer Bills), Secs. 407: Adjustment for Leaks Which Occur Between the 

Meter and the Structures that are Served by the Meter and for Underground Leaks; 408: 
Inconclusive Findings; and 409: Notice of Investigation Results and Adjusted Bills, 50 DCR 796 
(1-24-03) (WASA) 

Chapter 7, Solid Waste Control, §§ 700.1 1,707, 707.9, 707.10, 707.1 1,707.12, 708 to make amendment 
to regulations that govern rodent control; secs. 9 1 1 and 9 12 of the Fiscal Year 200 1 Budget 
Support Act of 2000, effective 10-19-00, DC Law 13-172,47 DCR 6308 (8-1 1-00) (DC LAW) 

Chapter 1 1, Water Quality Standards, 47 DCR 284 (1-2 1-00) (WASA) 
Chapter 1 I ,  Water Quality Standards, EXPIRES 5-25-02,49 DCR 1706 (2-22-02) (DOH) 
Chapter 1 1, Water Quality Standards, 49 DCR 3012 (4-5-02) (DOH) 
Chapter 1 1, Water Quality Standard, Sec. 1105: Implementation and Applicability, $3 1105.5.1005.9 and 

1 199.1,49 DCR 4854 (5-24-02) (DOH) 
Chapter 15, Discharges to Wastewater System, 47 DCR 2948 (4-28-00) (WASA) 



DISTRPeT OF COLUMBIA REGISTER MAR 4 - 2005 

DCMR Title 211Water and Sanitation Continued 

Chapter 15, Discharges to Wastewater System, Sec. 1501: Discharge Standards, § l5Ol.4,48 DCR 5564 
(6-15-01) (WASA) 

Chapter 41, Sec. 4102: Rates for Groundwater Sewer Service, 46 DCR 5945 (7-16-99) (WASA) 
chapter-41, Retail Water and Sewer Rates, to Establish New Retail Water and Sewer Rates; and Amend 

Chapter 1, Water Supply, Sec. 112: Fees to Establish Metering and Right of Way Occupancy Fees, 
49 DCR 5977 (6-28-02) (WASA) 

Chapter 41, Retail Water and Sewer Rates, Sec. 4 100: Rates for Water Service; 410 1: Rates for Sewer 
Service, §§4lOl. 1,4102.1 & 4102.2; and Sec. 4103: Fire Protection Service Fee, 94103.1, 
47 DCR 320 (1-2 1-00) (WASA) 

Chapter 41, Retail Water and Sewer Rates, Sec. 4100: Rates for Water Service, §§ 4100.1 - 4100.4; Sec. 
410 1: Rates for Sewer Service, $410 1.1,50 DCR 6452 (8-8-03) (WASA) 

Chapter 41, Retail Water and Sewer Rates), Sec. 4102: Customer Assistance Program, § 4102.1 (a)(b)(c) 
& (d), 5 1 DCR 5033 (5-14-04) (WASA) 

Chapter 41, Retail Water and Sewer Rates), Sec. 4100: Rates for Water Service, $Q; 4100.1 through 
4100.4; and Sec. 4101: Rates for Sewer Service, § 4101.1, 51 DCR 8849 (9-10-04) (WASA) 

Chapter 52, Personnel Regulations, 44 DCR 7144 (1 1-21-97) (WASA) 
Chapter 52, Personnel Regulations), Sec. 5202: Recruiting and Hiring, 95202.1; Sec. 5203: Probationary 

Period, $5203.1,5203.2; Sec. 5204: Leaves, Holidays and Other Absences, § §5204.1,5204.l(d), 
5204.2(a)(b)(c)(f), 5204.3; Sec. 5205: Compensation and Benefits, §$5205.2(a)(b)(c), 
5205.3(c)(d), 5205.9(f), 5205.10(d), 5207: Layoff and Recall, §§5207.22(d); and Sec. 5208: 
Performance, gg5208.1 - 5208.6, 50 DCR 799 (1-24-03) (WASA) 

Chapter 52, Personnel Regulations, Sec. 5207: Layoff and Recall; Sec. 5214: Restoration to Duty; 
and Sec. 5215: Severance Pay Not Pursuant to a Reduction In Force Under Section 5207,49 DCR 
532 (1-18-02) (WASA) 

Chapter 53, Procurement, EXPIRED, 46 DCR 613 (1-22-99) (WASA) 
Chapter 53, Procurement Regulations, 46 DCR 7348 (9-17-99) (WASA) 
Chapter 54, Cross Connections; and Chapter 4 (Contested Water and Sewer Bills), Secs. 400,401,402, 

410,416,424 & 499,47 DCR 1743 (2-23-0 1) (WASA) 

DCMR Title 22lPublic Health and Medicine (Aup;. 1986 ed.) 

Chapter 1, Secs. 130 - 154, Immunization of School Children, 44 DCR 1656 (3-2 1-97)(0M) 
Chapter 1, 7, 20 - 23, Sec. 11 1.16, Civil Enforcement Alternative, Sec. 8 of the DCRA Civil Infractions 

Act of 1985 Technical and Clarifying Amendments Act of 1990, effective 3-29-91 DC Law 8-237, 
38 DCR 3 14 (1-1 1-91) (DC LAW) 

Chapter 2, Communicable and Reportable Diseases, §201.5(a), 205.8; Sec. 206: Human 
Immunodeficiency Virus (HIV) Infection; and Sec. 21 1: Laboratories and Blood Banks, 
47 DCR 10209 (12-29-00) @OH) 

Chapter 2, Scc. 215: Monitoring and Reporting the Occurrence of Cancer; Sec. 216: Quality 
Assurance/Access to Records; Sec. 2 17: Confidentiality; and Sec. 2 1 8: Penalties, 42 DCR 6379 
(1 1-1 7-95) @HS) 

Chapter 2, Communicable and Reportable Diseases), Secs, 215 - 218,47 DCR 3493 (5-19-99) (DOH) 
Chapter 2, Communicable and Reportable Diseases), §201.5(a), 205.8; Sec. 206: Human 

Immunodeficiency Virus (HIV) Infection; and Sec. 2 1 1 : Laboratories and Blood Banks, 
48 DCR 472 (1-19-0 1) @OH) 

Chapter 2, Communicable and Reportable Diseases), Sec. 20 1 :Communicable Diseases, 20 1.1 (k) Severe 
Acute Respiratory Syndrome (SARS), 50 DCR 6169 (8-1-03) (DOH) 

Chapter 2, Com,municable and Reportable Diseases, Sec. 2 19: Temporary Control of Influenza Vaccine: 
and Sec. 220: Penalty, EXPIRES 2-11-05,51 DCR 9914 (10-22-04) (DOH) 



DISTRW OF COLUMBIA REGISTER 

DCMR Title 22IPublic Health and Medicine Continued 

MAR 4 - 2005 

Chapter 2, Communicable and Reportable Diseases, Sec. 219: Temporary Control of Influenza Vaccine, 
Sec. 220: Penalty, Expires 2-11-05,52 DCR 576 (1-21-05)(DOH) 

Chapter 4, Drug Manufacture and Distribution, 39 DCR 7729 (1 0- 16-92) (DCRA) 
Chapter 5, Sec. 502, Rescheduling of the Drug Buprenorphine, 33 DCR 6908 (1 1-7-86)@CRA) 
Chapter 5, Controlled Substances, 32 DCR 1097 (2-22-85)(DCRA) 
Chapter 7, Spay-neuter Fees, 32 DCR 3021 (5-3 1-85)@HS) 
Chapter 7, Sec. 700.12, Civil Enforcement Alternative, Sec. 39 of the DCRA Civil Infractions Act of 1985 

Technical and Clarifylng Amendments Act of 1990, D.C. Law 8-237, effective March 29, 1991, 
38 DCR 3 14 

Chapter 7, Secs. 730 to 733 - DELETED, Anirnals,Pet Shops and Animal Hospitals, superseded at 
35 DCR 6630 (9-2-88)@CRA) 

Chapter 10, Sec. 1001, Deschedules the Drug Loperamide from Schedule V of the Uniform Controlled 
Substances Act, 34 DCR 4370 (7-10-87)(DCRA) 

Chapter 10, Sec. 1030: Controlled Substances Fees; and Amend 20 DCMR, Chapter 23, Sec. 2303: 
Medical Devices Fees, 43 DCR 3858 (7-19-96) (OM) 

Chapter 12, Controlled Substances Act Rules, 39 DCR 1882 (3-20-92)@CRA) 
Chapter 12, Transferring the Narcotic Levo-alphacetylmethadol (LAAM) from Schedule I to Schedule II, 

and Adds Specific Anabolic Steriods to Schedule III of the D.C. Controlled Substances Act of 
198 1,41 DCR 7967 (12-16-94)@CRA) 

Chapter 12, Controlled Substances Act Rules) to Add New Substances and Correct Errors, EXPIRED 
12-21-00,47 DCR 75 12 (9-15-00) (DOH) 

Chapter 12, Controlled Substances Act Rules), Secs. 1200, 1201, 1202, 1203, 1204, 1205 to Add New 
Substances and Correct Errors, 47 DCR 9 14 (2-2-0 1) (DOH) 

Chapter 12, Controlled Substances Act Rules, 5 1 DCR 4080 (4-23-04) @OH) 
Chapter 32, Civil Infractions, Sec. 3239: Operation of Group Homes for Mentally Retarded, 

Persons§§3239.l(c), 3239.1(d), and 3239.2(d) ,47  DCR 3209 (5-5-00) (DOH) 
Chapter 13, Sec. 1330, Therapeutically Equivalent Prescription Drugs, 36 DCR 8 154 (12-1-89)@HS) 
Chapter 13, Sec. 1331, Pharmacy Fees; and Sec. 1332, Drug Manufacturers and Distributors, 

42 DCR 5016 (9-1-95) (DCRA) 
Chapter 16, Provision of Respite Care for Mentally Retarded Persons, 34 DCR 33 19 (5-22-87)@HS) 
Chapter 17, Standards for Payment of Habilitation and Care for Customers of the Mental Retardation and 

Developmental Disabilities ~dministration, EXPIRES 120 DAYS, 48 DCR 1035 8 (1 1-9-0 1) 
P H s ) )  

Chapter 19, Pharmacies, 38 DCR 6734 (1 1-8-91)(DCRA) 
Chapters 20 - 23,Civil Enforcement Alternative, Sec. 7 of the DCRA Civil Infractions Act of 1985 

Technical and Clarifylng Amendments Act of 1990, D.C. Law 8-237, effective March 29, 1991, 
38 DCR 314 

Chapters 20 & 3 1, Licensing Fees for Healthcare and Community Residence Facilities, 43 DCR 473 1 
(8-30-96) (OM) 

Chapter 20, Hospitals and Clinics, Sec. 2099: Definitions; Chapter 22 (Categories of Hospital Services, 
Sec. 2204: Newborn Hearing Screening Service; and Chapter 26 (Maternity Centers), §2600.8,49 
DCR 4857 (5-24-02) (DOH) 

Chapter 20, Hospitals and Clinics, Sec. 2099: Definitions; Chapter 22 (Categories of Hospital Services, 
Sec. 2204: Newborn Hearing Screening Service; and Chapter 26 (Maternity Centers), g2600.8, 
CORRECTED NOTICE, 49 DCR 6130 (7-5-02) (DOH) 

Chapters 20,21, & 22 to Authorize Qualified I-Iealth Professionals to Perform Duties Formerly Done Only 
by Physicians and to Require Physicians to Have an Annual Health Examination Performed by 
Another Physician, 50 DCR 4 162 (5-30-03) (DOH) 

Chapter 22, Categories of Hospital Services, Sec. 2204: Newborn Hearing Screening Service, 
49 DCR 4857 (5-24-02) (DOH) 

Chapter 24, Sec. 241 1, Fee for the Distribution of Cadavers, 35 DCR 9052 (12-30-88)(AB) 



DBSTRlCY OF COLUMBIA REGISTER MAR 4 - 7005 
DCMR Title 22IPublic Health and Medicine Continued 

Chapter 24, Sec. 2409, Fees for Copies of Records G d  Reports, 42 DCR 4085 (8-4-95)(DHS) 
Chapter 26, Maternity Centers,, 46 DCR 2779 (3-19-99) (DOH) 
Chapter 26, Maternity Centers, CORRECTED NOTICE, 46 DCR 3970 (4-30-99) (DOI-I) 
Chapter 26 (Maternity Centers), $2600.8,49 DCR 4857 (5-24-02) (DOH) 
Chapters 27 & 28, Criteria for Adult and Pediatnc Trauma Centers, 39 DCR 3530 (5-22-92)(DHS) 
Chapter 27, Adult Trauma Care; and Chapter 28 (Pediatric Trauma Care), 46 DCR 874 1 (1 0-29-99) 

@OH) 
Chapter 27, Adult Trauma Care, to Change the Standard of Care in, and Qualifications for Certification of, 

Level I and Level II Adult Trauma Facilities, 5 1 DCR 7260 (7-23-04) (DOH) 
Chapter 28, Pediatric Trauma Care, 46 DCR 874 1 (10-29-99) (DOH) 
Chapter 28, Pediatnc Trauma Care, to Change the Standard of Care in, and Qualifications for Certification 

of, Level I and Level TI Pediatric Trauma Care Facilities, 5 1 DCR 7277 (7-23-04) (DOH) 
Chapter 29, Public Health Laboratory, Sec. 2900: Public Health Laboratory Fees, 49 DCR 3693 (4-19-02) 

@OH) 
Chapter 29, Public Health Laboratory to Add Test Service Categories, Services and Fees, 50 DCR 995 (1- 

3 1-03) @OH) 
*Chapters 30 - 38, Health Care and Community Residence Facilities Supplement Published as a Separate 

Volume Dated February 1995 
Chapter 30, Sec. 3013, Revised Rates for Selected Services Provided by Commission on Public Health 

Clinics, 40 DCR 6262 (8-27-93) 
Chapter 30, Sec. 3023.1(a), Rules Governing Reimbursement Rates for Medical Charities Patients - 

Amended, 37 DCR 5896 (9-7-90)(DHS) 
Chapter 30, Sec. 3019, Physical Therapist's Fee for the Home Care Services Bureau, Dept. of Human 

Services, 32 DCR 6565 (1 1-15-85)(0M) 
Chapter30, $ 6  3020, 3020.3, 3020.5, 3020.6, 3020.11, 3020.13, 3020.16,3020.17 to amend the 

Community Residence Facilities Licensure Act of 1977 to abolish certain health-related duties and 
to transfer others to the Department of Health; sec. 301 of the Fiscal Year 1998 Revised Budget 
Support Act of 1997, effective 3-20-98, DC Law 12-60, 44 DCR 7378 (DC LAW) 

Chapter 30, Sec. 3023, Rates for Reimbursement for Inpatient Hospital Services, Newborn Care and 
Outpatient/Emergency Room Services for D.C. Medical Charities Eligbles, 33 DCR 7388 
(1 1-28-86)(DHS) 

Chapter 30, Sec. 3023, Reimbursement for Services to Persons Eligble for D.C. Medical Charities, 
4 1 DCR 7675 (1 1-25-94)(DHS) 

Chapter 30, Sec. 3023, Reimbursement for Services to Persons Eligible for D.C. Medical Charities, $9 
3023.1,3023.3 & 3023.6,46 DCR 7290 (9-17-99) (DOH) 

Chapter 30, Sec. 3024, Medical Services at Sharpe Health School, 38 DCR 2129 (4-12-91)(0M) 
Chapter 30, Sec. 3024, Copayment Charges (Prescription Drugs and Eyeglasses), EXPIRES 7-29-97, 

44 DCR 3 122 (5-30-97)@0H) 
Chapter 30, Sec. 3025, FeesJSliding Fee Scale for Cornrn. on Mental Health Services, 

35 DCR 6026(8-5-88)(0M) 
Chapter 30, Sec. 3026: Alcohol and Drug Abuse Services Fees, 42 DCR 3876 (7-28-95)(0M) 
Chapter 30, Sec. 3027, Sliding Fee Scale for Early Intervention Svces, 42 DCR 1460 (3-24-95)(0M) 
Chapter 30, Secs. 3027 & 3028, Standards for Payment of Early Intervention Services for Families of 

Children with Developmental Delay), Sec. 3027: Purpose; and Sec. 3028: Fees for Early 
Intervention Services, 44 DCR 5501 (9-26-97)(DHS) 

Chapter 30, Sec. 3030, Maximum Per Diem Rates for Medical Services Provided to Patients at Forest 
Haven and D.C. village, 3 1 DCR 559 (2-10-84)(0M) 

Chapter 30, Sec. 3035: Copayment Charges, 44 DCR 5671 (10-3-97)@0H 
Chapter 3 1, Licensing of Health Care and Community Residence Facilities, 39 DCR 5098 

(7-1 0-92)(DCRA) 
Chapter 32, Sec. 3233.8, Qualifications of Patient Activities Director, D.C. Law 2-35, Sec. 501(d)(9)(B), 

24 DCR 1458 (8-19-77)(Errata) 



DCMR Title 22/Public Health and Medicine Continued 

*Fees for Certain Mental Health, Therapy, and Alcohol and Drug Rehabilitation Services, 3 1 DCR 33 12 
(7-6-84)(0M) 

Chapter 32, Nursing Facilities, 49 DCR 473 (1-18-02) (DOH) 
Chapter 32, Nursing Facilities, Sec. 32 1 1 : Nursing Personnel; Sec. 32 16: Freedom from Restraints, Sec. 

3222: Immunizations; and 3299: Definitions, 49 DCR 6824 (7-19-02) (DOH) 
Chapter 32, Nursing Facilities, Sec. 3211: Nursing Facilities, 52 DCR 1327 (2-1 1-05) @OH) 
Chapter 33, Intermediate Nursing Care Facilities (DELETED), 42 DCR 567 (1-27-95)@HS) 
Chapter 33, Health Care Safety Net Administration, 48 DCR 9140 (10-5-01) (FRtvlAA) 
Chapter 34, Mental Health Rehabilitation Services Provider Certification Standards, 48 DCR 10297 (1 1-9- 

01) W f W  
Chapter 34, Mental Health Rehabilitation Services Provider Certificatioi~ Standards), $8 3423.1 to 

Conform with the D.C.'s State Medicaid Plan and Define "Assertive Community Treatment", 
50 DCR 7746 (9-12-03) (DMH) 

Chapter 35, Licensure of Group Homes for Mentally Retarded Persons, 39 DCR 3280 (5-8-92)(DHS) 
Chapter 35, Group Homes for Mentally Retarded Persons, §§35 19.10 & 3599,47 DCR 1898 (3- 17-00) 

@OW 
Chapter 35, Secs. 3520, 3521 & 3522, Regarding the Licensure of Group Homes for Mentally Retarded 

Persons - Amended, 44 DCR 7445 (12-5-97)(DHS) 
Chapter 38, Community Residence Facilities for Mentally Ill Persons, 42 DCR 569 (I-27-95)(DHS) 
Chapter 39, Home Care Agencies, 5 1 DCR 2876 (3-19-04) @OH) 
Chapter 40, Sec. 4004, Standards for Exemption of Transactions and Projects from the Certificate of r 

Need Process, 42 DCR 7286 (12-29-95) (DHS) 
Chapters 41 & 46, Sec. 4100.2,4600-4607,4699; Revised Special Certificate of Need Procedures, 

Considerations and Criteria for Review of Magnetic Resonance Imaging Scanners, 
35 DCR 5803 (7-29-88)(DHS) 

Chapter 44, Provision of Uncompensated Care and Community Services, 36 DCR 5819 (8-1 1-89)(DI-IS) 
Chapter 44, Sec. 4414, Compliance Alternative for CON Holders with Small Annual Obligations, 

36 DCR 7608 (1 1 -3-89)(DHS) 
Chapter 47, Health-Care Facility Unlicensed Personnel Criminal Background Check, 47 DCR 294 

(1-12-01) 
Chapter 47, Health-Care Facility Unlicensed Personnel Criminal Background Check, 49 DCR 6835 

(7-19-02) (DOH) 
Chapter 49, Nurse Staffing Agencies, 5 1 DCR 10633 (1 1-19-04) (DOH) 
Chapter 50, Revised HospitalIPhysician Billing Rates at D.C. General Hospital, 34 DCR 189 

(1-9-87)(DGH) 
Chapter 50, Hospital Rates for D.C. General Hospital, 3 1 DCR 6258 (12-14-84)@GH) 
Chapter 50,Bospital Rates for D.C. General Hospital - Amended, 38 DCR 88 1 (2-1-9 l)(DGH) 
Chapter 50, Increase in Hospital and Physician Billing Rates for FY 1992 at D.C. General Hospital, 

38 DCR 6777 (1 1-8-9 l)@CGH) 
Chapter 50, Rate Increases for D.C. General Hospital, 41 DCR 4166 (6-24-94)(DCGH) 
Chapter 55, Standards for Prepaid Providers Qualifying to Serve D.C. Medicaid Recipients, 34 DCR 1550 

(3-6-87)(DHS) 
Chapter 60, Health Benefits Plan Members Bill of Rights, 47 DCR (1-14-00) @OH) 
Chapter 60, Health Benefits Plan Members Bill of Rights, Sec. 60 13: Assessment of the Insurer, $60 13.1 

Regarding the Health Insurers Assessment Formula, 48 DCR 6444 (7-20-0 1) (DOH) 
Chapter 64, Swinnning Pools and Spas, 50 DCR 760 (1-24-03) (DOH) 
Chapters 67, 68 & 69, Radiation: Administration & Enforcement; Licensing Users of Radioactive 

Material; and Specific License Procedures (to be recodified from Chapters 20,2 1 & 22 of DCMR 
Title 22) 

Chapter 73, Neonatal Testing for Metabolic Disorders, 46 DCR 10170 (12-17-99) (DOH) 
Chapter 75, Criteria for Establishment of a List of Potential Receivers, 35 D,CR 762 (2-5-88)(DCRA) 

2249 
3 1 



DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA REGISTER MAR 4 - 2005 

DCMR Title 22lPublic Health and Medicine Continued 

Chapter 80, Procedures Governing the Administration of Public Health Grants, 3 8 DCR 443 1 
(7- 19-9 l)(DHS) 

Chapter 80, Sec. 800.3, Amend Rules Governing the Administration of Public Health Grants, 
40 DCR 3 168 (5-14-93)pHS) 

Chapters 8 1 - 90 to Issue Policies, Practices, and Procedures Relating to the Terms and Conditions of 
Employment of Personnel, 45 DCR 7353 (10-9-98) (HHPBC) 

Chapters 81 - 90, to Issue Policies, Practices, and Procedures Relating to the Terms and Conditions of 
Employment of Personnel, CORRECTION NOTICE, 45 DCR 7727 (10-30-98) (HHPBC) 

Chapters 95 - 98, D.C. General Hospital Procurement Regulations, 41 DCR 4508 (7-8-94)pCGH) 

DCMR Title 22AIPublic Health and Medicine* 

Chapter 1, Consent to Treatment, 12-13-02,49 DCR 1 1245 (12-13-02) (DMH) 
chapter 3, Consumer Grievance Procedures, 50 DCR 8480 (10-10-03) (DM) 
Chapter 5, Use of Restraints and Seclusion, EXPIRES 120 DAYS, 5 1 DCR 11863 (12-3 1-04) (DMH) 
Chapter 12, Department of Mental Health Priority Populations - General Requirements, 49 DCR 581 1 

(6-2 1-02) (DMH) 
Chapter 22, Standards for Supported Housing for HMH Consumers, 50 DCR 3 175 (4-25-03) (DMH) 

DCMR Title 23 Alcoholic Beverapes and Food (August 2004 ed.) 

Chapter 3, Limitations on Licenses, Sec. 304: Adarns Morgan Moratorium Zone, EXPIRES 120 DAYS, 
5 1 DCR 8669(9-3-04) (ABC) 

Chapter 3, Limitations on Licenses, Sec. 305: Georgetown Moratorium Zone, EXPIRES 120 DAYS, 
5 1 DCR 8674 (9-3-04) (ABC) 

Chapter 3, Limitations on Licenses, Sec. 308: Glover Park Moratorium Zone, EXPIRES 120 DAYS, 
5 1 DCR 8677 (9-3-04) (ABC) 

Chapter3, Limitati,ons on Licenses, Sec. 306: East Dupont Circle Moratorium Zone, EXPIRES120 DAYS 
52 DCR 1321 (2-1 1-05) (ABRA) 

DCMR Title 241Public Space and Safetv Oec. 1996) 

Chapter 1, Occupation and Use of Public Space, $$101.7 & 199.1; and Chapter 34 (Public Space or Public 
Rights of Way Management of Excavation Work), $§34Ol.l6,34Ol .I7 & 340 l.l8), 48 DCR 3075 
(4-6-0 1) (DPW) 

Chapter 1, Occupation and Use of Public Space, Sec. 107: Streetlights, Street Signs, Trees, and Fixtures, 4 
107.8 to allow for the erection of banners, ornaments, and lights on public lampposts, buildings, or 
traffic lights across a street or avenue to celebrate national and District holidays; sec. 2 of the 
Banner Amendment Act of 2000, effective 4-3-01, DC Law 13-233,48 DCR 588 (DC LAW) 

Chapter 1, Occupation and Use of Public Space, Sec. 1 16: Installation of Personalized Markers in the 
Public Space by the Make a Difference Foundation; and Chapter 1 1 (Downtown Streetscape), Sec. 
1105: Standards for SidewalkTreatrnent, $1 105.7,49 DCR 4099 (5-3-02) (DPW) 

Chapter 1, Occupation and Use of Public Space, 4 199.1 to Amend the Definition of "Person", 
49 DCR 6566 (7-12-02) (DOT) 

Chapter5, $8  501.4, 501.11, 501.15, 501.16, 501.17, 502.4, 502.6, 502.10, 502.12, 502.13, 503.6, 503.8, 
505.4, 505.10, 508.5, 509.1, 509.3, 510.21, 512.1, 513.9, 515.3, 515.16, 515.26, 515.31,515.32 
& 599.1, to regulate the number of vendors allowed to occupy a side of any block and to establish 
procedures for assigning vendors to locations in the central vending zone; sec. 1 10 1 of the 
Omnibus Regulatory Reform Amendment Act of 1998, effective 4-29-98 (DC Law 12-86, 
46 DCR 1172 (DC LAW) 



DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA REGISlER MAR 4 - 2005 

DCMR Title 24lPublic Space and Safetv Continued 

Chapter 4, Sec. 5 13 : Food Vending Operations, $5 13.1, to make a conforming amendment; sec. 7 of Food 
Regulation Amendment Act of 2002, effective 5-2-02, DC Law 14-1 16,49 DCR 1945 (3-8-02) 
(DC LAW) 

Chapter 5, Sec. 5 15.13, to Add a New Vending Site in the Ward 6 Neighborhood Commercial Zone, 
44 DCR 469 1 (8- 15-97)(DCRA) 

Chapter 5, Secs. 5 13.7,513.8,515.l9Cj) & 599.1 to Add to the List of Approved Food Items and Establish 
Additional Health Inspection Requirements, 44 DCR 41 15 (7-1 8-97)(DCRA) 

Chapter 5, $$513.7,513.8,515.190'), 513.9 & 513.10 to Add to the List of Approved Food Items, 46 DCR 
45 12 (5-21-99) (DCRA) 

Chapter 5, Sec. 515.16 to Add Certain Streets to the List of Non-Vending Streets in the Central Vending 
Zone, 44 DCR 7304 (1 1-28-97) (DCRA) 

Chapter 5, Sec. 515.16 to Add to the List of Non-Vending Streets (FBI Facility), 45 DCR 468 (1-23-98) 
ww 

Chapter 5, $5 15.16 to Add to the List of Non-Vending Streets (FBI Facility), 46 DCR 45 16 (5-2 1-99) 
(DCRA) 

Chapter 5, Secs. 5 15.17, To Delete Certain Vending Sites from the Central Vending Zone, EXPIRES 
5-1.1-98,44 DCR 3505 (6-20-97)(DCRA) 

Chapter 7, Parades and Public Events, Sec. 720: Special Events User Fees, 43 DCR 6577 (12-13-96) (OM) 
Chapter 1 1, Downtown Streetscape, 47 DCR 71 17 (9-1-00) (DPW) 
Chapter 13, Sec. 1380, Schedule of Fines for Violations of the Litter Control Regulations - Amended, 

44 DCR 1864 (3-28-97) (DPW) 
Chapter 13, Civil Fines Under DC Law 6-loo), Sec. 1380: Schedule of Fines for Violations of the Litter 

Control Administration Act, $ 1380.2 to Establish Penalties for Violations for Excavations, 
EXPIRES 120 DAYS, 48 DCR 6465 (7-20-01) @PW) 

Chapter 13, Civil Fines Under DC Law 6-1 OO), Sec. 13 80: Schedule of Fines for Violations of the Litter 
Control Administration Act, 9 1380.4 to ~stablish Penalties for Violations for Excavations, 
49 DCR 8225 (8-23-02) (DOT) 

Chapter 24, Special Trees, 52 DCR 546 (1-21-05) 
Chapter 25, Metropolitan Police Department Use of Closed Circuit Television, 49 DCR 1 1443 (12-20-02) 

W D )  
Chapter 33, (Public Rights-of-way Occupancy Permits, $$3300,3304,3305 & 3399,43 DCR 6581 

(12-13-96) (DPW) 
Chapter 33, Public-Rights-of-way Occupancy Permits, Sec. 3301: Occupation of Public Sidewalks with 

Personalized Pavers, 45 DCR 1644 (3-20-98) @PW) 
Chapter 33, Public Right-of-way Occupancy Permits, by Adding Sec. 3302: Occupancy of Public 

Right-of-way with Stand-Alone Conduit, Pipes, Aerial Wire, or Surface Structures Housing 
Transmission Facilities; and Amending Secs. 3304 & 3399,47 DCR 2353 (3-31-00) @PW) 

Chapter 33, Public Righ-Of-Way Occupancy Permits, 8 8 3302.8,3302.9, 3302.10, to revise the fees 
established for public rights of way occupancy permits; sec. 502 of the Fiscal Year 2001 Budget 
Support Act of 2000, effective 10-19-00, DC Law 13-172,47 DCR 6308 (DC LAW) 

Chapter 33, Public Rights-of-way Occupancy Permits, Sec. 3303: Occupancy of Public Rights-of-way for 
the Purpose of Accessing Manholes, 48 DCR 5375 (6-8-01) (DPW) 

Chapter 33, Public Rights-of-way Occupancy Permits), Sec. 3304: Occupancy of the Public Right of Way 
by Tour Buses; Sec. 3310 & 3399,49 DCR 8562 (9-13-02) (DOT) 

Chapter 34, Public Space Management of Excavation Work, 47 DCR 2360 (3-3 1-00) @PW) 
Chapter 34, Public Space Management of Excavation Work, $9 340 1.9, 340 1.10 & 3404.7, and Add 

3403.5 & 3403.6 to Revise Procedures and Standards Governing the Excavation and Restoration 
of Public Space or Public Rights-of-way, 50 DCR 1905 (2-28-03) (DOT) 

Chapter 34, Public Space or Public Rights of Way Management of Excavation Work, $9340 1.16,340 1.17 
& 34Ol.l8,48 DCR 3075 (4-6-01) @PW) 

Chapter 34, Public Space Management of Excavation Work, $4 3403.173403.3, and New Secs. 3404 & 
3405,47 DCR 9505 (12-1-00) (DPW) 2251 

3 3 



MAR 4 - 2005 
DISTRIU OF COLUMBIA REGISTER 

DCMR Title 25IFood and Food Operations (Aug. 2003) 

No Amendments 

DCMR Title 26finsurance (Feb. 1985) 

Broker-Dealer and Investment Adviser Regulations, EXPIRES 120 DAYS, 48 DCR 1987 (3-2-01) (ISR) 
Chapter 1, Licensure as Insurance Agent or Insurance Broker, 47 DCR 3498 (5-19-00) (ISR) 
Chapter 1, Licensure as Insurance Produced, 50 DCR 1037 1 (12-5-03) (ISR) 
Chapters 3,4, 5, 6, 8, 17, & 18, Rules to Implement Provisions of D.C. Law 6-96, Compulsory/No Fault 

Motor Vehicle Insurance Act of 1982 Amendments Act of 1985; and to Establish the Uninsured 
Motorist Fund, 35 DCR 7649 (1 0-2 1 -88)(DCRA) 

Chapter 5, Secs. 500.8 & 503.2, 31 DCR 1287 (3-16-84)(DCRA) 
Chapter 6, To Reflect ~bdifications to the D.C. Automobile Insurance Plan, 40 DCR 7428 

(10-22-93)(DCRA) 
Chapter 6, Sec. 602: Administration, Sec. 605: Distribution of Applicants, Sec. 607: Administration 

of Distribution Procedures, Sec. 610: Bodily Injury and Property Damage Coverage, Sec. 614: 
Application for ~sslgnment, Sec. 621: Additional Vehicle or Coverage, Sec. 625: 

Cancellation and Denials, and Sec. 699: Definitions, 43 DCR 2306 (5-3-96) (DCRA) 
Chapter 6, Motor Vehicle Insurance: D.C. Automobile Insurance Plan, $4602.6, 605.2(d), New 

$$627.ll& 627.1, 629.7, and 630.5,47 DCR 6220 (8-4-00) (ISR) 
Chapter 6, D.C. Automobile Insurance Plan, Secs. 603, 605,607, 612,614,616, 618, 621,625, 627 & 

630,45 DCR 8544 (12-4-98) (ISR) 
Chapter 6, Motor Vehicle Insurance: D.C. Automobile Insurance Plan, Secs, 604, 616, 623 & 625, 

46 DCR 983 8 (1 1-26-99) (ISR) 
Chapter 6, Motor Vehicle Insurance: D.C. Automobile Insurance Plan, $$605.5,605.6 & 617.4, 

47 DCR 9342 (1 1-24-00) (ISR) 
Chapter 6, Motor Vehicle Insurance: D.C. Automobile Insurance Plan, $8605.5 (c) & 605.6 (c), 

48 DCR 9637 (10-19-01) (IRS) 
Chapter 6, District of Columbia Automobile Insurance Plan, 49 DCR 11395 (12-20-02) (ISR) 
Chapter 6, D.C. Automobile Insurance Plan, Sec. 616: Designation of Company and Effective Date of 

Coverage, $8 616.2, 616.6, 616.12 through 616.21; Sec. 619: First and Second Renewal Policies, 
$ $ 6 19.1 (a); Sec. 62 1 : AdditiodDeletion of Vehicles or Addition/Reduction~Elirnination of 
Coverages, $ 5  62 1.1,621.4 (b); Sec. 630: Performance Standards for Procedures of Record, $6 
630.1 (d), 630.9; Sec. 63 1: Registration to Access the Electronic Application Submission 
Interface, $$ 63 1.1 through 63 1.3 (a)@); and Sec. 699: Definitions, 50 DCR 8 192 (10-3-03) (ISR) 

Chapter 6, D.C. Automobile Insurance Plan, Sec. 616: Designation of Company and Effective Date of 
Coverage; Sec. 63 1 : Change of Ownership or Transfer of Loss Experience; and Sec. 634: 
Registration to Access the Electronic Application Submission Interface (EASi), 5 1 DCR 52 18 (5- 
2 1 -04) (ISR) 

Chapter 6, D.C. Automobile Insurance Plai, Chapter 6 Repealed and Amended, 5 1 DCR 11849 
(1 2-3 1-04) (ISB) 

Chapter 1 3  (Errata) 52 DCR 5 1 (1-7-05) 
Chapter 7, Sec. 700.7, Assigned Claims Bureau -Amended, 33 DCR 6192 (10-10-86)(WCRA) 
Chapter 8, Taxicab Insurance, Sec. 801 : Premiums, 5 1 DCR 7298 (7-23-04) (ISR) 
Chapter 8, Secs. 80 1 & 805, Establish a New Method of Calculating Premiums Charged by Taxicab 

Insurers, 42 DCR 1782 (4-14-95)(WDCRA) 
Chapter 8, Secs. 801.3 & 801.4, Insurance Administration, Taxicab Insurance Limits of Liability and 

Premium Rates, 35 DCR 5099 (7-1-88)@CRA) 
Chapter 1 1, Annuity Mortality Tables, 47 DCR 2414 (4-7-00) (ISR) 



DISTRICT OF COLUMBM REGISTER MAR 4 - 2005 

DCMR Title 26Dnsurance Continued 

Chapter 13, Insurance Placement Facilities, Sec. 13 10: Annual and Special Meetings of Members of the 
Facility, 8 13 10.6,48 DCR 4663 (5-25-01) (ISR) 

Chapter 13, Insurance Placement Facilities, 5 1 DCR 1 1573 (12-24-04) (ISB) 
Chapter 16, Insurance Holding Company System Regulations, , 41  DCR 21 85 (4-22-94) (IA/DCRA 
Chapter 19, Insurance Coverage for Drug Abuse, Alcohol Abuse, and Mental Illness, 36 DCR 4922 

(7-14-89)@CRA.) 
Chapter 20, Free Clinic Insurance Assistance Program, 36 DCR 1797 (3-10-89)(DCRA) 
Chapter 2 1, Sinking Fund, 36 DCR 5 1 13 (7-2 1-89)@CRA) 
Chapter 22, Medicare Supplement Insurance Minimum Standards, 40 DCR 3 858 (6-1 8-93)@CRA) 
Chapter 22, Medicare Supplement Insurance Minimum Standards - Amended, 44 DCR 3090 (5-30-97) 
Chapter 22, Medicare Supplement Insurance Minimum Standards EXPIRED, 46 DCR 4565 (5-21-99) 

(ISR) 
Chapter 22, Medicare Supplement Insurance Minimum Standards, 46 DCR 10 175 (1 2-1 7-99) (ISR) 
Chapter 22, Medicare Supplement Insurance Minimum Standards, 47 DCR 49 17 (6-1 -0 1) (ISR) 
Chapter 22, Medicare Supplement Insurance Minimum Standards, 50 DCR 5 882 (7-25-03) (ISR) 
Chapter 22, Medicare Supplement Insurance Minimum Standards, Sec. 2209: Guaranteed Issue for 

Eligible Persons, $ 2209.6 (a)@)(c)(d)(e), EXPIRES 120 DAYS, 5 1 DCR 225 1 (2-27-04) (ISR) 
Chapter 23, Reinsurance$. 4 1 DCR 22 14 (4-22-94) (IA/DCRA) 
Chapter 24, Company Org., Management and Securities, 41 DCR 2223 (4-22-94) (LUDCRA) 
Chapter 25, Annual Statement Filing Requirements, 4 1 DCR 2225 (4-22-94) (IA/DCRA.) 
Chapter 25, Annual Statement Filing Requirements, §2501.2,42 DCR 2488 (5-19-95)OPJDCRA.) 
Chapter 27, Variable Life Insurance Contracts, 42 DCR 1047 (2-24-95) (DCRA) 
Chapter 28, Credit for Reinsurance Regulations, 43 DCR 23 18 (5-3-96) (LUDCRA) 
Chapter 29, Actuarial Opinion and Memorandum Regulation, 43 DCR 688 (2-7-97)(WJlCRA) 
Chapter 30, Valuation of Life Insurance Policies, 47 DCR 2914 (4-28-00) (ISR) 
Chapter 30, Valuation of Life Insurance Policies, 8 3004.1; and Sec. 3005: 2001 CSO Mortality Table for 

Determining Minimum Reserve Liabilities and Nonforfeiture Benefits After January 1,2004, 
5 1 DCR 102 1 8 (1 1-5-04) (ISB) 

Chapter 3 1, Investment Guidelines for Health Maintenance Organizations (HMOs), 46 DCR 5925 
(7- 16-99) (ISR) 

Chapter 35, Health Maintenance Organizations (HMO's), 46 DCR 7291 (9-17-99) (ISR) 
Chapter 35, Health Maintenance Organizations (HMO's), 8 3500.l(a)@)(c), 50 DCR 5576 (7-1 1-03) 

O W  
Chapter 36, Privacy of Consumer Financial Information, 48 DCR 8005 (8-24-01) (ISR) 
Chapter 36, Privacy of Consumer Financial Information, Secs. 3613,3614, 3615, 3616,3617, 3618,3619, 

3620 & 3699,50 DCR 1517 (2-14-03) (ISR) 
Chapter 37, Captive Insurance Companies, 48 DCR 8034 (8-24-01) (ISR) 
Chapter 38, Rules of Practice and Procedure for Hearings, 50 DCR 6433 (8-8-03) (ISR) 
Chapter 39, Licensure as a Public Insurance Adjuster, 50 DCR 5970 (7-25-03) (ISR) 
Chapter 45, Oversight Role and Fiduciary Obligations of Members of the Board of Directors of a Hospital 

and Medical Services Corporation, 5 1 DCR 90 1 1 (9- 17-04) (ISR) 
Chapter 50, Unfair Trade Practices, Sec. 5000: Permissible Reasons for Non-Renewal and Use of Claims 

History Information; and Sec. 500 1 : Use of Claims History - New Business, 5 1 DCR 3 880 
(4- 16-04) (ISR) 

Chapter 5 1, Standard Nonforfeiture Law for Individual Deferred Annuities, 5 1 DCR 5600 (5-28-04) (ISR) 
Chapter 56, Certified Capital Companies, 5 1 DCR 7555 (7-30-04) (ISB) 
Chapter 93, Partnership Program for Affordable H,ousing), Secs. 9300 through 931, EXPIRES 120 DAYS, 

5 1 DCR 974 (1-23-04) (ISR) 
Errata Notice - To Correct Effective Date of Rules Published at 50 DCR 10371 (December 5,2003), 

50 DCR 10818 (12-19-03) (ISR) 



DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA REGISTER 

DCMR Title 26ABanking and Financial Institutions* 

Chapters 1 - 5, General Provisions; Applications; Powers; Administrative Procedures; Supervision and 
Enforcement Procedures; & Definitions, 35 DCR 6276 (8-19-88)(OBFI) 

Chapter 2, 9 207.2, to establish the fees to be pald for banlung institutions that operate in D.C.; sec. 3401 
of the Fiscal Year 2002 Budget Support Act of 2000, effective 10-19-00, DC Law 14-28,48 DCR 
6981 (DC LAW) 

Chapter 1 1, Mortgage Lenders and Brokers, 5 1 DCR 23 88 3-5-04) (OBFI) 
Chapter 18, Automated Teller Machines, 50 DCR 10324 (12-5-03) (OBFI) 
Chapter 20, Real Estate Finance and Predatory Lending, 48 DCR 106 17 (1 1-23-0 1) (OBFI) 
Chapter 20, Real Estate Finance and Predatory Lending, 992001.5, 2001.6,2027.6(g), 2099.1(5); and Red 

Flag Warning (Form 601Cj)), EXF'IRES 120 DAYS, 48 DCR 9880 (10-26-01) (OBFI) 
Chapter 20, Predatory Lending, 49 DCR 10779 (1 1-29-02) (OBFI) 
Chapter 2 1, Opportunity Accounts, 49 DCR 4983 (5-3 1-02) (OBFI) 
Chapter 22, Money Transmitters, 50 DCR 10329 (12-5-03) (OBFI) 
Chapter 25, Credit Enhancement Fund Grants, 48 DCR 2951 (3-30-01) (OBFI) 
Chapter 25, ERRATA to Correct Effectwe Date of Emergency and Proposed Rules Published at 

48 DCR 2951 dated March 30,2001,48 DCR 3874 (5-4-01) (OBFI) 
Chapter 25, Credit Enhancement Fund Grants, 48 DCR 9630 (10-10-01) (OBFI) 
Chapter 26, Credit Enhancement Fund Committee Grants, 48 DCR 98 15 (10-26-01) (OBFI) 

DCMR Title 27lContracts & Procurements (Julv 1988 ed.) 

Chapters 1,2, & 3, Rules of Practice, Contract Dispute Procedures and Protest Procedures, 36 DCR 2684, 
pub. 4-21-89 (CAB) 

Chapters 1 ,2  & 3, Rules of the Board, 45 DCR 1384 (3-13-98) (CAB) 
Chapters 1, General Rules of the Board; 2, Appeal Procedures of the Board, 3, Protest Procedures of the 

Board; and New Chapter 4, Electronic Filing, 49 DCR 2078 (3-8-02)(CAB) 
Chapter 8, Local Small and Disadvantaged Business Enterprises Contracting, 39 DCR 9052 

(12-4-92)(DHMBD) 
Chapter 9, Surplus Property, Sec. 9 18: Audit, $9 18.1, to repeal the authority of the D.C. Audltor for the 

biennial audit requirement of the D.C. Surplus Property Plan, sec. 2406 Fiscal Year 200 1 Budget 
Support Act of 2000, effective 10-1 9-00, DC Law 13-1 72,47 DCR 6308 @C LAW) 

Chapter 13, Sec. 1300: Notice of Proposed Solicitations, $ 5  1300.1 - 1300.9; Sec, 1301 : Notice of Contract 
Awards, 9 1301 . l ;  and Sec. 1399: Definitions, 4 1399.1, EXPIRES 120 DAYS, 47 DCR 4703 (6-2- 
00) (OM) 

Chapter 13, Publicizing Contract Actions, $9 1300.1 through 1300.9, 1301.1 & 1399.1,47 DCR 9887 
(1 2- 15-00) (OM) 

Chapter 16, Sec. 1614: Source Selection, $1614.l(c); and Sec. 1617: Evaluation Factors of Proposals, 
91617.5 (a)@), 48 DCR 2168 (3-9-01) (OM) 

Chapter 16, Sec. 1614: Source Selection, 9; and Sec. 161 7: Evaluation Factors of Proposals, EXPIRED, 
46 DCR 8464 (10-22-99) (OM) 

Chapter 16, Procurement by Competitive Sealed Proposals, Sec. 1614: Source Selection, $1614.1 (c); and 
Sec. 1617: Evaluation Factors of Proposals, 4 1617.5 (a), 49 DCR 3038 (4-5-02) (OM) 

Chapter 16, Procurement By Competitive Sealed Proposals, Sec. 1614: Source Selection, $ l614.l(d); Sec. 
1617: Evaluation Factors of Proposals, $l617S(a), EXPIRES 120 DAYS, 5 1 DCR 10653 
(1 1 - 19-04) (CPO) 

Chapter 16, Procurement by Competitive Sealed Proposals, Sec. 16 14: Source Selection; Sec. 167 1 : 
Evaluation Factors of Proposals, EXPlRJ3S120 DAYS, 52 DCR 1592 (2-18-05) (OCP) 

Chapter 18, Secs. 1800 - 1803, Small Puchase Procedures - Amended, EXPlRJ3D 10-9-99,46 DCR 5715 
(7-2-99) (CPO) 

Chapter 18, Secs. 1800 - 1803, Small Purchase Procedures - Amended, EXPIRED, 46 DCR 9844a (1 1-26- 
99) (OCP) 



DCMR Title 27lContracts & Procurements Continued 

Chapter 18, Small Purchase and Other Simplified Purchase ~rodedures), Secs. 1800, 1801, 1802 & 1803 
to Reflect Increases in Small Purchase Authority for Procedures on Behalf of the Metropolitan 
Police Department, EXPIRES 120 DAYS, 49 DCR 9874 (1 1-1-02) (OCP) 

Chapter 18, Secs. 1800 - 1804, Small Purchase Procedures - Amended, 44 DCR 4450 (8-1-97) (CPO) 
Chapter 18, Secs. 1800 - 1804 Establishing Procedures for Small Purchases of Goods and Services, 
EXPIRED February 12, 1998,44 DCR 7 18 1 (1 1-21-97)(OCP) 
Chapter 18, Secs. 1800 - 1804, Use of Small Purchase Procedures, EXPIRED, 45 DCR 2009 (4-3-98) 
(OCP) 
Chapter 18, Secs. 1800 - 1804, Small Purchase Procedures, EXPIRED 9-4-98,45 DCR 3834 (6-12-98) 

(OCP) 
Chapter 18, Secs. 1800 - 1804, Delegating Small Purchase Authority, EXPIRED January 1, 1999, 

45 DCR 7095 (10-2-98) (OCP) 
Chapter 18, Secs. 1800 through 1804 Regarding Small Purchase Procedures. EXPIRED, 46 DCR 608 

(1 -22-99) (OCP) 
Chapter 18, Secs. 1800 - 1803, Small Purchase Procedures - Amended, EXPKES 120 DAYS, 

47 DCR 1261 (2-25-00) (OCP) 
Chapter 18, Small Purchase and Other Simplified Purchase Procedures, Secs. 1800 through 1803, 

47 DCR 9882 (12-15-00) (OCP) 
Chapter 18, Small Purchase and Other Simplified Purchase Procedures), Secs. 1800, 180 1, 1802 

& 1803 to Reflect Increases in Small Purchase Authority for Procedures on Behalf of the 
Metropolitan Police Department, 50 DCR 8179 (10-3-03) (OCP) 

Chapter 19, Sec. 1901 : Expert and Consulting Services, 43 DCR 1620 (3-29-96) (OM) 
Chapter 19, Contracting For Services, Secs. 1900.4 (m), 1905, 1906, 1907, 1908 & 1999,48 DCR 5819 

(6-22-0 1) (OM) 
Chapter 19, Contracting Services, $8 1901.2 through 1901 .lo, EXPTRES 120 DAYS, 48 DCR 548 

(1-19-01) ( O m  
Chapter 19, Contracting for Services, Sec. 1902: Conl~acting for Information Technology Services, 

48 DCR 8989 (9-28-0 1) (OM) 
Chapter 19, contracting Services, Sec. 1902: Contracting for Jnfonnation Technology Services, 

50 DCR 1531 (2-14-03) (OM) 
Chapter 19, Conl~acting for Services, Sec. 1902: Contracting for Information Technology Services,§ 

1902.7, EXPIRES 120 DAYS, 51 DCR 5265 (5-21-04) (CPO) 
Chapter 20, Secs. 2005.6, 2005.7 & 2099.1, Regarding Option Periods for City-Wide Telecommunications 

Systems, 4 1 DCR 398a, pub. 1-28-94 (OM) 
Chapter 22, Contractors, Sec. 2218: Debarment and Suspension Panel, EXPIRES 120 DAYS, 

5 1 DCR 102 (1 -2-04) (OCP) 
Chapter 22, Contractors, Sec. 221 8: Debarment and Suspension Panel, 221 8.10, EXPIRES 120 DAYS, 

51 DCR 1281 (1-30-04) (OCP) 
Chapter 22, Contractors, Sec. 2218: Debarment and Suspension Panel, EXPIRES 120 DAYS, 

5 1 DCR 4793 (5-7-04) (OCP) 
Chapter 32, Contract Financing and Funding), Sec. 3205: Advance Payments, $3205.1 (h), 49 DCR 7918 

(8- 16-02) (OM) 
Chapter 32, Contract Financing and Funding, $83205.1 (h) & 3299,48 DCR 5562 (6-15-01) (OM) 
Chapter 32, ERRATA - Premature publication of Final Rules to Amend 27 DCMR, Chapter 32, Contract 

Financing and Funding, 48 DCR 8042 (8-24-01) (OM) 
Chapter 32, Contract Financing and Funding, Sec. 3205: Advance Payments, 93205.1; and Sec. 3299: 

Definitions, EXPIRES 120 DAYS, 48 DCR 8456 (9-7-01) (OM) 
Chapter 33, Contract Cost Principles, Sec. 3307: Determining Reasonableness, 51 DCR 1429 (2-6-04) 

(OCP) 
Chapter 38, Protects, Claims and Disputes, EXPIRED, 49 DCR 9348 (10-1 1-02) 
Chapter 38, Protests, Claims and Disputes, 5 1 DCR 1432 (2-6-04) (OM) 

2255 



MAR 4 - 2005 

DCMR Title 27IContracts & Procurements Continued 

Chapter 80, Delegation of Contracting Authority, EXPIRED December 29, 1997,44 DCR 6643 (1 1-7-97) 
(OCP) 

Chapter 80, Delegation of Contracting Authority, EXPIRED February 8, 1998,44 DCR 7820 (12-26-97) 
(OCP) 

Chapter 80, Office of Contracting and Procurement, EXPIRED July 17, 1998,45 DCR 2571 (4-24-98) 
(CP) , 

Chapter 80, Office of Contracting and Procurement, EXPLRED June 25, 1998,45 DCR 3840 (6-12-98) 
( O W  

Chapter 80, Office of Contracting and Procurement, EXPIRED July 30, 1998,45 DCR 4549 (7-10-98) 
(OCP) 

Chapter 80, Office of Contracting and Procurement, EXPIRED 8-21-98,45 DCR 4937 (7-24-98) (OCP) 
Chapter 80, Office of Contracting and Procurement, EXPIRED 9-23-98,45 DCR 6240 (8-28-98) (OCP) 
Chapter 80, Office of Contracting and Procurement, EXPIRED 10-18-98,45 DCR 6240 (8-28-98) (OCP) 
Chapter 80, Office of Contracting and Procurement, EXPIRED 11-20-98,45 DCR 7621 (10-23-98) (OCP) 

DCMR Title 28/Corrections, Courts & Criminal Justice (May 1987 ed.) 

NO AMENDMENTS 

DCMR Title 29/Public Welfare (May 1987 ed.) 

Chapter 1, Vocational Rehabilitation Services, $4 100.1 through 118.11, 50 DCR 6189 (8-1-03) (DHS) 
Chapter 1, Secs. 105 - 13 9, 199, Regulations for Administrative Reviews and Fair Hearings for the 

Vocational Rehabilitation Program, 3 8 DCR 2034 (4-5-9 l)@HS) 
Chapter 2, Administrative Review Conference and Hearing Procedures for the Dept. of Human Services, 

27 DCR 145a (1-1 1-80) (DCR) 
Chapter 2, Secs. 2 18 - 25 1, Administrative Reviews and Full-Evidentiary Hearing Procedures for the 

Randolph-Sheppard Vending Facility Program, 35 DCR 8538 (12-9-88)(DHS) 
Chapter 3, Secs. 300.2 & 300.3, "Before-and-After School Care Exemption Emergency Act of 1977," 

D.C. Act 12-156, effective October 17, 1997,44 DCR 6044 (D.C. Law) 
Chapter 3, Sec. 303, Fees for Licensing of Child DevelopmentlCare Facilities, 42 DCR 1696 

(4-7-95)(0M) 
Chapter 3, Sec. 308: Rates Paid by the D.C. Government to Child Development Centers, Child 

Development Homes and In-Home Caregivers for Child Care Services, 42 DCR 3 170 
(6-23-95)(0M) 

Chapter 3, Sec. 308: Rates Paid by the D.C. Government to Child Development Centers, Child 
Development Homes and Relative and In-Home Caregivers for Child Care Services, 45 DCR 5226 
(8-7-98) (DHS) 

Chapter 3, Child Development Facilities), Sec. 308: Rates Paid by the Government of D.C. to Child 
Development Centers and Child Development Homes Operated for Child Care Services, 
EXPIRES 120 DAYS, 49 DCR 7733 (8-9-02) (DHS) 

Chapter 3, Sec. 308: Rates Paid by the D.C. Government to Child Care Centers, Child Development 
Homes and In-Home Caregivers for Child Care Services, 44308.2 & 308.3 to Establish Child Care 
Subsidy Rates for Child Care Services Provided During Non-Traditional Hours, 46 DCR 5825 (7- 
9-99) (DHS) 

Chapter 3, Sec. 309: Schedule of Parent Fees for D.C. Government Subsidized Child Care Services 
in Child Development Centers and Child Development Homes, and By In-Home Caregivers, 
43 DCR 3860 (7-19-96) (OM) 



DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA REGISTER MAR 4 - 2005 

DCMR Title 29/Public Welfare Continued 

Chapter 3, Child Development Facilities, Sec. 309: Sliding Fee Scale and Schedule of Parent Fees for 
D.C. Government Subsidized Child Care Services, EXPIRES 120 DAYS, 48 DCR 4492 (5-18-01) 
( D m  

Chapter 3, Child Development Facilities), Sec.309: Schedule of Parent Fees for D.C. Government 
Subsidized Child Care Services in Child Development Centers and Child Development Homes, 
and by Relative and In-Home Caregivers, 48 DCR 10447 (1 1- 16-0 1) (DHS) 

Chapter 3, Sec. 3 12 Inadvertently Omitted from May 1987 ed., Payment of Public Funds to Unlicensed 
Facilities, 21 DCR 1342 (12-27-74) (Errata) 

Chapter 5 to Establish Fees for Certifying, Recertifpg, Granting Reciprocity and Extensions to 
Emergency Medical Technicians, Paramedics, and Instructors; dnd for Inspecting and 

Licensing Ambulances, 45 DCR 8542 (12-4-98) (DOH) 
Chapter 5, Sec. 525.1, Fees and Billing for Ambulance Service, 38 DCR 4445 (7-19-91) (OM) 
Chapter 5, Sec. 525.1 Increase Fees for Emergency Ambulance Service, 43 DCR 6441 (12-6-96) (OM) 
Chapter 7, $71 8.8 to Amend Reimbursement Rates for Day Treatment Programs, 44 DCR 5490 

(9-26-97)(DOH) 
Chapter 7, Medicaid Day Treatment Program, Sec. 718: Reimbursement Policy, $ 7 18.8, to Amend 

Reimbursement Rates Negotiated for Day Treatment Programs, 50 DCR 6702 (8-15-03) (DOH) 
Chapter 9, Sec. 7 18.8, To Change Reimbursement Rates for Day Treatment, 44 DCR 368 1, (6-27-97) 
Chapter 9, Sec. 901.1, Medically Needy Income Levels for the District Medicaid Program - Amended, 

3 8 DCR 7601 (12-20-91)(DHS) 
Chapter 9, Medicaid Program, Sec. 90 1 : Medically Needy Income Levels, $ 90 1.1, 50 DCR ,8467 

(10-10-03) @OH 
Chapter 9, 56901.2 & 901.3 to Expand the Medicaid Program, EXPIRED, 45 DCR 7432 (10-9-98) (DOH) 
Chapter 9, 6$90 1.2 & 901.3 to Expand the Medicaid Program to Ensure Medical Insurance Coverage for 

Families with Income at or Below 200% of the Federal Poverty Level, 46 DCR 439 (1-15-99) 
(DOH) 

Chapter 9, Medicaid Program, Sec. 905: Medicaid Reimbursement to Out-of-State Skilled Nursing and 
Intermediate Care Facilities), $$ 905.3 & 905.4, 5 1 DCR 7297 (7-23-04) (DOH) 

Chapter 9, Medicaid Program, Sec. 906: Standards for Medicaid Reimbursement of Parenteral, Enteral and 
Infusion Therapy in the Home, 48 DCR 8192 (8-3 1-0 1) @OH) 

Chapter 9, Medicaid Program, Sec. 907: Personal Emergency Response System (PERS) Services, 
EXPIRES 4-16-03, 50 DCR 104 1 (1-3 1-03) @OH) 

Chapter 9, Medicaid Program, Sec. 907: Personal Emergency Response System (PERS) Services, 50 DCR 
4395 (6-6-03) (DOH) 

Chapter 9, Sec. 908: Qualifications for a Disproportionate Share Hospital (Corrected Notice), EXPIRES 1- 
17-98,44 DCR 5839 (10-10-97)@OH) 

Chapter 9, Sec. 908, Qualifications for a Disproportionate Share Hospital, 37 DCR 2755, (5-4-90) 
Chapter 9, Secs. 908.4 & 908.10, Rules to Revise the Formula for Payment Adjustments to Hospitals 

Participating in the Medicaid Program That Save a Disproportionate Number of Low Income or 
Medicaid Patients, 39 DCR 7432 (10-2-92)@HS) 

Chapter 9, Sec. 908: Qualifications for a Disproportionate Share Hospital, EXPIRES 1-17-98, 
44 DCR 55 12 (9-26-97)(DOH) 

Chapter 9, Qualifications for a Disproportionate Share Hospital, $§Delete 908.4 & 908.9, New $6908.10 
through 908.17,48 DCR 8967 (9-28-01) (DOH) 

Chapter 9, Qualifications for a Disproportionate Share Hospital, Delete 9908.7, Amend 6908.10, Add New 
46908.1 1 - 908.14,47 DCR 6897 (8-25-00) (DOH) 

Chapter 9, Secs. 909 - 913, Skilled Nursing Facility Criteria, 37 DCR 3944 (6-15-90)(DHS) 
Chapter 9, Sec. 9 14, D.C. Medicaid Prior Approval Required for Selected Pharmaceuticals Provided to 

D.C. Medicaid Ambulatory Care Patients, 34 DCR.4400 (7-10-87)(DHS) 
Chapter 9, Medicaid Program, Sec. 920: Prevocational Services, 50 DCR 6170 (8-1-03) (DOH) 



DISTRleV OF COLUMBI'A REGISTER MAR 4 - 2005 

DCMK Title 29mubli.c Welfare Continued 

Chapter 9, Sec. 921 & 922, Standards for Determining D.C. Medicaid Reimbursement Costs for 
Prescribed Multiple Source Drugs and Other Drugs and Methodology for Determining 
Prescripti.on Reimbursement; and Methods for Determining Costs of Prescribed Multiple Source 
Drugs, 35 DCR 401 1 (5 -27-88)(DHS) 

Chapter 9, Sec. 922: Reimbursement to Fee-For-Service Providers for Selected Frequent Procedures, 
44 DCR 5495 (9-26-97)(DOH) 

Chapter 9, Sec. 924: Method Established for Determining Prescription Reimbursement, $924.1 (a), 
44 DCR 6639 (1 1-7-97) (DOH) 

Chapter 9, Sec. 924, Meth,od for Determining Prescription Reimbursement, 44 DCR 3 121 (5-30-97)(DOH) 
Chapter 9, Medicaid Program, Sec. 939: Chore Services, 50 DCR 6703 (8-15-03) (DOH) 
Chapter 9, Sec. 924.1 (a), Method for Determining Prescription Reimbursement - Amended, 

Expires 7-1-97,44 DCR 4258 (7-25-97)(DOH) 
Chapter 9, Medicaid Program, Sec. 924: Method Established for Determining Prescription 

Reimbursement, 4 924.1, to Increase the Pharmacy Dispensing Reimbursement, 50 DCR 8 183 
(10-3-03) (DOH) 

Chapter 9, Medicaid Program, Sec. 926: Environmental Accessibility Adaptation (EAA) Services, 
50 DCR 6989 (8-22-03) @OH) 

Chapter 9, Medicaid Program, Sec. 927: Attendant Care Services), 51 DCR 1673 (2-13-04) (DOH) 
Chapter 9, Medicaid Program, Sec. 928: Adaptive Equipment Services, 50 DCR 6175 (8-1-03) (DOH) 
Chapter 9, Medicaid Program, Sec. 929: Supported Employment Services, 5 1 DCR 4095 (4-23-04) (DOH) 
Chapter 9, Medicaid Program, Sec. 930: Nutritional Counseling Services, 49 DCR 244 (1-1 1-02) (DOH) 
Chapter 9, Medicaid Program, Sec. 930: Nutritional Counseling Services, $930.5 to Establish a 

Reimbursement Rate, 49 DCR 7723 (8-9-02) (DOH) 
Chapter 9, Medicaid Program), Sec. 932: Speech, Hearing and Language Services, 49 DCR 8716 

(9-20-02) (DOH) 
Chapter 9, Medicaid Program), Sec. 933: Skilled Nursing Services, EXPIRES 120 DAYS, 49 DCR 9142 

(1 04-02) (DOH) 
Chapter 9, Medicaid Program), Sec. 933: Shlled Nursing Services, 50 DCR 1182 (2-7-03) (DOH) 
Chapter 9, Medicaid Program), Sec. 934: Physical Therapy Services, 50 DCR 1186 (2-7-03) (DOH) 
Chapter 9, Medicaid Program, Sec. 935: Occupational Therapy Services, 50 DCR 1190 (2-7-03) (DOH) 
Chapter 9, Medicaid Program, Sec. 936: Dental S e ~ c e s ,  50 DCR 8183 (10-3-03) (DOH) 
Chapter 9, Medicaid Program, Sec. 937: Preventive, Consultative and Crisis Support Services, 

50 DCR 8469 (10-10-03) (DOH) 
Chapter 9, Medicaid Program, Sec. 938: Homemaker Services, 50 DCR 7832 (9-19-03) @OH) 
Chapter 9, Medicaid Program, Sec. 939: Chore Services, 50 DCR 6703 (8-15-03) (DOH) 
Chapter 9, Medicaid Program, Sec. 940: Case Management Services EXPIRES 120 DAYS, 

49 DCR 10947 (1 1-29-02) (DOH) 
Chapter 9, Medicaid Program, Sec. 940: Case Management Services, 50 DCR 2042 (3-7-03) (DOH) 
Chapter 9, Sec. 941 : Hospice Care, 41 DCR 2694 (5-13-94) (DHS) 
Chapter 9, Medicaid Program, Sec. 942: Family Training Services, 50 DCR 8476 (10-10-03) (DOH) 
Chapter 9, Medicaid Program, Sec. 943: Transportation Services, 50 DCR 473 1 (6-13-03) (DOH) 
Chapter 9, Medicaid Program, Sec. 944: Adult Companion Services, 50 DCR 8188 (10-3-03) (DOH) 
Chapter 9, Medicaid Program, Sec. 945: Day Habilitation Services, 50 DCR 61 79 (8-1-03) (DOH) 
Chapter 9, Sec. 947, Income and Resource Allowances for Community Spouses of Certain 

Institutionalized Spouses, 3 7 DCR 60 14 (9-1 4-90)(DHS) 
Chapter 9, Medicaid Program, Sec. 946: Residential Habilitation S e ~ c e s ,  51 DCR 9699 (10-15-04) 

(DOH) 
Chapter 9, Secs. 948 & 949, Standards for Participation of Residential Treatment Centers for Children and 

Youth, 37 DCR 68 12 (1 0-26-90)(DHS) 
Chapter 9, Medicaid Program, Sec. 948: Standards for Participation of Residential Treatment Centers for 

Children and Youth, 4 948.1 (d), 50 DCR 7176 (8-29-03) ( D m )  
2258 



DISTRICT 06 COLUMBIA REGISTER MAR 4 - 2005 

DCMR Title 29IPublic Welfare Continued 

Chapter 9, Sec. 949.3, To Change the Per Diem Rate to Reflect a Change in Reimbursement Principles and 
Limitations for Residential Treatment Centers, 44 DCR 3683, (6-27-97) 

Chapter 9, $949.3 (d) to Reflect a Change in Reimbursement Principles and Limitations for Residential 
Treatment Centers, 44 DCR 5492 (9-26-97)(DOH) 

Chapter 9, Secs. 950 - 963, & Sec. 999, Policy Governing Reimbursement Under the Medicaid Program, - 

37 DCR 60 17 (9-14-90)(DHS) 
Chapter 9, Secs. 950 - 963, & 980 Governing Reimbursements to Nursing Facilities by the D.C. Medicaid 

Program, 45 DCR 30 19 (5-15-98) (DOH) 
Chapter 9, Secs. 950 - 963, & 980 Governing Reimbursements to Nursing Facilities by the D.C. Medicaid 

Program (Corrected Notice), 45 DCR 3330 (5-29-98) 
Chapter 9, Medicaid Program, Sec. 950: Reimbursement of Nursing Facilities, $950.1; and Sec. 952: 

Calculation of Rate, $4 952.1 & 952.5, 50 DCR 5192 (6-27-03) @OH) 
Chapter 9, Medicaid Program, Sec. 95 1: Computation of Ceilings (Pertaining to Reimbursement to 

Nursing Facilities), Delete $$ 95 1.10 & 95 1.1 1, 50 DCR 5 194 (6-27-03) @OH) 
Chapter 9, Reimbursement of Nursing Facilities, $4952.9 & 952.10,46 DCR 10173 .(12-17-99) @OH) 
Chapter 9, Reimbursement ofNursing Facilities, 44957.1 & 957.2,46 DCR 10050 (12-10-99) @OH) 
Chapter 9, Medicaid Program, Sec. 964: Medicaid Reimbursement for Dental Services, 50 DCR 7549 

(9-5-03) (DOH) 
Chapter 9, Sec. 965, Medicaid Reimbursement for Inpatient Hospital Services, 37 DCR 7244 

(1 1 - 16-90)(DHS) 
Chapter 9, Sec. 965, Medicaid Reimbursement for Inpatient Hospital Services, 44 DCR 3684, (6-27-97) 
Chapter 9, Medicaid Program, Sec. 965: Medicaid Reimbursement for Inpatient hospital Services, 

44 DCR 5493 (9-26-97)(DOH) 
Chapter 9, Medicaid Program, Sec. 966 & 999, Special Income and Resource Allowances for Community. 

Spouses of Certain Institutionalized Persons, 38 DCR 3634 (6-7-91)(DHS) 
Chapter 9, Secs. 968 - 982 Regarding Reimbursement to Immediate Care Facilities for the Mentally 

Retarded by the Medicaid Program, 45 DCR 2333 (4-17-98) (DOH) 
Chapter 9, Medicaid Program, Sec. 968: Reimbursement of Intermediate Care Facilities for the Mentally 

Retarded, $968.1; and Sec. 970: Calculation of Rate, 4 97O.l,5O DCR 5 195 (6-27-03) (DOH) 
Chapter 9, Medicaid Program, Sec. 970, Change of Base Year for Columbi,a Hospital for Women, 

Providence Hospital and Washington Hospital Center, 40 DCR 4044 (6-25-93) 
Chapter 9, Reimbursement of Intermediate Care Facilities for the Mentally Retarded, ICFIMR 

Reimbursement Rules, gg970.8, 970.9, 970.10, & 970.11,47 DCR 10213 (12-29-00) @OH) 
Chapter 9, Medicaid Program, Sec. 970: Calculation of Rate, 970.1,50 DCR 5195 (6-27-03) @OH) 
Chapter 9, Medicaid Program, Sec. 97 1 : Change of Base Year for Hospital for Sick Children, 

49 DCR 3487 (4-12-02) (DOH) 
Chapter 9, Reimbursement ofhtermediate Care Facilities for the Mentally Retarded, 44975.1 & 975.2,46 

DCR 10049 (12-10-99) @OH) 
Chapter 9, Sec. 979: One To One Services, 50 DCR 4735 (6-13-03) (DOH) 
Chapter 9, Medicaid Program, Sec. 980, Nursing Facility Rate Adjustments, 40 DCR 7291 

(1 0- 15 -93)(DHS) 
Chapter 9, Medicaid Program, Sec. 990, Intermediate Care Facility for the Mentally Retarded Rate 

Adjustment, 40 DCR 7292(10-15-93)(DFIS) 
Chapter 9, Medicaid Program, Sec. 992, Reimbursement to Fee-For-Service Providers for Selected 

Frequent Procedures, 44 DCR 3842, (7-4-97) 
Chapter 9, Medicaid Program, $992.1 Governing Reimbursement to Fee-For-Service Medicaid Providers 

for Selected Frequent Procedures, 45 DCR 524 (8-7-98) (DOH) 
Chapter 9, Medicaid Program, Sec. 993: Independent Habilitation Services, 5 1 DCR 1678 (2-13-04) 

(DOH) 



DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA REGISTER 

DCMR Title 29lPublic Welfare Continued 

MAR 4 - 2005 

Chapter 9, Medicaid Program, Sec. 994: Respite Care Services, 50 DCR 4943 (6-20-03) (DOH) 
Chapter 9, Medicaid Program, Sec. 995: Reimbursement Rates for Transportation Services, 44 DCR 5497 

(9-26-97)@OH) 
Chapter 9, Medicaid Program, Sec. 995: Reimbursement Rates for Transportation Services, 5 5  995.1 - 

995.7, 50 DCR 3473 (5-2-03) (DOH) 
Chapter 9, Medicaid Program, Sec. 995: Reimbursement Rates for Transportation Services, 50 DCR 9253 

(10-3 1-03) (DOH) 
Chapter 1 1, Rules Governing the Complementary Energy Assistance Program - Amended, 35 DCR 2934 

(4-22-88)(DCEO) 
Chapter 14, Sec. 1451 & 1499, Income ~ e v e l s  for Chore and Homemaker Services Programs, 

37 DCR 4705 (7-20-90 (DHS) 
Chapter 14, Sec. 1450, Personal Needs Allowances, 35 DCR 964 (2-12-88)oHS) 
Chapter 14, Homemaker Services Program), Sec. 1451: Income Levels for the Homemaker Services 

Program, EXPIRES 120 DAYS, 48 DCR 7775 (8-17-01) (DHS) 
Chapter 14, Sec. 145 1.1 to Establish a six (6) Hour a Week Limit on Number of Hours of Homemaker and 

Chore Services That May be Provided to a Person or Family Eligible for Such Services; and Sec. 
1452: Chore and Homemaker Services; Program Limitations, 43 DCR 309 (1-26-96)@HS) 

Chapter 15,' Childless Adults Aged 50-64 Demonstration, 50 DCR 61 83 (8- 1-03) @OH) 
Chapter 16, Recovering Reimbursable Costs for Child Placing Agencies, 32 DCR 4201 (7-19-85)(CFPR) 
Chapter 16, Standards of Placement, Care, and Services for Child-Placing Agencies, 37 DCR 3033, 

(5 - 1 1-90) (CFPR) 
Chapter 16, 5 1601.1 to Permit Foreign Non-Profit Corporations to be Licensed as Child-Placing Agencies, 

44 DCR 59 (1-3-97) (DHS) 
Chapter 16, Sec. 1608: Fees, To Increase the Fees for Services Provided by Child-Placing Agencies in 

Connection with Domestic and International Adoptions, 44 DCR 60 (1-3-97) @HS) 
Chapter 17, Child Support Enforcement, 35 DCR 2756 (4-15-88)(DHS) 
Chapter 17, Secs. 1707-1712 Concerning Cooperation in ~stablishing Paternity and Obtaining Child 

Support, and Good Cause for Noncooperation; and Chapter 58, Temporary Assistance for Needy 
Families, 45 DCR 1845a (3-27-98) (OM) 

Chapter 17, Child Support Enforcement, Secs. 1707 - 1712, EXPIRES 120 DAYS, 47 DCR 5615 7-7-00) 
P H s )  

Chapter 17, Child Support Enforcement, Secs. 1707 - 1715; and New Chapter 58 (Temporary Assistance 
for Needy Families), 48 DCR 1025 1 (1 1-9-01) (DHS) 

Chapter 18, Hearing Procedures for Early Intervention Services Prog., 44 DCR 481 (1-24-97) (OM)) 
Chapter 19, Home and Community-Based Waiver Services for Persons with Mental Retardation and 

Developmental Disabilities, 5 1 DCR 10207 (1 1-5-04) (DOH) 
Chapter 20, Secs. 2020 - 2024, Rules for Financial Assistance for Payment of Health Benefit Premiums for 

Persons with AIDS, 38 DCR 4360 (7-12-91)@HS) 
Chapter 20, Financial Assistance for Life-Prolonging Drug Treatment in AIDS Cases, 36 DCR 4935 

(7- 14*89)(DHS) 
Chapter.21, Small Start-up Loans to Estabhsh Self-Help Housing for Four or More Recovering Substance 

Abusers, 3 8 DCR 603 (1 -1 8-9 l)(DHS) 
Chapter 23, Certification Standards for Substance Abuse Treatment Facilities and Programs, 47 DCR 9341 

(1 1-14-00) (DOH) 
Chapter .24, Choice in Drug Treatment, 5 1 DCR 3720 (4-9-04) (DOH) 
Chapter 25, Temporary Housing, for Families and Emergency Overnight Shelter for Individual Adults, 

39 DCR 470 (1-24-92)(DHS) 
Chapter 26, Emergency Assistance Program, 37 DCR 657 (1-19-90)(DHS) 
Chapter 26, Secs. 2602.50) & 2603 .I@), Eligibility for Emergency Assistance Program - Amended, 

3 8 DCR 6776 (1 1 -8-91)(DHS) 
Chapter 26, Burial Assistance Program, 5 1 DCR 521 1 (5-21-04) (DHS) 
Chapter 28, Vital Records, 38 DCR 781 (1-25-91)@HSg26(-J 



DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA REGISTER MAR 4 - 2005 

DCMR Title 29IPublic Welfare Continued 

Chapter 28, Vital Records, §$2800.6 & 2899, to Clarify Procedures for Recording a Child's Name for the 
Purpose of Generating a Birth Certificate and Registering the Birth, 49 DCR 791 6 (8-16-02) 

Chapter 28, Vital Records, 4 280 1.8, 5 1 DCR 9 183 (9-24-04) (DOH) 
Chapter 28, Sec. 2821 - 2823, Vital Records - Amended, Disclosure of Records which Identify 

Individuals, Copies of Data fiom Vital Records, 38 DCR 2030 (4-5-91)(DHS) 
Chapter 28, Sec. 2880, Fees for Issuing and Amending of Vital Records, 39 DCR 492 (1-24-92)(0M) 
Chapter 28, Vital Records, Sec. 2880: Vital Records Fees, 49 DCR 4096 (5-3-02) (DOH) 
Chapter 29, Adult Protective Services, 37 DCR 6646 (10-19-90)(DHS) 
Chapter 3 1, D.C. Nurses Training Corps Program, 37 DCR 8290 (12-21-90)(DHS) . 
Chapter 32, Sec. 3200 - 3212, & 3299, Nurse Aide Certification, 38 DCR 2008 (4-5-91)(DHS) 
Chapter 32, Sec. 3250 - 3254, Procedures to Establish a Nurse Aide Registry and Certify Nurse Aides, 

3 8 DCR 2023 (4-5-9 l)(DCRA) 
Chapter 32, Nursing Facilities, Sec. 3250: Credentials Certification, Sec. 3251: Nurse Aide Registry, Sec. 

3252: Reports of Nurse Aide Abuse, Neglect or Misappropriation of Property, Sec. 3253: Hearing 
Process; and Sec. 3254: Operation of Registry, 49 DCR 3696 (4-19-02) (DOH) 

Chapter 40, Social Services Grants, 38 DCR 6302 (10-1 1-9 l)(DHS) 
Chapter 41, Ticket to Work Demonstration Project for Individuals with HIV, 5 1 DCR 6629 (7-2-04) 

(DOH) 
Chapter 42, Home and Community-Based Waiver Services for Persons Who are Elderly and Individuals 

with Physical Disabilities, 50 DCK 9025 (10-24-03) (DHS) 
Chapter 43, Medicaid Breast and Cervical Cancer Treatment Program, 50 DCR 997 (1-3 1-03) (DOH) 
Chapter 44, Administration of Mental Health Grants, 40 DCR 6246 (8-27-93)(DHS) 
Chapter 45, Medicaid Reimbursement for Federally Qualified Health Centers, 49 DCR 7724 (8-9-02) 

(DOH) 
Chapter 46, Mobil Community Outreach Treatment Team Services, 46 DCR 6122 (7-23-99) (DOH) 
Chapter 47, Targeted Case Management Services for Abused and Neglected Children, 47 DCR 7084 (9-1- 

00) (DOH) 
Chapter 48, Medicaid Program: Reimbursement, 45 DCR 4141 (6-26-98) (DOH) 
Chapter 48, Medicaid Reimbursement for Inpatient Hospital Services), $$48OO. 1 & 4809.1,49 DCR 8719 

(9-20-02) (DOH) 
Chapter 48, Medicaid Reimbursement for Inpatient Hospital Services, ~~4800.12,4801.10, 4805.2, 

4805.4,4805.7, Sec. 4806.1, and 4814: Appeal of Adjustments to the Hospital Specific-Base Year 
Payment Rate, Graduate Medical Education Cost Payment Rate or Capital Cost Payment Rate for 
Hospitals Compensated on an APDRG Basis Pursuant to Subsection 4800.8,46 DCR 8271 
(10-15-99) (DOH) 

Chapter 48, Medicaid Program: Reimbursement), Sec. 4803: Adjustment for Inflation), 5 4803.2; and Sec. 
4805: Calculations of Add-ons to the Final Base Payment Rate, 4 4  4805.5, 4805.8(c), 
50 DCR 5 196 6-27-03) @OH) 

Chapter 49, Rehabilitative Services for Abused and Neglected Children, 49 DCR 247 (1-1 1-02) @OH) 
Chapter 50, Medicaid Reimbursement for Personal Care Senices); and Chapter 5 1, Medicaid 

Reimbursement for Services Provided by Home Health Aides, 50 DCR 3957 (5-23-03) (DOH) 
Chapter 50, Medicaid Reimbursement for Personal Care Services), Sec. 5009: Reimbursement), $ 5009.2, 

5 1 DCR 6643 (7-2-04) (DOH) 
Chapter 5 1, Medicaid Reimbursement for Services Provided by Home Health Aides, 50 DCR 3957 

(5-23-03) @OH) 
Chapter 52, Medicaid Reimbursement for Mental Health Rehabilitative Services, 49 DCR 4860 (5-24-02) 

(DOH) 
Chapter 52, Personnel Regulations), Sec. 5202: Recruiting and Hiring, $5202.1; Sec. 5203: Probationary 

Period, §5203.1,5203.2; Sec. 5204: Leaves, Holidays and Other Absences, $$5204.l, 5204.1(d), 
5204.2(a)(b)(c)(f), 5204.3; Sec. 5205: Compensation and ~enefits, $$5205.2(a)(b)(c), 
5205.3(c)(d), 5205.9(f), 5205.10(d), 5207: Layoff and Recall, $$5207.22(d); and Sec. 5208: 
Performance, $45208.1 - 5208.6,50 DCR 799 (1-24-03) (WASA) 

43 
a 2 6.1 



'OlSTRlCf OF COLUMBIA REGISTER MAR 4 - 2005 

DCMR Title 29lPublic Welfare Continued 

Chapter 50, Sec. 5009: Reimbursement-Personal Care Aides, $5009.1; and Chapter 51, Sec. 5109: 
Reimbursement-Home Health Aides, 45109.1, 49 DCR 8889 (9-27-02) (DOH) 

Chapter 53, $5308.5, Rate Change for Medicaid Managed Care, 43 DCR 5559 (10-1 1-96) 
(DHS) [EXPIRED] 

Chapter 53, 45308.19, Standards for Managed Care Providers that are Paid on a Fixed, Prepaid, Capitated 
Basis for Services ~ehdered to AFDC and AFDc-~klated Medicaid Recipients, EXPIRES 
10-3 1-97,44 DCR 55 17 (9-26-97)(DOI-I) 

Chapter 53, 55308.5 Regarding Medicaid Managed Care Capitated Rates , 44  DCR 5834 
(1 0- 10-97)(DOH) 

Chapter 53, Standards for Managed Care Providers That are Paid on a Fixed, Prepaid, Capitated Basis for 
Services Rendered to Medicaid Recipients, $5308.19, EXPIRES 2-20-98, 
44 DCR 6256 (10-3 1-97)(DOH) 

Chapters 53,54 & 55, Regulations for the Program Requirements for Managed Care Providers that Serve 
AFDC and AFDC-Related Medicaid Recipients, 42 DCR 1566 (3-3 1-95) @HS) 

Chapter 56 (Requirements for the D.C. Medicaid Managed Care Program for Childrenand Youth with 
Disabilities); and Chapter 57 (Enrollment and Disenrollment Requirements and Procedures for 
Beneficiaries Eligble for the D.C. Medicaid Managed Care Program for Disabled Children and 
Youths, 43 DCR 4833 (9-6-96) (DHS) 

Chapter 56, $5600.2 to Extend Period of Demonstration Project Permitting Enrollment of Severely 
Disabled Children in a Specialized Managed Care; 45 DCR 8395 (1 1-27-98 (DH) 

Chapter 56, $5600.2 to Extend Period of Demonstration Project Permitting Enrollment of Severely 
Disabled Children in a Specialized Managed Care, 46 DCR 1190 (2-12-99) (DOH) 

Chapter 57, Medical Assistance for Immigrant Chldren, 48 DCR 8971 (9-28-0 1) (DOH) 
Chapter 58, Temporary Assistance for Needy Families , EXPIRES 1-2-98,44 DCR 5994 (10-17-97)(0M) 
Chapter 58, Temporary Assistance for Needy Families ,EXPIRES 120 DAYS, 47 DCR 56 15 (7-7-00) 

(DHS) 
Chapter 58, Temporary Assistance for Needy Families, EXPIRES 120 DAYS, 47 DCR 6746 (8-18-00) 

(DHS) 
Chapter 58, Temporary Assistance for Needy Families, 58 14.2 (e), 5 1 DCR 115 19 (12-1 7-04) @HS) 
Chapter 5 8, Temporary Assistance for Needy Families, Sec. 5 8 13 : Work Participation Allowance and 

Incentive Payments to Eligble T A W  Recipients, 52 DCR 1583 (2-1 8-05) (DHS) 
Chapter 59, D.C. Tuition Assistance Grant Program, EXPIRES 120 DAYS, 47 DCR 6035 (7-28-00) 

(OPE) 
Chapter 59, Fair Hearing Procedures for the Child and Family Services Agency, 49 DCR 2440 (3-15-02) 

(CFS A) 
Chapter 60, Foster Homes, 48 DCR 6617 (7-27-01) 
Chapter 60, Foster Homes, $ 5  6003.l(m), 6008.6, 6009.5,6028.7, Sec. 6030: Re-Evaluation and License 

Renewal, 51 DCR 8609 (9-3-04) (CFSA) 
Chapter 60, Foster Homes, Sec. 6027: Temporary License for Kin, EXPIRES 120 DAYS, 5 1 DCR 33 11 

(3-26-04) (CFSA) 
Chapter 60, Foster Homes, Sec. 6027: Temporary License for Kin, EXPIRES 120 DAYS, 52 DCR 738 ( 

(1 -28-05) 
Chapter 61, Permanent Guardianship Subsidies for Kinship Caregivers, 48 DCR 10740 (1 1-23-01) 

(CFSA) 
Chapter 62, Licensing of Youth Shelters, Runaway Shelters, Emergency Care Facilities, and Youth Group 

Homes, 48 DCR 8675 (9-2 1-01) (CFSA) 
Chapter 62, Licensing of Youth Shelters, Runaway Shelters, Emergency Care Facilities, and Youth Group 

Homes, 46202.5 to Give Chapter 62 an Effective Date, 49 DCR 7191 (7-26-02) (CFSA) 
Chapter 63, Licensing of Independent Living Programs for Adolescents and Young Adults, 49 DCR 1591 

(2-22-02) (CFSA) 
Chapter 64, Medicaid Section 11 15 Health Care Reform Demonstration Project, 5 1 DCR 7435 (7-30-04) 

(DOH) 



DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA REGISTER MAR 4 - 2005 

DCMR Title 29lPublic Welfare Continued 

Chapter 66, Interim Disability Assistance, 50 DCR 4948 (6-20-03) (DHS) 
Chapter 70, D.C. Tuition Assistance Grant Program, 48 DCR 5013 (6-1-01) (TAGPO) 
Chapter 80, Domestic Partnership, 49 DCR 5419 (6-14-02) (DOH) 

DCMR Title 30lLotterv and Charitable Games (March 1997) 

Chapter 2, Lottery Licenses, Sec. 208: Instant Ticket Distribution Center Licenses; and Chapter 3, Agent 
Requirements, $5306.2, 306.3, 307.2 & 307.4, EXPIRES 120 days, 46 DCR 1023 (2-5-99) 
(DCLB) 

Chapter 2, Lottery Licenses, Sec. 208: Instant Ticket Distribution Center Licenses, 46 DCR 28 14 
(3-19-99) (DCLB) 

Chapter 3, Agent Requirements, $$306.2,306.3,307.2 & 307.4,46 DCR 2814 (3-19-99) (DCLB) 
Chapters 3, 5, 6, 8 & 9 to Provide for Lottery Game Enhancements that Will Generate Substantial 

Transfers to the General Fund, 49 DCR 1 1 124 1 (12-1 3-02) (DCLB) 
Chapter 5, Lottery Ticket 55503.4 & 503.5; and Chapter 9 (Description of On-Line Games) Secs. 915 & 

916,46 DCR 3080 (4-2-99) (DCLB) 
Chapters 5,6, 8, 9 & 99 Regarding Lottery Games, 45 DCR 1438 (3-13-98) (DCLB) 
Chapters 5 ,5  & 9 Regarding Lottery Games, EXPIRES 120 DAYS, 48 DCR 1988 (3-2-01) (DCLB) 
Chapter 5, General Provisions, 4500.1; Chapter 6, Claims and Prize Payment, 55 600.3, 60 1.1; Chapter 9 

Description of Online Games, Sec. 908: Powerball@ Grand Prize Payment, 5909.5; and Sec. 922: 
Annuitized Grand Prize Payment Conversion, EXPIRES 120 DAYS, 47 DCR 9192 (1 1-17-00) 
(DCLB) 

Chapter 5, General Provisions, 5500.1 ; Chapter 6, Claims and Prize Payments, 55600.3, 601.5 & 610.1; 
and Chapter 9, Description of On-Line Games, Sec. 908: Powerball Grand Prize Payment, 
5909.5, Sec. 913: Description of the Powerball Power Play Promotion, and Sec. 914: Powerball 
Power Play Prize Pool and Prize Payment, EXPIRES 120 DAYS, 48 DCR 805 3 (8-24-0 1) 
(DCLB) 

Chapters 5, 6, 9 & 99 to Avoid Substantial Loss of Essential Funds to the District, EXPIRES 120 DAYS, 
48 DCR 10768 (1 1-23-01) (DCLB) 

Chapter 5 (General Provisions), $500.1; Chapter 6 (Claims and Prize Payments), $$600.3, 601.5 & 610.1; 
and Chapter 9 (Description of Online Games), Sec, 908: Powerball @ Grand Prize Payment, 
49 DCR 872 (2-1-02) (DCLB) 

Chapter 5, Lottery Ticket, 5503.4; Chapter 9, Description of On-line Games, Sec. 925: Description of 
Keno, Sec. 926: Keno Prize and Prize Structure, Sec. 927: Keno Validation and Prize Claims; and 
Chapter 99, Definitions, 59900.1, 50 DCR 1520 (2-14-03) (DCLB) 

Chapter 5, General Provisions, Sec. 500: Lottery Ticket, 5 500.6,50 DCR 8816 (10-17-03) (DCLB) 
Chapter 6, Claims and Prize Payments, 5 605.1 @) & (0; and Chapter 9, Description of On-line Games, 

Secs. 940 through 944; and Chapter 99 (Definitions), 5 9900.1,5 1 DCR 2400 (3-5-04) (DCLB) 
Chapter 6, Secs. 606.3; and Chapter 9, $5906.1, 907.1,907.2,907.5, 908,909.1,909.5, 9 10.1 Regarding 

the Powerball Game ,44  DCR 6248 (10-3 1-97)(DCLB) 
Chapter 6, Claims and Prize Payments, $606.3; and Chapter 9 (Description of Online Games), 55906.1, 

907.6, 908.1, 909.1, 910.1, 913.3, 913.4, 914.1, 914.2, 914.3 & 914.4, EXPIRES 120 DAYS, 
49 DCR 9503 (10-1 8-02) (DCLB) 

Chapter 6 & 9, Claims and Prize Payments, 5606.3; Description of On-Line Games, 55906.1,907.1, 
907.2 & 907.5, Sec. 908: Grand Prize Payment, 55909.1 & 909.5, 910.1,44 DCR 6248 
(10-3 1-97) (DCLB) 

Chapter 6, Claims and Prize Payments, 5606.3; and Chapter 9 (Description of Online Games), 4 5906.1, 
907.6,908.1, 909.1, 910.1,913.3, 913.4,914.1, 91.4.2, 914.3 & 914.4, 50 DCR 1526 (2-14-03) 
@ C W  



DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA REGISTER MAR 4 - 2005 

DCMR Title 30Lotterv and Charitable Games Continued 

Chapter 6, Claims and Prize Payments), Sec. 6 1 1 : Discharge of Liability Upon Payment, 9 6 1 1.1, ~ e c .  
6 12: Deleted, Sec. 6 14: Release of information About Winners, 4 4  6 14.1, 614.3. 6 14.4, 6 14.5 & 
614.6,50 DCR 8816 (10-17-03) (DCLB) 

Chapter 6, Sec. 612: Withholding From Prize Payments, $612.2,45 DCR 6887 (9-25-98) (DCLB) 
Chapter 8, On-Line Lottery Games, Sec. 802: Drawings, $802.2 to Use Various Methods to Draw Winning 

Numbers, 48 DCR 104.5 1 (1 1 - 16-0 1) (DCLB) 
Chapter 9, $$906.1, 907.1,907.2, 907.5, 908, 909.1, 909.5, 910.1 Regarding the Powerball Game, 

44 DCR 6248 (10-3 ~ - ~ ~ ) ( D C L B )  
Chapter 9, Description of On-Line Games, Sec. 925: Description of Keno, Sec. 926: Keno Prize and Prize 
Structure, Sec. 927: Keno Validation and Prize Claims; and Chapter 99, Definitions, 59900.1, 50 DCR 
1520 (2-14-03) (DCLB) 
Chapter 9, Description of On-Line Games, 5 925.3; and Sec. 926: Keno Prizes and Prize Structure; and 

Chapter 99, Definitions, 50 DCR 10135 (1 1-28-03) (DCLB) 
Chapter 9, Description of On-Line Games, $6 925.4 (a)@), 926.4(a)@)(c), Sec. 928: Description of Keno 

Spin, Sec. 929: Keno Spin Prize Chart, 5 1 DCR 9993 (10-29-04) (DCLB) 
Chapter 9, Description of On-Line Games, $932.1 Governing the Cash 4 Life On-Line Lottery Game, 

EXPIRED, 45 DCR 1856 (3-27-98) (DCLB) 
Chapter 9, Description of On-Line Games, $932.1 (c) Governing the Cash 4 Life On-Line Lottery Game, 

46 DCR 604 (1-22-99) (DCLB) 
Chapter 9, Description of On-line Games, Secs. 940 through 944,51 DC 2400 (3-5-04) (DCLB) 
Chapter 10, Other Games, $§ 1000.4, 1000.5 & 1000.9,49 DCR 4098 (5-3-02) (DCLB) 
Chapter 10, Sec. 1000: Sweepstakes, Bonus and Promotional Games, 52000.8,44 DCR 7684 (12-19-97) 

(DCLB) 
Chapter 10, ERRATA NOTICE, Sec. 1000: Sweepstakes, Bonus and Promotional Games, 9 1000.8, 

47 DCR 240 (1-16-98) 
Chapter 10, Other Games), Sec. 1000: Sweepstakes, Bonus and Promotional Games, 9 1000.9, 

50 DCR 88 16 (10-17-03) (DCLB) 
Chapter 12, Bingo, Raffles, Monte Carlo Night Party and Suppliers' Licenses, by Deleting $1210.2, 

5 1 DCR 1684 (2-13-04) (DBLB) 
Chapter 15, Raffle Prizes, 5 1504.1,46 DCR 7848 (10-1-99) (DCLB) 

DCMR Title 31lTaxicabs & Public Vehicles for Hire (April 2004) 

Chapter 6, Taxicab Parts and Equipment, Sec. 601: Parts and Equipment, 52 DCR 13 19 (2-1 1-05) DCTC 



DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA REGISTER 

LIST OF AGENCY ABBREVIATIONS 

MAR 4 - 2005 

AB 
ABC 
ACAED 
ARB 
BA 
BE 
BER 
BOEE 
BON 
BORAV 
BRPAA 
BWC 
C 
CAB . 
CCRB 
CFPR 
CFSA 
CHR 
C JDT 
CSTALJ 
CME 
CPO 
CTO 
DAS 
DCAC 
DCEO 
DCLB 
DCOP 
DCPS 
DCRA 
DCRB 
DCSL 
DES 
DFR 
DGH 
DHCD 
DHS 
DM# 
DHRMB 
DMH 
DOES 
DOH 

Anatomical Board 
Alcoholic Beverage Control Board 
Assistant City Administrator for Economic Development 
Armory Board 
Board of Accountancy 
Board of Education 
Board of Equalization & Review 
Board of Elections & Ethics 
Board of Nursing 
Board of Review for Anti-Deficience Violations 
Board of Real Property Assessments & Appeals 
Boxing and Wrestling Commission 
Dept. of Corrections 
Contract Appeals Board 
Civilian Complaint Review Board 
Committee on Family Placement Regulations 
Child and Family Services Agency 
Commission on Human Rights 
Commission on Judicial Disabilities and Tenure 
Commission on Selection and Tenure of Administrative Law Judges 
Chief Medical Examiner 
Chief Procurement Officer 
Chief Technology Officer 
Dept. of Administrative Services 
D.C. Apprenticeship Council 
D.C. Energy Office 
D.C. Lottery & Charitable Games Board 
D.C. Office of Personnel 
D.C. Public Schools 
Dept. of Consumer & Regulatory Affairs 
D.C. Retirement Board 
D.C. School of Law 
Dept . of Environmental Services 
Dept. of Finance & Revenue 
D.C. General Hospital 
Dept. of Housing & Community Development 
Dept. of Human Services 
Deputy Mayor for Financial Management 
Dept. of Human Rights and Minority Business 
Dept. of Mental Health 
Dept. of Employment Services 
Dept. of Health 

DOMH Dept. of ~ i n t a l  Health 
DOMV Dept. of Motor Vehicles 
DOPR Dept. of Parks and Recreation 
DOT Dept. of Transportation 
DOR Dept. of Recreation 
DORP Dept. of Recreation and Parks 
DPAH Dept. of Public & Assisted Housing 
DPCRB Drug Prevention & Children at Risk Board 
DPW Dept. of Public Works 



DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA REGISTER MAR 4 - 2005 

LIST OF AGENCY ABBREVIATIONS Continued 

DUCB Unemployment Compensation Board 
EEFSC Escheated Estates Fund Application Screening Committee 
ELC Education Licensure Commission 
ETB Emergency Transition Board of Trustees 
FRMAS Financial Responsibility and Management Assistance Authority 
FEMS Fire and Emergency Medical Services 
GMD Grants Management and Development 
GS AB Gas Station Advisory Board 
HA Housing Authority 
HHPBC Health and Hospitals Public Benefit Corporation 
HRLBD Human Rights and Local Business Development 
HPRB Historic Preservation Review Board 
LA Insurance Administration 
ISB Insurance, Securities and Banking 
ISR Insurance and Securities Regulation 
MBOC Minority Business Opportunity Commission 
MPD Metropolitan Police Department 
MY10 Mayor's Youth Initiative Office 
OAH Office of Administrative Hearings 
OBED Office of Business & Economic Development 
OBFI Office of Banlung & Financial Institutions 
OCC Office of Corporation Counsel 
OCP Office of Contracting and Procurement 
OCT Office of Cable Television 
ODAI Office of Documents & Administrative Issuances 
OEA Office of Employee Appeals 
OHR Office of Human Rights 
OGMD Office of Grants Management and Development 
OM Office of the Mayor 
OP Office of Planning 
OPE Office of Policy and Evaluation 
OPR Office of Public Records 
OTR Office of Tax and Revenue 
AR Board of Parole 
PERB Public Employee Relations Board 
PL Public Library 
PSC Public Service Commission 
REC Real Estate Commission 
RHC Rental Housing Commission 
SC Sports Commission 
SEC Sports and Entertainment Commission 
SEO State Education Office 
TAGPO Tuition Assistance Grant Program, D.C. 
TC Taxicab Commission 
UCB Unemployment Compensation Board 
UDC University of the District of Columbia 
USPC US Parole Commission 
WASA D.C. Water and Sewer Authority 



ol~iRl0 OF COLUMBIA REGISTER 

LIST OF AGENCY ABBREVIATIONS Continued 

WCC Washington Convention Center 
WIB Wage Hour Board 
WSA Water and Sewer Authority 
ZC Zoning Commission 

MAR 4 - 2005 



BOARD OF ELECTIONS AND ETHICS 
CERTIFICATION OF ANCISMD VACANCIES 

The District of Columbia Board of Elections and Ethics hereby gives notice that there 
are vacancies in twelve (12) Advisory Neighborhood Commission offices, certified 
pursuant to D.C. Official Code § 1-309+06(d)(2); 2001 Ed. 

VACANT: 4A05 

Petition Circulation Period: Monday, February 28,2005 thru Monday, March 21,2005 
Petition Challenge Period: ~ h u r s d a ~ ,  o arch-24,2005 thru ~ e d n e s d a ~ ,  March 30,2005 

VACANT: I A I  I 

Petition Circulation Period: Tuesday, February 22,2005 thru Monday, March 14,2005 
Petition Challenge Period: Thursday, March 17,2005 thru Wednesday, March 23,2005 

VACANT: 3D07 
4005 
5B05, X I 1  
6Bl I 
8B03,8C05,8C06,8E01,8E06 

Petition Circulation Period: Tuesday, February 15,2005 thru Monday, March 7,2005 
Petition Challenge Period: Thursday, March 10,2005 thru Wednesday, March 16,2005 

Candidates seeking the Ofice of Advisory ,Neighborhood Commissioner, or their 
representatives, may pick up nominating petitions at the following location: 

D.C. Board of Elections and Ethics 
441 - 4" Street, NW, Room 250N 

For more information, the public may call 727-2525. 



DImIcT OF COLUMBIA REGISTER 
MAR 4 - 2005 

GOVERNMENT OF THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA 
Department of Health 

ST0 Control Program 

NOTICE OF FUNDS AVAILABILITY 

DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA 
DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH 

PRIMARY CARE & PREVENTION ADMINISTRATION 
BUREAU OF COMMUNICABLE DISEASE 

SEXUALLY TRANSMllTED DISEASE CONTROL PROGRAM 

Sexually Transmitted Disease (STD) Clinical Services Grant 

The District of Columbia Department of Health, Sexually Transmitted Disease 
Control (STDC) Program is soliciting applications from qualified applicants to 
provide STD patient services during off duty hours, specifically evenings and 
weekends. The STDC is making available $1 30,000.00 to fund two or three 
organizations proposing programs that include screening, diagnosis and 
treatment, patient education, and when appropriate, referral services. 

The target population forthis program is residents of the District of Columbia, 
particularly those disproportionately affected by STDs, including African 
Americans, Latinos, men who have sex with men (MSM), women of childbearing 
age, and persons between 24-45 years of age. 

The Request for Application (RFA) will be released on March 4, 2005. The 
deadline for submission is April 4, 2005, at 5:00 p.m. The RFA can be obtained 
from 71 7 iffth Street, N.W., Suite 950, Washington, DC 20005. The RFA can be 
downloaded from the Executive Office of The Mayor, Office of Partnerships and 
Grants Development website at http://opqd.dc.~~ov/o~ad/site/default.as~ under 
District Grants Clearinghouse no later than March 7, 2005. For additional 
information, please contact, Paulette Jackson, of DSTD at (202) 727-9862. 



DISTFNX OF COLCSMBIA REGISTER MAR 4 - 2005 

RLA REVITALIZATION CORPORATION 

NOTICE REGARDING SELECTION OF DEVELOPER FOR PARCEL 34 

The RLA Revitalization Corporation(RLARC), an instrumentality of 
the District of Columbia, hereby provides notice of its selection 
of Gateway 34, LLC to redevelop Parcel 34 located on the west 
side of 14" Street between Belmont Street and Florida Avenue, 
Northwest. On or. about June 1, 2004, the RLARC issued a Request 
for Proposals(RFP) for the redevelopment of Parcel 34. On or 
about September 10, 2004, four proposals were received in 
response to the RFP. On December 15, 2004, the RLARC Board of 
Directors short listed four developers: City View, LLC; Gateway 
34, LLC; PN Hoffman, Inc. and Triangle Ventures - Parcel 34, LLC. 
On January 26, 2005, each of the short listed -developers 
participated in a public presentation held by the RLARC Board for 
purposes of presenting their proposals to the Board and the 
public, and responding to questions relating to the proposals. 
The RLARC staff participated in "best and final" discussions with 
each of .the short listed developers regarding certain aspects of 
their proposals. 

On February 14, 2005, each of the short listed developers 
submitted best and final offers and the RLARC requested that the 
short listed developers commit to'the terms of their best and 
final offers by agreeing to execute a Memorandum of Understanding 
(MOU) . The staff of RLARC provided to the Board a de,tailed 
confidential analysis of the compara.tive strengths and weaknesses 
of each of the submitted proposals based on the evaluation 
criteria set forth in the RFP (incorporating comments received by 
the staff from highly skilled consultants, the Office of Planning 
and ANC representatives). The RLARC Board reviewed all of the 
analysis. 

On or about February 23, 2005, the RLARC Board, after careful 
deliberation and consultation with the senior management team and 
the real estate develppment team selected the proposal submitted 
by Gateway 34, LLC as the preferred proposal for the 
redevelopment of the Parcel 34 site. The RLARC staff' notified 
all of the short listed bidders of the Board's selection by 
overnight mail. 

For more information, please contact: 

RLA Revitalization Corporation 
1801 K Street, N.W., Suite 1210 
Washington, D.C. 20006 
Attn: Matt Morrin 
Tel: (202) 530-5750 



DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA REGISTER MAR 4 - 2005 

RLA REVITALIZATION CORPORATION 

NOTICE REGARDING SELECTION OF DEVELOPER FOR WAX MUSEUM SITE 

The RLA Revitalization Corporation (REAKC), an independent 
instrumentality of the District of Columbia, hereby provides 
notice of its selection of The Lowe Team to redevelop the Wax 
Museum site. On July 7, 2003, the RLARC issued a Request for 
Proposals (RFP) regarding the redevelopment of the Wax Museum 
site. On or about August 6, 2003, six proposals were received in 
response to Step One of this RFP. On September 3, 2003, the 
RLARC Board of Directors short listed three developers: The Lowe 
Team; Mount Vernon Park Partners and Market Commons Associates. 
On November 3, 2003, the three short listed developers provided 
to the RLARC their respective development submissions requested 
by the RLARC in accordance with Step Two of the RFP. On December 
3, 2003, each of the short listed developers participated in a 
public presentation held by the RLARC Board for purposes of 
presenting their proposals to the Board and thec public, and 
responding to questions relating to the proposals. The RLARC 
staff participated in "best and final" discussions with each of 
the short listed developers regarding certain aspects of their 
proposals. 

On February 13, 2004, each of the short listed developers 
submitted best and final offers and the RLARC requested that the 
short listed developers commit to the terms of their best and 
final offers by agreeing to execute a Memorandum of Understanding 
(MOU) . The staff of RLARC provided to the Board a detailed 
confidential analysis of the comparative strengths and weaknesses 
of each of the submitted proposals based on the evaluation 
criteria set forth in the RFP (incorpcrating comments received by 
the staff from highly skilled consultants, the Office of 
Planning, and ANC representatives). The RLARC Board. reviewed all 
of the analysis. 

On or about February 25, 2004, the RLARC Board, after careful 
deliberation and consultation with the senior management team and 
the real estate development team selected the proposal submitted 
by The Lowe Team as the preferred proposal for the redevelopment 
of the Wax Museum site. The RLARC staff notified, by certified 
mail, all of the short-listed bidders of the Board's selection. 

For more information, please contact: 

RLA Revitalization Corporation 
1801 K Street, N.W., Suite 1210 
Washington, D.C. 20006 
Attn: Michael L. Hentrel, Esq. 
Tel: (202) 530-5750 



MAR 4 - 2005 

ZONING COMMISSION NOTICE OF FILING 
Case No. 05-07 

M a p  Amendment - Square 5684, Lots 24 and 25) 
February 23,2005 

THIS CASE IS OF INTEREST TO ANC 7B 

On February 11, 2005, the Office of Zoning received an application from Joseph 
Washington (the "applicant") for approval of a map amendment for the above-referenced 
property. 

The property that is the subject of this application consists of Square 5684, Lots 24 and 
25 in southeast Washington, D.C. (Ward 7). The property is currently zoned R-1-B. 
The applicant seeks a map amendment from R-1-I3 to C- 1. 

For additional information, please contact, the Secretary to the Zoning Commission at 
(202) 727-63 1 1. 



DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA REGISTER MAR 4 . 2005 

OFFICE OF DOCUMENTS AND ADMINISTRATIVE ISSUANCES 
PUBLICATIONS PRICE LIST 

DISTRICT OF  COLUMBIA MUNICIPAL, REGULATION'S (DCMR) 

TITLE SUBJECT PRICE 

. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  1 DCMR MAYOR AN'D EXECUTIVE AGENCIES (JUNE 200 1) $16.00 
3 DCMR ELECTIONS & ETHICS (JUNE 1998) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  $20.00 
4 DCMR HUMAN RIGHTS (MARCH 1995) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  $13.00 
5 DCMR BOARD OF EDUCATION (DECEMBER 2002) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  $26.00 
6A DCMR POLICE PERSONNEL (MAY 1988) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  $8.00 

_ 7 DCMR EMPLOYMENT BENEFITS (JANUARY 1986) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  $8.00 
8 DCMR UNIVERSITY OF THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA (JUNE 1988) . . . . . . . . . . . . .  $8.00 
9 DCMR TAXATION & ASSESSMENTS (AP lUL 1998) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  $20.00 
10 DCMR DISTRICT'S COMPREHENSIVE PLAN (PART 1, FEBRUARY 1999) . . . . . . . .  $33.00 
LO DCMR PLANNING & DEVELOPMENT ( P m T  2, MARCH 1994) 

w/ 1.996 SUPPLEMENT* . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  $26.00 
1 1 DCMR ZONING (FEBRUARY 2003) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  $35 . 00 
12 DCMR CONSTRUCTION CODES SUPPLEMENT (2003) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  $25.00 
13B DCMR BOILER & PRESSURE VESSEL CODE (MAY 1984) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  $7.00 
14 DCMR HOUSING (JULY 1991) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  $20.00 
15 DCMR PUBLIC UTILITIES & CABLE TELEVISION (JUNE 1998) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  $20.00 
16 DCMR CONSUMERS, COMMERCIAL PRACTICES & CIVIL INFRACTIONS 

(JULY 1998) WJDECEMBER 1998 SUPPLEMENT . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  $20.00 
17 DCMR BUSINESS, OCCUPATIONS & PROFESSIONS (MAY 1990) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  $26.00 
18 DCMR VEHICLES & TRAFFIC (APRIL 1995) ~ 1 1 9 9 7  SUPPLEMENT* . . . . . . . . . . . . .  $26.00 
19 DCMR AMUSEMENTS, PARKS & RECREATION (JUNE 2001) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  $26.00 
20 DCMR ENVIRONMENT - CHAPTERS 1-39 (FEBRUmY 1997) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  $20.00 
20 DCMR ENVIRONMENT - CHAPTERS 40-70 (FEBRUhRY 1997) . . . . . . : . . . . . . . . . .  $26.00 
2 1 DCMR WATER & SANITATION (FEBRUAKY 1998) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  $20.00 
22 DCMR PUBLIC HEALTH & MEDICINE (AUGUST 1986) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  $26.00 
22 DCMR HEALTH CARE & COMMUNITY RESIDENCE FACILITIES 

SUPPLEMENT (AUGUST 1986 - FEBRUARY 1995) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  $13.00 
23 DCMR ALCOHOLIC BEVERAGES (AUGUST 2004) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  $10.00 
24 DCMR PUBLIC SPACE & SAFETY (DECEMBER 1996) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  $20.00 
25 DCMR FOOD AND FOOD OPERATIONS (AUGUST 2003) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  $20.00 
26 DCMR LNSURANCE (FEBRUARY 1985) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  $9.00 
27 DCMR CONTRACTS AND PROCUREMENT (JULY 1988) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  $22.00 
28 DCMR CORRECTIONS, COURTS & CRIMINAL JUSTICE (AUGUST 2004) . . . . . . . .  $10.00 
29 DCMR PUBLIC WELFARE (MAY 1987) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  $8.00 
30 DCMR LOTTERY AND CHARITABLE GAMES (MARCI-I 1997) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  $20.00 
3 1 DCMR TAXICABS & PUBLIC VEHICLES FOR HRE (JULY 2004) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .  $1 6.00 


